transcript of testimony.	
Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 8925
98272 Discussed	
and an agricultural state of the state of th	
with lawclerk ans assigned	
task	
Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	0005
98285 Correspondence with Percy	28.00 8925
regarding deposit of Ascension	
funds into 19th IDC Registry.	
Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	28.00 8925
98286 Reviewed and revised Reply to	26.00 0727
Opposition for Request for	
Written Reasons.	
Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00	56.00 8925
98287 Legal research regarding	
Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	20.00 8025
98289 Prepared letter to First	28.00 8925
Circuit regarding Opposition.	
Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 8925
98292 Discussed legal issues with	14.00
lawclerk	
HH 0 20 Hrs V 140 00	
Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00	42.00 8925
98294 Review of Kenneth Welborn's	
depositions. Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00	225.00 0025
98376 Review of email concerning the	225.00 8925
Ascension Sheriff's claim;	
review of issue of transfer of	
funda to 10th IDC	
Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	75.00 8925
98563 Review of Jerry Jones	
deposition transcript	D 490
Dec 17/2013 Expense Recovery Bankston & A	ssociates, L.L.C. Page: 480
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & A Client Ledger	
Nov/ 1/2010 To M	[ay/ 1/2014 Bld Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To Chq#	General Bld Trust Activity
	Dishs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Dishs
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
Balance	
ogga Postage - Letter to Court of X1739	0.46 8925
98/43 Postage - Letter to Court of	
Appeals, First Circuit	
Dec 17/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 98887 Assigned task to lawclerk	14.00 8925
9000/ Assigned task to lawolong	

Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 98309 Correspondence from Blanchfield's office regarding Hugh Martin's deposition.	28.00 8925
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 98315 Review of Ben Babin's deposition	140.00 8925
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 98318 Review of Terry Louque's deposition	140.00 8925
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 98320 Review of Russell Cornette's deposition	70.00 8925
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 6.50 Hrs X 60.00 98322 Draft opposition to plaintiffs' motion for partial summary judgment on issue of credit	390.00 8925
owed by LA DOTD to ARBD. Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 5.75 Hrs X 60.00 98342 Draft opposition to plaintiffs' motion for partial summary	345.00 8925
judgment. Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 98374 Review of deposition notes of Russell Cornette	37.50 8925
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 98375 Review of draft response to request for written reasons	75.00 8925
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 98565 Review of post hearing memo on Jay Harris	112.50 8925
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 98888 Correspondence from Grodner regarding supplementing writ exhibits.	28.00 8925
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 98889 Correspondence from Grodner regarding Assessors' MSJ's.	28.00 8925
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associated Client Ledger	ciates, L.L.C. Page: 481
Date Received From/Paid To Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ Chq#	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Repts Balance	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
98890 Review of William Jenkins'	28.00 8925
deposition.	

Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 2.50 Hrs X 6 98921 Draft opposition to plaintiffs' motion for partial summary judgment.	50.00	150.00 8925	
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs X (98922 Draft reply to plaintiffs' opposition to request for written reasons for judgment.	50.00	180.00 8925	
Dec 18/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 2.50 Hrs X (98923 Research	50.00	150.00 8925	
Dec 19/2013 Baton Rouge Court Reporte 98324 Deposition Costs - Invoice No 31376 - Jerry Thibeau	. 8028	156.60 8925	
Dec 19/2013 Baton Rouge Court Reporte 98325 Deposition Costs - Invoice No 31516 - Willie George Lee	ers . 8028	244.30 8925	
Dec 19/2013 Baton Rouge Court Reports 98326 Deposition Costs - Invoice No 31514 - Jerry Jones	ers . 8028	202.30 8925	
Dec 19/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1 98350 Phone call from Brian Wilson regarding settlement notice to	40.00	14.00 8925	
taxpayers. Dec 19/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 1 98372 Email requesting dates for Martin deposition; calendar		30.00 8925	
Dec 19/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 1 98373 Review of email	50.00	37.50 8925	
discuss with associate Dec 19/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 1 98378 Review of letter to 1st Circuit Dec 19/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 1		15.00 8925	
98379 Telephone call from Brian Wilson concerning fairness hearing	50.00	45.00 8925	
Dec 19/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 1 98891 Correspondence with Eckert	40.00	28.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 4.50 Hrs X 98397 Draft opposition to plaintiffs' motion for partial summary		270.00 8925	
judgment on issue that LA DOTI owed certain money for credit in reduction in non-Federal		esistes I.I.C	Page: 482
Jun/11/2014	Bankston & Asso Client Ledger		
Date Received From/Paid To	// 1/2010 To May Chq#	- General Bld -	Trust Activity
	Rec# Repts	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc	Repts Disbs

share to ARBC.		
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 98403 Receipt and review of deposition notice for Hugh Martin.	14.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 98408 Reviewed John Brass' deposition	56.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 98410 Review of Jerry Thibeau's deposition.	42.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 98411 Review of Willie George Lee's deposition.	42.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.80 Hrs X 140.00 98412 Review of Tony Rouchon's Deposition.	112.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs X 140.00 98413 Review of Jerry Jones' deposition.	154.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 98425 Email to commissioners	42.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 98428 Receipt and review of Grodner's Notice of Intent to Seek Stay from LA Supreme Court.	14.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 98429 Discussed legal issues with LSB	42.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 98453 Receipt and review of notice of deposition	30.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 98454 Review of Livingston news article	30.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 98456 Email from Bill Eckert on	15.00 8925	
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 98458 Telephone call to Jenna; telephone call to Dietmar;	150.00 8925	
telephone call to Don Thompson; review of First Circuit decision		
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associated Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May		Page: 483

Date Received From/Paid To Ch	q# General Bld Trust Activi
Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance	Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
98555 Review of writ response	75.00 8925
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 98556 Review of email from Livingston Sheriff	30.00 8925
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 98892 Correspondence with Eckert	28.00 8925
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 98893 Receipt and review of First Circuit ruling.	56.00 8925
Dec 20/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 150.00 98901 Review of legal issues with associate	45.00 8925
Dec 23/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 3.20 Hrs X 60.00 98435 Draft opposition to plaintiffs motion for partial summary judgment on issue that LA DOTD owed ARBC refund for reduction in non-Federal share.	192.00 8925
Dec 23/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 98438 Email to Grodner regarding supplementing exhibits for writ application.	14.00 8925
Dec 23/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 98439 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Dec 23/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	28.00 8925
98448 Correspondence from Eckert	14.00 8925
Dec 23/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 98902 Meeting with associate	30.00 8925
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 1.00 Hrs X 60.00 98474 Review plaintiffs' exhibits filed with multiple motions	60.00 8925
for partial summary judgment. Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 2.50 Hrs X 60.00 98475 Review deposition of Jerry Jones for analysis	150.00 8925
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 98501 Assigned task to lawclerk	14.00 8925
98501 Assigned task to lawclerk Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	

C	Bankston & Ass Client Ledger					Page: 484
	/ 1/2010 To May Chq#	/ 1/2014 - General	1	Bld	Т	rust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To						
Entry # Explanation Re Balance	ec# Repts				Rcpts	Disbs
application, supplement exhibits.						
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 14 98515 Prepared letter to sheriffs regarding first circuit ruling.	0.00	84	.00 892	25		
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14 98517 Review	0.00		28.00	8925		
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 15 98557 Work on revisions to motion for partial summary judgment of	50.00 r		450.00	8925		
DOTD funds Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 15 98558 Email from Livingston Sheriff; review with associate; assign tasks to associate and law	50.00		225.00	8925		
clerk Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 15 98621 Email from Grodner concerning appeal to Supreme Court; email from Chris Whittington			37.50	8925		
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14 98894 Correspondence with Eckert	0.00		28.00	8925		
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14/ 98895 Discussed legal issues with LSE			28.00	8925		
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140 98896 Correspondence from Gould regarding First Circuit order.	0.00		14.00	8925		
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140 98897 Correspondence from Grodner regarding stay.	0.00		28.00	8925		
Dec 26/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 15 98903 Review of legal issues with associate	0.00	3	30.00 8	925		
Dec 29/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150 98622 Receipt and review of plaintiff's writ application submittal documents	0.00	60	.00 892	25		
Dec 29/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150 98624 Receipt and review of jury	0.00	3	7.50 8	925		

bond; e-mail to Eckert; e-mail to associate Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 4.00 Hrs X 98577 Draft opposition to plaintiffs	60.00			240.00	8925		
motion for partial summary							
Jun/11/2014		ton & Asso	ciates, L	.L.C.			Page: 485
	Client I v/ 1/201	0 To May/	1/2014				
Date Received From/Paid To					Bld -	Tı	rust Activity
Entry # Explanation F Balance					Inv# Acc		Disbs
judgment on issue of termination of Cooperative Endeavor Agreement.							
Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 4.00 Hrs X 6	60.00						
98578 Draft opposition to plaintiffs motion for partial summary judgment on issue of PCA.				240.00	8925		
Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1- 98582 Receipt and review of Donna's motion to supplement writ.	3			14.00	8925		
Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1- 98584 Correspondence from Eckert	40.00			14.00	8925		
Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 98606 Correspondence from Grodner regarding February hearings.				14.00	8925		
Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 98612 Receipt and review of Sheriff Wiley's responses to Maldonado's discovery requests.	40.00			14.00	8925		
Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14 98614 Email to Eckert				28.00	8925		
98615 Prepared letter to Eddington	40.00			28.00	8925		
Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 98616 Correspondence to LSB	10.00			14.0	0 8925		
Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 15 98627 Email from plaintiff attorney regarding February 10th	50.00			15.00	8925		
hearing date Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 15 98628 Email email to Dietmar				30.00	8925		
Dec 30/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14 98898 Correspondence from Whittingt regarding stay.				28.00	8925		

	Jan 2/2014 Expense Recovery 98753 Photocopies - 244 BW @ \$0.	10	X1740	24.40	8925		
	each Jan 2/2014 Expense Recovery						
	98754 Photocopies - 2 color copies (\$0.15 each		X1740	0.30	8925		
	Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 98777 Correspondence with Eckert	10.00		14.	00 8925		
	Jun/11/2014	Ranks	ton & Assoc	iates, L.L.C.			Page: 486
		Client	Ledger				1 age. 400
			10 To May/			_	
	Date Received From/Paid To	Ch	q# (General	Bld	Tru	st Activity
	Entry # Explanation Falance	Rec#	Repts	Disbs F	ees Inv# Acc	Rcpts	Disbs
	Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 98783 Correspondence from Maldona				14.00 8925		
	Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14	0.00					
	98795 Discussed legal issues with LS			14	.00 8925		
	Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140	0.00					
	98796 Legal research regarding			56.0	0 8925		
	Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140	0.00		14.00	0025		
	98797 Phone call to Clerk of Court regarding jury bond.			14.00	8925		
	Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140			1.4	00 8025		
	98800 Receipt and review of EBRSO' discovery responses.	S		14	.00 8925		
J	Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140 98806 Discussed legal issues with LSI			14.	00 8925		
	98806 Discussed legal issues with LSI			14.	00 8923		
J	an 2/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X 140	.00					
I	98807 Revised First Circuit Brief. an 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150	00		126.00	8925		
	99125 Information to Toni			37.50	9139		
J	an 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150	00					
	99131 Email from Wayne Maldonado	.00		75	5.00 9139		
	s; email ; assign task to						
	associate						
Ja	an 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150 99133 Email to Eckert regarding	.00		30.00	9139		
				30.00	,10,		
Ja	an 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.	.00					

99135 Review of Ascension Parish	1		60	0.00 9139		
class members Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 99136 Review of letter to Brian Eddington; forward to Brian	150.00		30.0	0 9139		
Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 99137 Telephone call to Charlie Reagin regarding jury bond posting	150.00		37.5	50 9139		
Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 99140 Receipt and review of disco responses from East Baton Rot regarding list of class members	overy uge		3	37.50 9139		
Jun/11/2014	Banks Client	ston & Assoc Ledger 10 To May/	ciates, L.L.C.			Page: 487
Date Received From/Paid To	Ch	iq#	General	Bld		Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Balance	Rec#	Repts	Disbs I	Fees Inv# Acc	Rcpts	Disbs
Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.20 Hrs X 99141 Revise writ application on Ja Harris issue			180	0.00 9139		
Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 99142 Review of December 2, 201 hearing transcript; email to Brian Eddington	150.00		11	2.50 9139		
Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 99144 Meeting with associate and clerk; assign task	150.00		112	.50 9139		
Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 99145 Email from Maldonado; res	150.00 pond			30.00 9139		
Jan 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.75 Hrs X 99150 Review of deposition of Joh Brass, Jenkins, Cornette,	150.00 n		412	2.50 9139		
Thibeau, Lee and Rouchon Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 4.00 Hrs X 98809 Draft opposition to plaintiffs motion for partial summary	60.00		240.0	00 8925		
judgment that CEA terminated prior to adoption of First Amended CEA.						
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 4.00 Hrs X 98810 Draft opposition to plaintiffs motion for partial summary judgment that PCA terminated			240.0	00 8925		
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.75 Hrs X 98826 Draft opposition to plaintiffs motion for partial summary judgment on issue that CEA w	60.00		165.0	00 8925		

terminated.							
Ion 3/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.75 Hr	rs X 60.00			165.00	8925		
98827 Draft opposition to plan	111115			103.00	3723		
motion for partial summar	y						
judgment that PCA was							
terminated.	c X 140 00						
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs	ISB			14.00	8925		
98834 Discussed legal issues w	LOD						
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hr	s X 140.00			28.00	8925		
98839 Discussed legal issues w	vith LSB			28.00	6923		
	- V 140 00						
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hr.	S X 140.00			14.00	8925		
98841 Phone call to Wright &	Percy						
regarding jury bond. Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hr.	s X 140.00						D 400
Jun/11/2014 Lawyer: 3112 0.20 111	Banks	ston & Ass	ociates, L.L	.C.			Page: 488
July 11/2011	Client	Ledger					
	Nov/ 1/20	10 To May	/ 1/2014	Lo	DIA	т Т	rust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Cł	nq#	- General		Bid -		rust richt rich
	11 4		Diaha	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
Entry # Explanation	Rec#	Repts	Disos	rees	mvn rec	Trop to	
Balance							
98842 Preparation of Jury Bon	d.			28.00	8925		
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hr	s X 140.00						
98844 Review of First Circuit	Rules.			14.00	8925		
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hr	s X 140.00			106.00	9025		
98845 Review of discovery reg	garding			126.00	8925		
witnesses and experts.	77 1 40 00						
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hr	s X 140.00		14	.00 892	25		
98849 Letter to First Circuit			17	.00			
regarding Opposition. Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hr	s X 140.00						
98862 Discussed legal issues v	with LSB			14.00	8925		
98802 Discussed legal issues							
	14 5						
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hr	s X 140.00			56.00	8925		
98863 Prepared Judgment rega	arding			56.00	8923		
ARBC's partial summary							
judgments and Plaintiff's							
Motion in Limine regarding	ng						
Legislative Auditor Report Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hi	rs X 140 00						
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hi 98866 Discussed legal issues v	with LSB			28.00	8925		
98800 Discussed legal issues							
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hi	s X 140.00				0005		
98867 Email to Brian Eddingt	on			14.00	8925		
regarding meeting.							
Ian 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 H	rs X 150.00			375.00	9139		
99151 Review of deposition of	f			3/3.00	7137		
Welborn, Babin, Hoover a	ind						

Thomas						
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.	.00					
99153 Final review of writ opposition			60.00	9139		
regarding Jay Harris	00					
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150. 99156 Revise motion for partial	.00					
summary judgment on CEA			187.50	9139		
termination						
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.15 Hrs X 150.	00					
99157 Email from Rebecca Miller			22.50	9139		
			22.50	7137		(C)
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.	00					
99158 Review of draft judgment			60.00	9139		
Jan 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.0	00					
99159 Review of jury bond; email to			75.00	9139		
Dietmar						
Jan 3/2014 Expense Recovery	V1510	,	7.04	0120		
0	X1749		7.04	9139		
filing Opposition to writ plus return envelope						
Jan 3/2014 Expense Recovery						
	nkston & A	ssociates	L.L.C.			Page: 489
	ent Ledger	issociates,	L.L.C.			- 1.8
	/2010 To M	lay/ 1/201	4			
	Chq#			Bld]	Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec	# Rcpts	Dist	s Fees	Inv# Acc	Rcpts	Disbs
Balance						
101019 Postage - Copy of opposition to	X1749		1.72	9139		
Judge Fields						
Jan 3/2014 Expense Recovery						
101020 Postage - Copy to opposition to	X1749		1.72	9139		
Donna Grodner						
Jan 3/2014 Expense Recovery			1.70	0120		
101021 Postage - Copy of opposition to	X1749		1.72	9139		
Chris Whittington						
Jan 3/2014 Expense Recovery	V1740		1.72	9139		
101022 Postage - Copy of opposition to	X1749		1.72			
John Tyler	10					
Jan 4/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.10 Hrs X 150.0 99161 Review and revise motion for			165.00	9139		
summary judgment on						
termination of PCA						
Jan 6/2014 Billing on Invoice 8925				_		
98924 FEES 11555.00		0.00	892	.5		
DISBS 1550.80						
Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.30 Hrs X 60.00)		100 00	9139		
99067 Research			198.00	7137		
Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.0	0					
Jan 0/2017 Lawyer. Jill 0.10 1110 11 1010						

99071 Correspondence from Mald	onado			14.00	9139		
an 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 99074 Revised Judgment re legisla	140.00			42.00	0139		
auditor report. an 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 99075 Phone clal from Dan Collar	140.00			14.00 9	0139		
an 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 99076 Correspondence with Toni				14.00 9	139		
an 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 99077 Email to all counsel regard	(140.00 ing			14.00 9	139		
proposed judgment. Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 99078 Phone call from Gould reg first circuit ruling and	arding			28.00	9139		
up[coming deposit. Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X	ζ 140.00 d			14.00 9	0139		
emailed to Collarini. Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs > 99082 Correspondence with Ecke	₹ 140.00 ert			14.00	9139		
							Page: 490
(11/2014	Banks	ton & Asso	ciates, L.L	.C.			
hin/11/2014							
	Client	Ledger					
	Nov/ 1/201	Ledger 0 To May/	1/2014		Bld -	T	rust Activit
Declaration (Paid To	Nov/ 1/201	Ledger	1/2014				
Date Received From/Paid To	Nov/ 1/201 Ch	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General			T	rust Activit Disbs
Date Received From/Paid To	Nov/ 1/201	Ledger 0 To May/	/ 1/2014 General		Bld - Inv# Acc		
Declaration (Paid To	Nov/ 1/201 Ch	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General				
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation	Nov/ 1/201 Ch	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General				
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Lawyer: IHL, 0,70 Hrs	Nov/ 1/201 Ch Rec#	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees	Inv# Acc		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Lawyer: IHL, 0,70 Hrs	Nov/ 1/201 Ch Rec#	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General		Inv# Acc		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs 1	Nov/ 1/201 Ch Rec#	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees	Inv# Acc		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Lawyer: IHL, 0,70 Hrs	Nov/ 1/201 Ch Rec#	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees	Inv# Acc		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs 1 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry	Nov/ 1/201 Chen Rec#	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees	Inv# Acc		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry	Nov/ 1/201 Chennel Rec#	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00	Inv# Acc		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry	Nov/ 1/201 Chennel Rec#	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees	Inv# Acc 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 99086 Discussed legal issues with Nicoles with Nicoles of Cathy and Larry	Nov/ 1/201 Chennel Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00	Inv# Acc 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 99086 Discussed legal issues with the conference with the conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00	Inv# Acc 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs 1 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 1 99086 Discussed legal issues with Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00	9139 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs 1 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 1 99086 Discussed legal issues with Signary September 1 Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 1 99092 Letter from Caruso regards 1 99092 Letter from Caruso regards 1 99094 Temporal of hearing from do	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding cket.	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00 28.00	9139 9139 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs. 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs. 99086 Discussed legal issues with Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. removal of hearing from do Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs.	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding cket. X 140.00	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00	9139 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 99086 Discussed legal issues with Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 99092 Letter from Caruso regarder removal of hearing from do Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 99093 Email from Grodner regarder regarder from Grodner from Gro	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding cket. X 140.00	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00 28.00	9139 9139 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs. 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs. 99086 Discussed legal issues with Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99092 Letter from Caruso regarder removal of hearing from do Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99093 Email from Grodner regarders of proposed judgment.	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding cket. X 140.00 arding	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00 28.00 14.00	9139 9139 9139 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs. 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs. 99086 Discussed legal issues with Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99092 Letter from Caruso regarder removal of hearing from do Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99093 Email from Grodner regarder proposed judgment. Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs. 120 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding cket. X 140.00 arding	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00 28.00	9139 9139 9139 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs. 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs. 99086 Discussed legal issues with Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99092 Letter from Caruso regarder removal of hearing from do Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99093 Email from Grodner regarder proposed judgment. Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs. 90162 Review and revise judgment.	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding cket. X 140.00 arding X 150.00 th chent on	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00 28.00 14.00	9139 9139 9139 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs. 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs. 99096 Discussed legal issues with Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99092 Letter from Caruso regarder removal of hearing from do Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99093 Email from Grodner regarder proposed judgment. Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs. 99162 Review and revise judgment. Motion for Summary Judgment.	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding cket. X 140.00 arding X 150.00 th chent on	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00 28.00 14.00	9139 9139 9139 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs. 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs. 99086 Discussed legal issues with Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99092 Letter from Caruso regarder removal of hearing from do Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99093 Email from Grodner regarder proposed judgment. Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs. 99162 Review and revise judgment Motion for Summary Judgment Motion in Limine	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding cket. X 140.00 arding X 150.00 ment on ment	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00 28.00 14.00 14.00 75.00	9139 9139 9139 9139 9139		
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs. 99083 Telephone conference with Nicole, Cathy and Larry Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs. 99096 Discussed legal issues with Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99092 Letter from Caruso regarder removal of hearing from do Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs. 99093 Email from Grodner regarder proposed judgment. Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs. 99162 Review and revise judgment. Motion for Summary Judgment.	Nov/ 1/201 Che Rec# X 140.00 th X 140.00 th LSB X 140.00 ding cket. X 140.00 arding X 150.00 th chemical c	Ledger 0 To May/ q#	/ 1/2014 General	Fees 98.00 28.00 14.00	9139 9139 9139 9139		

Gould regarding payment of taxes; review of state law		
review of concursus pleading		
Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 99174 Telephone conference with	187.50 9139	
attorneys for East Baton Rouge and Livingston concerning		
pending deposits in concursus Jan 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00		
99175 Receipt and review of Livingston Assessor's letter	30.00 9139	
to the court		
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.05 Hrs X 60.00 99178 Research	63.00 9139	
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 99192 Receipt and review of correspondence from Grodner	28.00 9139	
regarding payment under protest.		
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.20 Hrs X 140.00 99194 Prepared supplemental responses to Interrogatories and Requests for Production of Documents regarding witnesses and	168.00 9139	
8		
exhibits. Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		D 401
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar	ikston & Associates, L.L.C.	Page: 491
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar Clie Nov/ 1/2	ıkston & Associates, L.L.C. nt Ledger 2010 To May/ 1/2014	,
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar Clie Nov/ 1/2 Date Received From/Paid To	akston & Associates, L.L.C. nt Ledger 2010 To May/ 1/2014 Chq# General Bld Tru	st Activity
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar Clie Nov/ 1/2 Date Received From/Paid To	akston & Associates, L.L.C. nt Ledger 2010 To May/ 1/2014 Chq# General Bld Tru	,
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar Clie Nov/ 1/2 Date Received From/Paid To	akston & Associates, L.L.C. nt Ledger 2010 To May/ 1/2014 Chq# General Bld Tru	st Activity
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar Clie Nov/ 1/2 Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance 99197 Email from Nicole regarding protest. Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	akston & Associates, L.L.C. nt Ledger 2010 To May/ 1/2014 Chq# General Bld Tru Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts 14.00 9139	st Activity
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar Clie Nov/ 1/2 Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance 99197 Email from Nicole regarding protest. Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99198 Email from Cathy regarding protest.	Associates, L.L.C. nt Ledger 2010 To May/ 1/2014 Chq# General Bld Tru Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts 14.00 9139	st Activity
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar Clie Nov/ 1/2 Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance 99197 Email from Nicole regarding protest. Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99198 Email from Cathy regarding	Associates, L.L.C. nt Ledger 2010 To May/ 1/2014 Chq# General Bld Tru Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts 14.00 9139	st Activity
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar Clie Nov/ 1/2 Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance 99197 Email from Nicole regarding protest. Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99198 Email from Cathy regarding protest. Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	Associates, L.L.C.	st Activity
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Bar Clie Nov/ 1/2 Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance 99197 Email from Nicole regarding protest. Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99198 Email from Cathy regarding protest. Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99199 Correspondence with Eckert Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	Associates, L.L.C. nt Ledger 2010 To May/ 1/2014 Chq# General Bld Tru Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts 14.00 9139 14.00 9139 28.00 9139	st Activity

99431 Email from Nicole Gould and	30.00 9139
Cathy St. Pierre; respond by	
email	
Jan 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00	30.00 9139
99436 Receipt and review of judgment from Livingston Assessor	
dismissing the claim	
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.20 Hrs X 140.00	
99318 Meeting with LSB regarding	448.00 9139
WI 0 40 Hz V 140 00	
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 99319 Correspondence with Stephanie	56.00 9139
with Wright & Percy regarding	
Jury Bond.	
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9139
99320 Correspondence with Erich	14.00 9139
Cathey regarding Bond.	
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	28.00 9139
99322 Phone call from Percy regarding Opposition to Motion to	
Withdraw funds.	
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	28.00 9139
00323 Revised jury bond.	28.00 7137
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9139
99324 Email to Erich with Wright & Percy regarding bond.	
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00	140.00 0120
00225 Prepared trial exhibits.	140.00 9139
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.76 Hrs X 60.00	225.60 9139
99326 Research	
	Page: 492
	sston & Associates, L.L.C.
Clien	t Ledger
	010 To May/ 1/2014 Chq# General Bld Trust Activity
Date Received From and	
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
Balance	
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 0.83 Hrs X 60.00 99370 Research	49.80 9139
99370 Research	47.00 7137
Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: LSB 4.00 Hrs X 150.00	
99439 Work on exhibit list and	600.00 9139
witness list for trial; assign	
task to associate Jan 8/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.20 Hrs X 150.00	
99447 Continue work on exhibits	330.00 9139
John Committee of Controller	

Jan 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99374 Preparation of trial exhibits.	14.00 9139
Jan 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	28.00 9139
99382 Revised bond. Jan 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99383 Correspondence with Erich	14.00 9139
regarding bond. Jan 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 99402 Preparation of supplemental	56.00 9139
discovery responses. Jan 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 99448 Email to review	30.00 9139
Jan 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 99450 Email regarding executed jury bond	15.00 9139
Jan 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00	30.00 9139
Jan 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 99456 Review revised bond	37.50 9139
Jan 10/2014 Bankcorp South Insurance Services, I 99408 Bond for Jury Trial; Invoice 8062 #19191	100.00 9139
Jan 10/2014 ARBD 99471 PMT - For Services Rendered 05942	7714.00
Jan 10/2014 ARBD 99472 PMT - For Services Rendered 05942	729.06
Jan 10/2014 ARBD 99473 PMT - For Services Rendered 05942	9285.00
Jan 10/2014 ARBD 99474 PMT - For Services Rendered 05942	2760.00
Jan 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 99533 Research	56.00 9139
Jan 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 99540 Review of all pending matters and prepared agenda for	140.00 9139
	Associates, L.L.C. Page: 493
Client Ledger	Marri 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Nov/ 1/2010 To Nov/ 1/20	General Bid Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rept. Balance	s Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Jan 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.40 Hrs X 140.00 99543 Preparation of exhibit book. Jan 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 101146 Research	196.00 9139 56.00 9139
Jan 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.90 Hrs X 140.00	

101147 Prepared supplemental discovery responses, witness, expert fees, and exhibit lists.	266.00 9139
Jan 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101148 Email to Wayne and Bill	14.00 9139
Jan 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99554 Revised judgment/certificate for filing.	14.00 9139
Jan 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.30 Hrs X 140.00 99555 Conference call with Wayne and Bill	182.00 9139
Jan 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99557 Legal research regarding	14.00 9139
Jan 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00 99559 Preparation of trial exhibits. Jan 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00	210.00 9139
99560 Revised supplemental interrogatories regarding exhibits.	42.00 9139
Jan 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 99561 Receipt and review of motion to strike re jury venire from Collarini.	28.00 9139
Jan 13/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 0.25 Hrs X 60.00 99580 Review co-defendant's motion to	15.00 9139
strike jury venire. Jan 13/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 99587 Review of motion in limine; assign task to paralegal	75.00 9139
Jan 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99608 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Jan 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9139
99609 Revised Notice of Intention to Apply for Supervisory Writs.	28.00 9139
Jan 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 99610 Prepared letter to Judge Fields	28.00 9139
Jun/11/2014 Bankstor Client Le	a & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 494 dger To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Chq#	General Bld Trust Activity
Balance	cepts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
regarding proposed Judgment.	
Jan 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 99616 Letter to the court regarding notice of intention to apply	28.00 9139

FE/16/2014 0-40-50 AMI

for writs.	0				
Jan 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 99617 Letter to the court regarding)	28.00	9139		
proposed judgment.	0				
Jan 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.10 Hrs X 140.00 99628 Revised Opposition to Partial	J	294.00	9139		
Summary Judgment regarding					
refund owed to ARBC by DOTD,					
and	land to				
	1				
Gathered documents to be					
utilized as exhibits. Jan 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	0				
99631 Correspondence with Blanchfield		14.0	0 9139		
regarding meeting.					
Jan 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	0	75.00	9139		
99647 Review of witness list and documents for trial		73.00	9139		
Jan 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00	0				
99652 Review of motion for partial		150.00	9139		
summary judgment Jan 14/2014 Expense Recovery					
101032 Postage - to COC filing Notice	X1749	1.32	9139		
of Intention plus return					
envelope					
Jan 14/2014 Expense Recovery 101033 Postage - Copy to Judge Fields	X1749	0.66	9139		
Jan 14/2014 Expense Recovery	Allino	0.00	3.03		
101034 Postage - to COC filing X	(1749	0.86	9139		
judgment plus return envelope					
Jan 14/2014 Expense Recovery 101035 Postage - Copy to Judge Fields	X1749	0.66	9139		
with letter	Aller	0.00	3137		
Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00)				
99667 Revised Opposition to Partial		56.00	9139		
Summary Judgment regarding refund to ARBD and noted					
retund to ARBB and noted					
Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00)	14.00	0120		
99668 Email to Blanchfield regarding Opposition to Partial Summary		14.00	9139		
Judgment regarding DOTD owes					
refund to ARBD.					D 10.5
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •		ciates, L.L.C.			Page: 495
	nt Ledger 2010 To May/	1/2014			
Date Received From/Paid To		General	Bld -	T	rust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Repts	Disbs Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
Balance				-	

Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99674 Correspondence with Blanchfield	14.00 9139
regarding DOTD documents. Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99675 Receipt and review of USACE	14.00 9139
power point from Blanchfield. Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99676 Updated trial exhibits list. Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9139
99677 Prepared list of documents to produce to plaintiffs.	14.00 9139
Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 99685 Discussed legal issues with LSB.	42.00 9139
Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 99686 Began revising Opposition to Plaintiff's Partial Summary	56.00 9139
Judgment Declaring the CEA Terminated.	
Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 99691 Review of Power Point	75.00 9139
Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 99692 Email to Bobby Duplantier Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00	30.00 9139
99696 Telephone conference with John Tyler regarding issues before	112.50 9139
trail Jan 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 99699 Email to Blanchfield and from Blanchfield	37.50 9139
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 99718 Correspondence with Blanchfield regarding meetings.	14.00 9139
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.10 Hrs X 140.00 99721 Preparation of Opposition to Plaintiff's Partial Summary	294.00 9139
Judgment regarding CEA Terminated.	
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 99722 Meeting with LSB regarding	98.00 9139
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 99723 Correspondence with Toni	42.00 9139
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 99724 Revised Supplemental discovery responses.	70.00 9139
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.60 Hrs X 140.00 99725 Prepared document production	224.00 9139 ssociates, L.L.C. Page: 496
Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To Ma	
	General Bld Trust Activity

Entry # Explanation Balance	Rec#	Repts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Rcpts	Disbs
regarding trial exhibits. Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 99728 Correspondence with Col	X 140.00 larini			14.00	9139		
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 99731 Review from Toni.	X 140.00			14.00	9139		
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs 99732 Review of Grodner's Men Terminated.	X 140.00 no re CEA			42.	00 9139		
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 99733 Email to Wayne, Bill, Da				28.00	9139		
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 99734 Correspondence w Collar				14.00	9139		
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs 99735 Prepared supplemental re- to requests for production.	sponses	ji		56.00	9139		
Jan 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 99736 Email from Grodner regar				14.00	9139		
experts. San 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 99738 Email to Sheriffs and Ass regarding document producti	essors			14.00	9139		
an 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs 99767 Telephone conference for meeting with Drew Blanchfi				15.00 9	139		
an 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.20 Hrs 99770 Telephone call from plain attorney; review of final draft of discovery and	X 150.00			180.00	9139		
witnesses and exhibit list an 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs 99772 Email concerning continua				15.00	9139		
an 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs 99773 Meeting with plaintiffs to discuss continuance and	X 150.00		1	87.50 91	39		
possible settlement in 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs 99774 Review of opposition on C termination	X 150.00 CEA			112.50	9139		
un 16/2014 Expense Recovery 101039 Postage - 4 CD's with exh to plaintiff class attorneys	ibits X1	749	2.0	64	9139		
(@ \$0.66 each) an 17/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.50 Hrs an/11/2014		n & Asso	ciates, L.L	.C.			Page: 497

Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

Date Received From/Paid To	Ch		General		Bld -	Т	rust Activity
Entry # Explanation Balance	Rec#	Repts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
99739 Research				210.00	9139		
Jan 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs 2 99744 Discussed legal issues with				42.00	9139		
Jan 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs 2 99745 Review of Plaintiff's Partia Summary Judgment regarding terminated.	1		5	6.00 91	39		
Jan 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 99746 Review of memorandum	(140.00 legal			140.	00 9139		
Jan 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.20 Hrs X 99747 Revised Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment regarding Terminated.			16	8.00 91	39		
an 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 99760 Additional Revisisions to opposition to Plaintiff's partial summary judgment regarding PCA.	140.00		28	3.00 91.	39		
an 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 99762 Reviewed and revised motio continuance.				14.00	9139		
nn 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 99763 Correspondence with Collari				14.00	0139		
un 17/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 99779 Review of PCA opposition make revisions				112.50	9139		
nn 17/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 99780 Review of motion to continu trial date	150.00 ie			75.00	0139		
n 17/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 99783 Telephone call to plaintiff's attorney; receipt and start review of stay to the LA Supreme Court n 18/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X			375	.00 913	9		

99784 Calendar motions set for			150.00	9139		
February 10, 2014; review of writ						Page: 498
Jun/11/2014	Client Ledg					1 agc. 476
	ov/ 1/2010 To	May/ 1/2014	1	DI L	т.	met Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq#	Genera	1	Bld -	Tı	rust Activity
Entry # Explanation Balance	Rec# Rcp				Rcpts	Disbs
Jan 19/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.75 Hrs X 99788 Begin work on opposition to writ to Supreme Court	150.00		562.50	9139		
Jan 20/2014 ARBD 99834 PMT - For Services Rendered Jan 20/2014 ARBD	d 05978	3 5348.00				
99835 PMT - For Services Rendered Jan 20/2014 ARBD	d 05978	3 1550.80				
99836 PMT - For Services Rendered Jan 20/2014 ARBD	d 05978	3030.00				
99837 PMT - For Services Rendered Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X	140.00	3177.00				
100404 Correspondence with Wayne Bill	and		14.0	0 9139		
Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 1 100405 Legal research	140.00		70.00	9139		
Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.30 Hrs X I 100406 Review of Plaintiff's Suprem Court Writ Application.	ie		182.00	9139		
Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 1 100407 Review of LA Supreme Cou rules.	rt		56.00	9139		
Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1 100408 Email from Collarini regardi			14.00	9139		
Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 1 100414 Discussed legal issues with I			56.00	9139		
Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.80 Hrs X 1 100421 Preparation of Opposition to Plaintiff's Request for Stay from the LA Supreme Court.	40.00		112.00	9139		
Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 1 100422 Preparation of Opposition to Plaintiff's Supreme Court Writ Application.	40.00		280.00	9139		
Ian 20/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 1 100547 Preparation for meeting with DOTD attorney and witness			112.50	9139		
Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 1	50.00					

Jan 20/2014 Meeting with state's attorney Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 1	50.00		187.50			
100549 Receipt and review of motion continue; email to other	ı to		75.00	9139		
attorney; final review	50.00					
Jan 20/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 1 100553 Work on writ response to	30.00		375.00	9139		
	Bankston & As	sociates L.		7137		Page: 499
	Client Ledger	sociates, E.	L.C.			ruge.
	7/ 1/2010 To Ma	y/ 1/2014				
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq#	General -		Bld -	Т	Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation R Balance	Rec# Repts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
						\
Supreme Court; review						
opposition to stay	0.00					
fan 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.90 Hrs X 14 100557 Preparation of Supreme Court	0.00		546.00	9139		
brief.			340.00	9139		
an 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 14	0.00					
100560 Revised Opposition to Reques			42.00	9139		
for Stay from LA Supreme Court			12.00	7107		
an 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14						
100561 long distance phone call to LA			14.00	9139		
Supreme Court Clerk of Court	•					
regarding writ application by						
Plaintiff.						
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14	10.00			100		
100562 Prepared letter to LA Supreme	e		28.00	9139		
Court regarding Opposition to						
Request for Stay.						
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14	40.00		14.00	9139		
100563 Correspondence with Rachel			14.00	9139		
Kellogg regarding pretrial						
inserts.	10.00					
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 14 100567 Review of Collarini's pretrial	40.00		42.00	9139		
inserts.			12.00			
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14	40.00					
100571 Began revising pretrial inserts			28.00	9139		
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 1						
100572 Review of motion to continue			37.50	9139		
trial date	50.00					
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 1 100574 Telephone call from Dietmar	50.00					
1005/4 Telephone can from Dietmar	OII		37.50	9139		
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 1:	50.00					
100578 Telephone call from Don Tho	mpson		27	50 0120		
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 1:	50.00		37	.50 9139		
100579 Telephone call to Wayne			37.50	9139		
Maldonado			57.50	7139		
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 15	50.00					

prepare document to Supreme						
Court Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.67 Hrs X 60.00			100.20	9139		
100587 Draft research memorandum on			100.20	, ,13,		
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.25 Hrs X 60.00						
100588 Research			135.00	9139		
Jan 21/2014 Expense Recovery	reton & Ass	sociates, L.L.C.				Page: 500
Clien	t Ledger					
Date Received From/Paid To Nov/ 1/20	010 10 May hq#	// 1/2014 - General		Bld -	Т	rust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Repts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
101041 Postage - to COC filing Motion to Continue plus return	X1749	2.98	3	9139		
envelope Jan 21/2014 Expense Recovery						
101042 Postage - Copy to Judge Fields Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00	X1749	0.66		9139		
101149 Telephone call from John Tyler regarding possible settlement			37.50	9139		
Jan 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00 101150 Prepared Supreme Court Opposition to Request for Stay for filing.		84	4.00	9139		
Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.80 Hrs X 60.00 100589 Draft research memorandum on			228.00	9139		
Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 100636 Review of local rules.		42.00	0 913	39		
Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100637 Correspondence with Rachel Kellogg regarding pretrial		1	14.00	9139		
inserts. Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00						
100641 Correspondence with Rachel Flarity regarding continuance. Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		1	4.00	9139		
100642 Correspondence with Rachel Kellogg regarding continuance.		1	4.00	9139		
Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.50 Hrs X 140.00 100645 Preparation of pretrial inserts. Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		350.0	00 91	139		
100646 Phone call from John Tyler regarding settlement.		14.	.00 9	139		

Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.80 Hrs X 140.00 100650 Began preparing writ application regarding exclusion of LA Legislative Auditor report. Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 100652 Email to John Tyler Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 150.00 100657 Further review of writ opposition Jan 22/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00	252.00 9139 30.00 9139 262.50 9139
100658 Review revised motion in limine regarding jury venire Jan 22/2014 Expense Recovery	112.50 9139 X1749 12.04 9139
Jun/11/2014 Bank Client Nov/ 1/20	Ston & Associates, L.L.C. t Ledger 1010 To May/ 1/2014 hq# General Bld Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To C Entry # Explanation Rec#	Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
P's Request for Stay to all counsel, Judge Fields and Christine Crow (\$0.86 x 14)	
Jan 22/2014 Expense Recovery 103007 Parking X1757 Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 100722 Discussed legal issues with LSB	6.00 9443 42.00 9139
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 100723 Legal research regarding	56.00 9139
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 100724 Review of Plaintiff's pretrial inserts and made comments for	280.00 9139
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100725 Receipt and review of correspondence from Blanchfield regarding	14.00 9139
settlement offer. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 100726 Phone call from Dan Collarini	28.00 9139
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 100727 Meeting with LSB regarding	70.00 9139

Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X 140.00	
In 23/2014 Lawver: JHL 0.90 fils A 140.00	
Jan 25/2014 Build metricl incerts	126.00 9139
100728 Revised pretrial inserts.	
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 100729 Preparation for exhibit book.	42.00 9139
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
100730 Email to Wayne, Dan, Bill	14.00 9139
100/30 Eman to wayne, Ban,	
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	2422
100731 Receipt and review of Dan's	14.00 9139
additional to pretrial inserts.	
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	44.00 0120
100732 Receipt and review of AAIC's	14.00 9139
pretrial inserts.	
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.20 Hrs X 140.00	168.00 9139
100735 Preparation for First Circuit	108.00 9139
brief.	
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	28.00 9139
100736 Phone call from Collarini	ton & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 502
Jun/11/2014 Banks Client	ton & Associates, E.E.C.
	10 To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Ch	q# General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Balance	
77.140.00	
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	20.00 0120
100707 Final marriagene to protrial	72.00 9139
100737 Final revisions to pretrial	28.00 9139
inserts.	28.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding	14.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts.	
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding	14.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book.	14.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00	14.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of	14.00 9139 14.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00	14.00 9139 14.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 100778 Telephone conference with John	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 100778 Telephone conference with John Tyler	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139 60.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 100778 Telephone conference with John Tyler Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00 100779 Further preparation of ARBC	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 100778 Telephone conference with John Tyler Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00 100779 Further preparation of ARBC portions of Pretrial inserts	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139 60.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 100778 Telephone conference with John Tyler Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00 100779 Further preparation of ARBC portions of Pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139 60.00 9139 450.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 100778 Telephone conference with John Tyler Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00 100779 Further preparation of ARBC portions of Pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 100780 Review of AAIC pretrial inserts	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139 60.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 100778 Telephone conference with John Tyler Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00 100779 Further preparation of ARBC portions of Pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 100780 Review of AAIC pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139 60.00 9139 450.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 100778 Telephone conference with John Tyler Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00 100779 Further preparation of ARBC portions of Pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 100780 Review of AAIC pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 100781 Review of motion to strike	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139 60.00 9139 450.00 9139
inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100738 Email to all counsel regarding pretrial inserts. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100739 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book. Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 100773 Receipt and review of plaintiff's pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 100778 Telephone conference with John Tyler Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00 100779 Further preparation of ARBC portions of Pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 100780 Review of AAIC pretrial inserts Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	14.00 9139 14.00 9139 375.00 9139 60.00 9139 450.00 9139

100783 Transmit to Dietmar Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.25 Hrs X 60.00	30.00 9139
100964 Draft research memo on	75.00 9139
Jan 23/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 4.00 Hrs X 60.00	
100965 Review briefs and pleadings to construct jury instructions.	240.00 9139
Jan 23/2014 Expense Recovery 101046 Postage - CD of trial exhibits X1749 to Grodner	0.66 9139
Jan 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00 100741 Preparation of Writ Application re Admissibility of Legislative Auditor Report and Testimony.	84.00 9139
Jan 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.60 Hrs X 140.00 100744 Meeting with Drew Blanchfield.	224.00 9139
Jan 24/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 150.00 100787 Meeting with DOTD attorney; telephone call to plaintiff	262.50 9139
Client Ledge	
Date Received From/Paid To Nov/ 1/2010 To Chq#	May/ 1/2014 General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcp	ts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
100792 Work on writ brief	375.00 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100806 Email from Collarini regarding	14.00 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 100809 Receipt and review of letter from Jason Ard regarding 2014 taxes and discussed legal	28.00 9139
. LI T CD	
issues with LSB. Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100810 Email to Blanchfield's office regarding deposition of Donald	14.00 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100810 Email to Blanchfield's office	14.00 9139 14.00 9139

100860 Review of DOTD documents	75.00 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 100864 Final review of legislative auditor writ; email to Bill and Wayne	75.00 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 100865 Receipt and review of email to New Orleans counsel concerning	37.50 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 100868 Review of draft letter to East Baton Rouge Parish Sheriff	30.00 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 100870 Review of research	75.00 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 100871 Receipt and review of judgment and order from the Court	30.00 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 100880 Review of DOTD and Bond Commission pretrial inserts	112.50 9139
Jan 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 100888 Receipt and review of notice of filing with Supreme Court	15.00 9139
Jan 28/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 100849 Reviewed and prepared exhibits to be included as attachments	98.00 9139
to opposition to partial summary judgment regarding DOTD owes refund to ARBC.	
Client L	
	0 To May/ 1/2014 # General Bld Trust Activity
Dute	# General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
100850 Review of legal memorandum	28.00 9139
Jan 28/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.30 Hrs X 140.00 100851 Revised Supreme Court brief. Jan 28/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00	182.00 9139
100852 Prepared table of authorities and table of contents for	280.00 9139
supreme court brief. Jan 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00 100890 Review and revise writ to Supreme Court	450.00 9139
Jan 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 100894 Review of plaintiff's witness	150.00 9139

list Jan 28/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 6.00 Hrs X 60.00 100966 Research	360.00 9139
Jan 29/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 150.00 100899 Receipt and review of errata sheet; assign task to associate	45.00 9139
Jan 29/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 100901 Receipt and review of judgment concerning proposed settlement	
Jan 29/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 100902 Calendar hearing on EBR assessor Motion for Summary	15.00 9139
Judgment Jan 29/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 100905 Review of writ application for ARBC; email from Dan Collarini	75.00 9139
Jan 29/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 0.75 Hrs X 60.00 100967 Draft	45.00 9139
Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 100913 Prepared letter to Supreme Court regarding Opposition to	28.00 9139
Writ Application. Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 100914 Final revisions to Supreme Court brief.	70.00 9139
Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 100915 Prepared Supreme Court brief for filing.	56.00 9139
Client	ston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 506 Ledger 10 To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Ch	nq# General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 100917 Prepared affidavit of Dietmar.	28.00 9139
Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 100918 Revised Affidavit of Dietmar.	14.00 9139
Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 100919 Revised Opposition to Partial Summary Judgment re DOTD owes	56.00 9139
refund to ARBC. Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00	98.00 9139
100921 Final revisions to Opposition	90.00 9139

	to Partial Summary Judgment re PCA terminated and prepared					
	exhibits for filing.					
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.80 Hrs X 140.00					
	100922 Final revisions to Opposition		112.00	9139		
	to Partial Summary Judgment re					
	CEA terminated and prepared					
	exhibits for filing.					
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		1400	0120		
	100928 Met with Dietmar		14.00	9139		
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00					
	100932 Prepared letter to Sheriff		42.00	9139		
	Wiley regarding 2013 Ascension					
	Parish taxes.					
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs X 140.00					
	100934 Prepared letter to Plaintiffs		154.00	9139		
	and summarized all objections					
	to pretrial inserts.					
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		1.1.00	0120		
	100940 Review of research regarding		14.00	9139		
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		1400	0100		
	100944 Email from Collarini regarding		14.00	9139		
	1 20/2014 I 1 50 H 1 50 H					
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00		225.00	0120		
	100948 Final review of writ opposition		225.00	9139		
	to Supreme Court					
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00		75.00	120		
	100950 Review of affidavit for		75.00 9	139		
	Dietmar; revise; telephone call to Dietmar					
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 100953 Review and revise final draft		112.50	0120		
	of Opposition to Motion for		112.50	9139		
	Partial Summary Judgment on PCA					
	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00					
	100954 Review and revise final draft		75.00	9139		
		Pr Associates I		9139		D 507
	Client Le	& Associates, L	J.L.C.			Page: 507
		Γο May/ 1/2014		RIA I	Tr	net Activity
		General		Bid -	11	ust Activity
		cpts Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Ponts	Disbs
1	Balance Rec# R	cpts Disos	rees	IIIv# Acc	Repts	DISUS
			, i			
	of Opposition to Motion for					
	Partial Summary Judgment on CEA					
J	Jan 30/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00					
	100955 Review and revise final draft		112.50	9139		
	of Opposition to Motion for		112.50	7.107		
	Partial Summary Judgment on					

retu	rn of DOTD money	V 150 00						
Jan 30/2014	Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs	X 150.00			15.00	9139		
100962	Telephone call to Dietman							
Ian 30/2014	Expense Recovery			II ii		0.1.00		
101050 I	Postage - Opposition to w	rit to Y	(1749	12.2	2.5	9139		
Groo	dner, Whittington, Tyler,							
Judg	ge Fields and Christine							
Cro	w (5 @ \$2.45 each)	V 60 00						
Jan 31/2014	Lawyer: PL-2 5.38 Hrs	X 60.00			322.80	9139		
100970 I	Review briefs and pleadin struct jury instructions.	igs to			522.00			
con:	Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs	X 140.00						
100076 I	Letter to Court regarding			2	8.00 9	139		
00970	ositions to partial summa	ry						
inde	ments.							
Ian 31/2014	Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs	X 140.00			04.00	139		
100982 I	Receipt and review of the				84.00 9	139		
Stat	e's Oppositions to partial							
sum	mary judgment re DOTD	owes						
	und, CEA terminated, and	u						
PC/	A terminated. Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs	X 150.00						
101001 I	Review of letter to counse	el		3	30.00 9	139		
reg	arding evidence							
Ian 31/2014	Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs	X 150.00			37.50	9139		
10100 <u>4</u>	Report to D. Thompson				37.30	9139		
		37 150 00						
Jan 31/2014	Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs	X 150.00			112.5	0 9139		
101009	Review of DOTD opposit arate motions for summar	rv						
sep	gment on CEA; PCA and							
retu	irn of money							
Ian 31/2014	Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs	X 150.00			75.00	9139		
101013	Telephone call from Cath	ly St.			73.00	9139		
	rre; email to St. Pierre							
reg	arding taxes	V 150 00						
Jan 31/2014	Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs Receipt and review of mo	otion to			75.00	9139		
101015	draw by Tyler &	otion to						
Wh	littington; telephone call t	to						
	ociate							
Jan 31/2014	Expense Recovery			alataa T T (C			Page: 508
Jun/11/2014				ociates, L.L.	C.			1 ugo. o
		Nov/ 1/20	Ledger 10 To May	/ 1/2014				
D. t. D.	eceived From/Paid To	Cł	10#	General		Bld	Т	rust Activity
Date R	eceived Fiolini and 10	0.	14//		,			D: 1
	Explanation	Rec#	Rcpts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
Balance								

Jan 31/2014 Expense Recovery 101057 Postage - 2 Oppositions to	X17	749		5.32	9139		
Judge Fields Jan 31/2014 Expense Recovery 101069 Photocopies - 2976 BW @ \$0 each	.10	X1750		297.60	9139		
Jan 31/2014 Expense Recovery 101070 Photocopies - 67 color copies at \$0.15 each	X1	750		10.05	9139		
Feb 3/2014 Billing on Invoice 9139 101154 FEES 24375.40 DISBS 466.94			0.00	91	39		
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14 101276 Review of Tyler and Whittington's Motion to Withdraw as Counsel.				28.00	9443		
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 101279 Email from Maldonado regard	l0.00 ding			14.	.00 9443		
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 101290 Email from Gould regarding I 2013 tax collections.	10.00 LPSO			14	4.00 9443		
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 14	SB.			42.0	0 9443		
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14 101292 Receipt and review of signed Judgment, signed Order to	10.00			28.00	9443		
apply for writs, and calendared deadlines. Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 14 101293 Prepared Motion for Stay and alternatively for expedited	10.00			70.00	9443		
consideration. Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 101295 Receipt and review of correspondence from	10.00			14.00	9443		
Blanchfield regarding pretrial inserts.							
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 1: 101306 Receipt and review of email from Maldonado	50.00			30.00	9443		
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 1: 101308 Telephone call from Dietmar				75.0	0 9443		
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 15 101310 Email to and from Sheriff's	50.00			15.00	9443		
Nov	Client L	on & Associated					Page: 509
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq	#	Genera	1	Bld -	Tru	st Activity
Entry # Explanation R Balance	ec#	Repts	Disb	s Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs

5.1. 2/2014 J.		
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 101313 Email from Gould regarding meeting with associate and law	112.50 9443	
clerk		
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.80 Hrs X 150.00 101314 Receipt and review of final judgment on rules and writ	120.00 9443	
order; assign task to associate Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 101317 State's attorney adopts ARBD's objections to stated facts	37.50 9443	
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 101319 Review and revise writ application on motion in limine	225.00 9443	
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.10 Hrs X 60.00	186.00 9443	
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.90 Hrs X 60.00 101590 Draft jury instructions	174.00 9443	
Feb 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 103092 Revised First Circuit brief.	56.00 9443	
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 101516 Legal research	140.00 9443	
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 101530 Final revisions to table of authorities and table of contents for writ application.	70.00 9443	
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 101531 Prepared writ application and all exhibits for filing.	280.00 9443	
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 101532 Prepared letter to FIrst Circuit regarding writ application.	28.00 9443	
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 101541 Prepared Notice of Intention to Apply for Writs and Order.	42.00 9443	
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.80 Hrs X 60.00 101589 Draft memorandum in support of rule to show cause.	228.00 9443	
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 101845 Final review of legislative auditor's report	75.00 9443	
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.00 Hrs X 150.00 101850 Review of additional writ applications	300.00 9443	
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00		Page: 510
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Asse	ociates, L.L.C.	rage: 310
Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May	/ 1/2014	

Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance	Repts		Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
101851 Receipt and review of notice of intention to apply for writ concerning supervisory writs		37.50	9443		
Feb 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 103090 Revised writ application to the First Circuit.		56.00 9	9443		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 101566 Began reviewing Collarini's Joint Pretrial Order.		28.00 9	443		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 101567 Correspondence with Collarini		70.00	9443		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101568 Phone call from Grodner's office regarding pretrial order.		14.00 9	443		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101569 Email to Grodner's office regarding pretrial order.		14.00 94	43		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101572 Receipt and review of notice of writ from First Circuit. Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		14.00	9443		
101575 Email from Kellogg regarding pretrial order. Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00		14.00	9443		
101576 Returned Rachel Kellogg's phone call regarding upcoming hearings.		28.00	9443		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101579 Phone call from John Tyler regarding protecting interest.		14.00 9	0443		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 101583 Correspondence with Grodner's office regarding pretrial order.		28.00	9443		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101584 Receipt and review of LPSO's Motion to Deposit tax funds.		14.00	9443		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101585 Updated table of tax deposits. Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00		14.00 9	443		
101587 Receipt of and began reviewing Plaintiff's pretrial order.		84.00	9443		
Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.25 Hrs X 60.00 101591 Draft memorandum in support of rule to show cause. Feb 5/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 0.50 Hrs X 60.00		195.00	9443		

101592 Deliver writ application to 1st Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Ass Client Ledger		Page: 511
Nov/ 1/2010 To May Date Received From/Paid To Chq#	// 1/2014 - General Bld	Trust Activity
	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rept	
Circuit Court of Appeal Feb 5/2014 Expense Recovery 102956 Postage - CD to Grodner containing exhibits to Writ App	0.68 9443	
Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101881 Email from Rachel Kellogg regarding pretrial order.	14.00 9443	
Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 101883 Finished reviewing Plaintiff's pretrial order.	42.00 9443	
Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 101884 Summarized all errors in pretrial order and emailed to	98.00 9443	
Grodner for corrections. Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101885 Email from Blanchfield regarding pretrial order.	14.00 9443	
Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 101886 Correspondence with Collarini	28.00 9443	
Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101889 Phone call from Matt Percy regarding letter from Dietmar.	14.00 9443	
Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 101895 Letter to the court regarding notice of intent for writs re	28.00 9443	
denial of msj in concursus. Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9443	

101903 Receipt and review of motion to

Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 101904 Discussed legal issues with LSB

Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101908 Phone call from Collarini

Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101909 Correspondence with Grodner's

Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00

101917 Email from Collarini regarding

office regarding pretrial

enroll counsel.

inserts.

14.00 9443

28.00 9443

14.00 9443

15.00 9443

Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00

15.00 9443

101918 Court of Appeal acceptance of writ (Legislature Auditor

Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 Jun/11/2014 Bank

to protect interest.

Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

Page: 512

Clier	nt Ledger		
- : IF /D:IT-	2010 To May/ 1/2014	4 al Bld	Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid 10	Silqii Genera		
Entry # Explanation Rec#	-		
		15.00 9443	
101919 Email by Kellogg adopting our objections		13.00 7443	
Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 101922 Review of motion to add co-counsel)	75.00 9443	
Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 101924 Receipt and review of Livingston Parish motion to		75.00 9443	
deposit funds; email to Gould Feb 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102158 Phone call from Collarini		14.00 9443	
Feb 6/2014 Expense Recovery 102958 Postage - Copy of Writ App to Judge Fields	X1756	12.69 944	3
Feb 6/2014 Expense Recovery 103091 Postage - to COC filing Notice of Intention plus return envelope	X1756	1.17 9443	
Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 101932 Correspondence with Grodner and Kellogg regarding pretrial		28.00 9443	
order. Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 101933 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's revised pretrial		28.00 9443	
order. Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 101934 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's Motion in Limine		56.00 9443	
to exxclude ARBD's experts. Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 101936 Prepared opposition to LPSO's motion to deposit funds in		140.00 9443	
registry. Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101941 Receipt and review of Fax from John Tyler regarding agreement		14.00 9443	

101943 Email from Collarini regaridng	1	4.00 9443
Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101947 Email from Rachel Kellogg	14	4.00 9443
regarding pretrial order. Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 101948 Email from Donna regarding	1	14.00 9443
Client	ton & Associates, L.L.C. Ledger 10 To May/ 1/2014	Page: 513
Date Received From/Paid To Ch	q# General	Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Rcpts Disbs I	Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
101969 Telephone call to Wayne Maldonado		.00 9443
Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 101970 Review of motion in limine regarding experts; assign task to paralegal	18	7.50 9443
Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 101979 Receipt and review of letter from Tyler regarding interest in fees	30.	.00 9443
Feb 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 101980 Preparation for Monday hearing Feb 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 101982 Review of sur-reply by Grodner		75.00 9443
on motion Feb 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 101983 Review and revise Opposition to Sheriff Ard's Motion to Deposit		112.50 9443
Funds Feb 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 101984 Email from Dietmar regarding		15.00 9443
Feb 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 101985 Prepare deposition questions and exhibits for Huey Martin	37.	5.00 9443
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.17 Hrs X 60.00 102008 Draft memorandum in support of motion to withdraw funds from registry of the court		70.20 9443
following order by court of		
appeal. Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 5.59 Hrs X 60.00 102009 Research	33	35.40 9443

Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.00 Hrs X 140.00 102015 Hearing on Plaintiff's partial summary judgments and ARBC's Mtn for Continuance. Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00			420.00 9443		
102018 Prepared letter to Donna regarding exhibit book.			28.00 9443		
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 102019 Preparation for Hugh Martin's deposition.			42.00 9443		
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102020 Email from Grodner regarding exhibits.			14.00 9443		
	ston & Ass	ociates, L.L	C.		Page: 514
Client	Ledger				
	10 To May	/ 1/2014 General	Bld	1 T	rust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To Ch	ıq#	General	Bid		1450112011119
Entry # Explanation Rec#			Fees Inv# Ac		Disbs
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102021 Correspondence with Rachel Kellogg regarding deposition			14.00 9443		
of Hugh Martin. Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 102022 Legal research regarding			70.00 9443		
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102023 Gathered exhibits to be used as evidence for Motion to Strike			28.00 9443		
Exhibits. Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs X 140.00 102024 Began preparing Motion to Strike Exhibits and Motion for			154.00 9443		
Sanctions. Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102025 Correspondence with Maldonado			14.00 9443		
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00 102026 Prepared Exception and Motion for Partial Summary Judgment			210.00 9443		
of Prescription. Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102027 Revised Motion to Strike.			28.00 9443		
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102028 Letter to the Court regarding motion to strike and exception			28.00 9443		
of prescription. Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102031 Revised Opposition to Sheriff Ard's Motion to deposit funds			28.00 9443		

and Rule to Show Cause.	
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
102034 Emails from Kellogg and Grodner	14.00 9443
regarding pretrial order.	
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00 102091 Attend hearing on PCA; CEA and	450.00 9443
Motion to Continue	430.00 9443
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	
102092 Revise memo and motion	75.00 9443
regarding concursus motion	
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.00 Hrs X 150.00	
102096 Review and revise motion and	300.00 9443
order; memo for sanctions	
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 150.00	262.50 9443
102097 Review and revise exception of prescription and memo in	202.30 7443
support	
	Associates, L.L.C. Page: 515
Client Ledge	
Nov/ 1/2010 To	May/ 1/2014
	General Bld Trust Activity
Pac# Pan	ts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
	is Disos rees my ree repre
Balance	
Feb 10/2014 Expense Recovery 103004 Parking X1757	6.00 9443
Feb 10/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00	150.00 9443
103093 Email to Huey Martin; email to Blanchfield; preparation for	
deposition	
Feb 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.75 Hrs X 60.00	
102035 Research	165.00 9443
Feb 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.95 Hrs X 60.00	177.00 9443
102036 Draft research memorandum on	177.00
Feb 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00	70.00 9443
102047 Revised Motion to Release Funds.	70.00 9443
Feb 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	28.00 9443
102069 Discussed legal issues with LSB.	26.00 7113
Feb 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102073 Email to Rachel Kellogg	14.00 9443
regarding joint pretrial order.	
Feb 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
102074 Email to Grodner regarding	14.00 9443
Joint Pretrial Order.	
Feb 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.50 Hrs X 150.00	525.00 9443
102081 Travel to and from New Orleans	525.00 9443

Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102123 Email from Gould regarding Jerry Preau deposition.	14.00 9443
Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102124 Correspondence with Kellogg and Grodner regarding PTO.	28.00 9443
Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X 140.00 102126 Telephone conference with Grodner regarding PTO.	126.00 9443
Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 102130 Discussed legal issues with LSB	56.00 9443
Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102131 Email from Maldonado regarding	14.00 9443
Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102138 Correspondence with Maldonado	14.00 9443
Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 102139 Review of documents	70.00 9443
Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102140 Correspondence from Brittany Jun/11/2014 Bankston & As	14.00 9443 sociates, L.L.C. Page: 517
Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To Ma	
NOV/ 1/2010 10 1/12	y/ 1/2014 Pld Trust Activity
11 1	General
Date Received From/Paid To Chq#	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# Entry # Explanation Rec# Repts Balance	General
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Balance Ling regarding Plaintiff's	General
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Balance Ling regarding Plaintiff's exhibits. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102142 Correspondence with Brittany	General
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Balance Ling regarding Plaintiff's exhibits. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102142 Correspondence with Brittany Ling regarding revised pretrial order. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 102143 Receipt and review of	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Balance Ling regarding Plaintiff's exhibits. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102142 Correspondence with Brittany Ling regarding revised pretrial order. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 102143 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's revised PTO. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102144 Reviewed and revised letter to Grodner regarding objections	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs 14.00 9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Balance Ling regarding Plaintiff's exhibits. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102142 Correspondence with Brittany Ling regarding revised pretrial order. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 102143 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's revised PTO. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102144 Reviewed and revised letter to Grodner regarding objections to exhibits. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 102149 Final review of motion to release funds	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs 14.00 9443
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Balance Ling regarding Plaintiff's exhibits. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102142 Correspondence with Brittany Ling regarding revised pretrial order. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 102143 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's revised PTO. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102144 Reviewed and revised letter to Grodner regarding objections to exhibits. Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 102149 Final review of motion to	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs 14.00 9443 56.00 9443

Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00		37.50	9443		
102156 Receipt and review of request					
for deposition of Ed Preau					
Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: LSB 6.00 Hrs X 150.00		900.00	9443		
102157 Review of all exhibits from plaintiff; letter to plaintiff					
objecting to the exhibits;					
telephone call with plaintiff					
Feb 12/2014 Expense Recovery			0.4.42		
102962 Postage - to COC filing X1	756	11.05	9443		
Exception (CM/RRR) plus return					
envelope					
Feb 12/2014 Expense Recovery	V1756	1.61	9443		
102963 Postage - Copy to Judge Fields	X1756	1.01	, , , ,		
Feb 12/2014 Expense Recovery	X1756	15.97	9443		
102964 Postage - to COC filing Motion	X1730	13.57			
to Strike/Compel Exhibits					
(CM/RRR) plus return envelope					
Feb 12/2014 Expense Recovery 102965 Postage - Copy to Judge Fields	X1756	5.32	9443		
Feb 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00					
103094 Receipt and review of revised		14.00	9443		
deposition notice for Ed Preau.					
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		1.4	00 0442		
102183 Correspondence with Maldonado		14	.00 9443		
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00		28.0	00 9443		
102184 Review of legal memorandum		20.	00 3112		
Rank	reton & Asso	ciates, L.L.C.			Page: 518
	t Ledger	ciates, E.E.C.			
Nov/ 1/2	010 To May/			_	
Date Received From/Paid To C	hq#	General	Bld	Tr	ust Activity
	- Y		T II A	Danta	Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Rcpts	Disbs Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	DISOS
Balance					
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00	j-				
102185 Receipt and review of AAIC's		84.0	0 9443		
Motion for Summary Judgment.					
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	1-				
102188 Correspondence from Grodner		14.0	00 9443		
regarding exhibits and PTO.					
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00		12.00	0.4.40		
102191 Email to Grodner regarding		42.00	9443		
obejetions to PTO.					
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 102192 Review of legal memorandum		56.0	00 9443		
102192 Review of legal memorandum		50.	OU JATJ		
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00					
102193 Discussed legal issues with LSB		14.0	0 9443		

Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102197 Correspondence with Grodner	14.00 9443
regarding exhibits. Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102200 Receipt and review of letter from Grodner regarding exhibits.	14.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 102204 Discussed legal issues with LSB	42.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 102205 Review of Plaintiff's dropbox.	56.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102212 Emails from Grodner regarding exhibits and PTO.	14.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102214 Discussed legal issues with LSB	14.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 0.80 Hrs X 60.00 102215 Draft research memo	48.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.17 Hrs X 60.00 102216 Draft research memo on	70.20 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.75 Hrs X 60.00 102219 Research	165.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 102352 Telephone call from James	75.00 9443
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014	
	Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance	Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Purpera regarding email Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 102353 Email to and from Maldonado	30.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 102357 Email from Jenna	75.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 150.00 102360 Telephone call to Blanchfield regarding deposition of Ed Preau	45.00 9443
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	

102363 Review of legal research on		75.00	9443	
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.60 Hrs X 150.00 102364 Review of legal research on		90.00	9443	
Feb 13/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 102367 Review of insurance attorney; motion for summary judgment; assign task to paralegal		150.00	9443	
Feb 13/2014 Expense Recovery 102966 Postage - to COC filing ARBD's Motion for Release of Funds plus return envelope	X1756	2.93	9443	
Feb 13/2014 Expense Recovery 102967 Postage - to COC filing ARBD's Opposition to Sheriff's Motion to Deposit Funds in the	X1756	2.45	9443	
Registry of the Court plus				
return envelope Feb 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 6.00 Hrs X 60.00 102220 Analyze		360.00	9443	
Feb 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102224 Email from Grodner regarding exhibits.		14.00	9443	
Feb 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 102228 Receipt and review of revised PTO from Grodner.		42.00	9443	
Feb 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102229 Correspondence with Grodner regarding objection to PTO.		28.00	9443	
Feb 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102230 Email from Grodner regarding objections to ARBC's exhibits.		14.00	9443	
Feb 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 Jun/11/2014 Banks Client	ston & Assoc Ledger			Page: 520
Date Received From/Paid To Ch	10 To May/ 1 q# C		Bld	Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Repts	Disbs Fees	Inv# Acc Rcpts	Disbs
102232 Email from Kellogg regarding PTO.		14.00	9443	
Feb 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102234 Email from Blanchfield.		14.00 94	443	
Feb 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.00 Hrs X 140.00 102237 Prepared Exhibits for trial. Feb 14/2014 ARBD		420.00 94	143	
102326 PMT - For Services Rendered	06032 101	08.00		

Feb 14/2014 ARBD 102327 PMT - For Services Rendered	06032	466.94				
Feb 14/2014 ARBD 102328 PMT - For Services Rendered	06032	12000.00				
Feb 14/2014 ARBD 102329 PMT - For Services Rendered	06032	2267.40				
Feb 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 5.00 Hrs X 150.00 102375 Work on exhibits; review with			750.00	9443		
associate Feb 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 102240 Preparation of trial exhibit book.			280.00	9443		
Feb 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102241 Email to Grodner regarding exhibit book.			28.00	9443		
Feb 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102242 Email to Toni regarding			14.00	9443		
Feb 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 102384 Meeting with associate in preparation of exhibit			225.00	9443		
documents Feb 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00						
102385 Email PTO to Dietmar Feb 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.20 Hrs X 150.00			30.00	9443		
102386 Review of amended PTO			180.00	9443		
Feb 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 102387 Further review of exhibits			225.00	9443		
Feb 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 102388 Draft letter to Donna Grodner with exhibit stipulations			75.00	9443		
Feb 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00			150.00	0.4.42		
102389 Review of case law of			150.00	9443		
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.05 Hrs X 60.00 102380 Draft opposition to motion for summary judgment to dismiss			63.00	9443		
insurer from suit. Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.05 Hrs X 60.00						
102381 Draft proposed jury instructions.		1	183.00 94	143		
	Ledger	ssociates, L.	L.C.			Page: 521
Date Received From/Paid To Cho		General -		Bld -	Tı	rust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Repts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 102395 Email from Grodner regarding exhibits.			14.00	9443		
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00						

	28.0	00 9443	
102396 Review of specific exhibits	28.0	00 9443	
that Grodner opposed.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	20	.00 9443	
102397 Email to Grodner regarding	28	.00 9443	
exhibits.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00			
102398 Reviewed Donna's First Amended		28.00 9443	
PTO.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00			
102399 Prepared letter to Grodner	42.0	00 9443	
regarding PTO and authenticity			
of exhibits.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00			
102400 Revised letter to Grodner	14.0	0 9443	
regarding PTO and			
authenticity of exhibits.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00			
102401 Correspondence with Grodner		28.00 9443	
	- ,		
regarding ARBC Exhibit Book.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14	00 9443	
102402 Email to Brittany regarding	17.	00 9113	
exhibit list.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		14.00 9443	
102406 Receipt and review of Motion to		14.00 9443	
Enroll Ashly Earl.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		14.00 9443	
102410 Email from Grodner regarding		14.00 9443	
our exhibits.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00		14.00 0442	
102417 Correspondence with Grodner		14.00 9443	
regarding writ exhibits.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00		2000 0442	
102422 Discussed legal issues with LSB	300 L	28.00 9443	
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00			
102423 Correspondence with Grodner		14.00 9443	
regarding writ attachments.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00			
102429 Review of legal research	14.0	00 9443	
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00			
102432 Email from Grodner regarding		14.00 9443	
filings.			
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00			
	on & Associates, L.L.C.	Pa	age: 522
Client L			
	To May/ 1/2014		
	# General	Bld Trust	Activity
Date Received From/Faid To			•
	Repts Disbs F	Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts D	isbs
Balance			
Datanec			

102442 Review and calendar date for hearing; assign task to	37.50 9443
associate Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 102444 Receipt and review of email; review of documents; assign task to associate	225.00 9443
Feb 17/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 102449 Receipt and review of Notice of Ashly Earl added as additional counsel	75.00 9443
Feb 17/2014 Expense Recovery 102972 Postage - Writ and cd containing exhibits to D.Grodner	2.24 9443
Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 102474 Review	42.00 9443
Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 102475 Discussed legal isues with LSB	28.00 9443
Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.20 Hrs X 140.00 102480 Began preparing jury charges and legal research	308.00 9443
Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 102484 Discussed legal issues with LSB	70.00 9443
Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 102485 Legal research regarding	98.00 9443
Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.90 Hrs X 140.00 102486 Preparation of jury instructions.	266.00 9443
Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.50 Hrs X 60.00 102488 Draft opposition to motion for summary judgment to dismiss claims against insurer AAIC.	150.00 9443
Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.25 Hrs X 60.00 102489 Analyze	135.00 9443
Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00	20.00 0442
102505 Email from Grodner regarding Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Asso Client Ledger	
Nov/ 1/2010 To May Date Received From/Paid To Chq#	/ 1/2014 General Bld Trust Activity
	Transferring

riot/Dublic/2000 accorde/2/00 accorde/2/0014 OK 16/2/001046_Client/2/001 Adoer tvt[6/16/2014 0-40-50 AM]

Entry # Explanation R Balance	ec# Rcpts	Disbs Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
writ application Feb 18/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 15 102507 Work on jury instructions; verdict form	0.00	375.00	9443		
Feb 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 14 102564 Legal research regarding	0.00	210.00	9443		
Feb 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 14 102565 Prepared draft of jury verdict form.	0.00	84.00	9443		
Feb 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs X 14 102566 Prepared additional jury instructions regarding	0.00	154.00	9443		
millage, Bond Commission, powers and dutes of ARBD.					
Feb 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 102572 Discussed legal issues with LS		14.0	0 9443		
Feb 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 102577 Receipt and review of proposed judgment from Eddington.		14.00	0 9443		
Feb 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140 102578 Revised jury instructions. Feb 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140		210.00	9443		
102579 Legal research	5.00	14.00	9443		
Feb 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140 102580 Correspondence with Collarini	0.00	14.00	9443		
Feb 19/2014 Lawyer: LSB 5.00 Hrs X 15 102664 Work on jury charges; verdict form and instructions		750.00	9443		
Feb 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140 102594 Receipt and review of Supreme Court decision.	0.00	14.00	0 9443		
Feb 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140 102595 Discussed legal issues with LSI	0.00 3	70.00	9443		
Feb 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140 102596 Telephone conference with Jun/11/2014 B	0.00 ankston & Assoc	28.00 ciates, L.L.C.	9443		Page: 524

Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Chg# |----- General -----|

Date	Received From/P	aid To	Chq#	General		Bld -	Т	rust Activity
Entry # Balance	Explanation	Rec#		Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
	Blanchfield regard instructions and ve							
Feb 20/20	14 Lawyer: JHL	0.20 Hrs X 140.0	0					
102599	Correspondence	e with Blanchfield			28.00) 9443		
	egarding verdict for	orm amd judy						
Fab 20/20	charges. 14 Lawyer: JHL	0.10 Hrs X 140.0	00					
102600	Email from Co	llarini regarding			14.00	9443		
A								
Feb 20/20	14 Lawyer: JHL	0.10 Hrs X 140.0	00		14.00	9443		
10260 Fab 20/20	1 Revised jury ve 14 Lawyer: JHL	o 10 Hrs X 140.0	00		14.00	7113		
102602	2 Review of Doc	ket Report.			14.00	9443		
Feb 20/20	14 Lawyer: JHL	1.50 Hrs X 140.0	00		210.00	0442		
10260	3 Legal research				210.00	9443		
Feb 20/20	14 Lawyer: JHL	2.50 Hrs X 140.0	00			0.1.12		
10260	4 Preparation of	jury verdict			350.00	9443		
Eab 20/20	form and jury cha- 14 Lawyer: JHL	rges. 0.20 Hrs X 140 (00					
10261	Receipt and rev	view of Motion	, 0		28.00	9443		
	Incorporated Mem	orandum and						
	Objection to ARB	D Inserts						
	Filed. 14 Lawyer: PL-	2 2.30 Hrs X 60.0	0					
10263	 Review deposit 	tions and			138.00	9443		
	Louisiana case lav							
	plaintiff in motion to exclude expert							
	testimony.	Williess						
Feb 20/20	14 Lawyer: PL-		0			0.1.10		
10263	 Research finali by court of appeal 				33.00	9443		
	of writ of certiorar							
	supreme court.							
	14 Lawyer: PL-		0		00.00	0442		
	2 Draft ex-parte for release of funds				90.00	9443		
	registry of the cou							
Feb 20/20	14 Lawyer: LSB	7.25 Hrs X 150.0	00		100= 55	0.1.10		
	5 Further work of				1087.50	9443		
	verdict form; telep to state attorney; to							
	call to N.O. defens							
	further revise; rese							

Jun/11/2014 Date Received From/Paid	Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To M To Chq#	General	· '	Page: 525 Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Balance	Rec# Repts	Disbs Fe	es Inv# Acc Ro	pts Disbs
Feb 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0. 103096 Revised Jury Instruents added additional instruction and the company of the c	uctions and ructions nd	112.0	00 9443	
terms. Feb 21/2014 Clerk of Court			0.440	
102617 Filing Fee-Jury In and Verdict Form	structions 8112	5.00	9443	
Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2 102633 Draft memorandur ex-parte motion and of	n in support of	13	35.00 9443	
release of funds held registry of the court.	in			
Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 4 102634 Analyze	.60 Hrs X 60.00	276.00	0 9443	
Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0. 102637 Receipt and review Plaintiff's jury instruc	v of	84.00	9443	
and verdict form. Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0. 102648 Phone call to Cath regarding concursus.		42.0	0 9443	
Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0. 102649 Reviewed and revi motion to release fund	sed exparte	126	.00 9443	
Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0 102650 Discussed legal iss	20 Hrs X 140.00	28	.00 9443	
Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0. 102651 Receipt and review from Grodner to Field	of letter	14.00	9443	

14.00 9443

regarding writ app exhibits.
Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

102652 Email to Brittany Ling

regarding writ app exhibits. Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.70 Hrs X 140.00 238.00 9443 102660 Preparation of Motion to Dimiss Concursus Proceeding, Rule to Show Cause, and Memorandum in Support. Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 Feb 21/2014 Page: 526 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Jun/11/2014 Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Bld |----- Trust Activity Chq# |---- General -----| Received From/Paid To Date Disbs Fees Inv# Acc **Rcpts** Disbs Rec# Repts Entry # Explanation Balance 102661 Began review of Plaintiff's 28.00 9443 opposition to exparte motion to release funds. Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 4.00 Hrs X 150.00 102687 Telephone call to Grodner and 600.00 9443 Percy on judgment; work on Ex Parte Motion; revisions to Ex Parte Motion Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 9443 102689 Review of material from James 60.00 Purpera Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 37.50 9443 102692 Review of Supreme Court decision; forward to client Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 30.00 9443 102694 Receipt and review of ARBD's Opposition to Motion to Deposit Funds Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 9443 15.00 102697 Calendar motions set for March Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 37.50 9443 102698 Telephone call to Drew Blanchfield Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 150.00 9443 102699 Receipt and review of plaintiff's opposition to ex parte motion Feb 21/2014 Expense Recovery 9443 0.69 X1756 102977 Postage - Letter and cd to Judge Fields re Jury Instructions Feb 21/2014 Expense Recovery 9443 13.77 X1756 102978 Postage - to COC filing Jury Instructions (CM/RRR) plus return envelope Feb 21/2014 Expense Recovery 9443 1.82 102982 Postage - Copy to Judge Fields X1756

Feb 21/2014 Expense Recovery 102983 Postage - to COC filing Ex X1756	4.69 9443
Parte Motion to Release Funds	
plus return envelope	
Feb 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00	70.00 9443
103097 Prepared letter to Grodner	70.00 2443
regarding ex parte communications with Judge	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00	
102705 Revised Motion to Dismiss	98.00 9443
Concursus Proceeding and	ociates L.L.C. Page: 527
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Ass Client Ledger	ociates, L.L.C.
Nov/ 1/2010 To May	7/ 1/2014
	- General Bld Trust Activity
Date Received Homerata	D'I
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Balance	
prepared exhibits for filing.	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
102707 Email from Blanchfield	14.00 9443
regarding plaintiff's exhibits.	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9443
102708 Correspondence with co-counsel	14.00 9443
and opposing counsel regarding pretrial order.	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00	
102712 Prepared letter to Judge Fields	98.00 9443
regarding Plaintiff's exhibits.	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	20.00
102723 Receipt and review of jury	28.00 9443
interrogatories from Blanchfield.	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00	
102724 Preparation of proposed	42.00 9443
judgment regarding partial	
summary judgments.	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
102734 Email to all counsel regarding proposed judgment.	14.00 9443
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.50 Hrs X 60.00	
102743 Review Louisiana case law cited	90.00 9443
by plaintiff in motion in	50.00 5115
limine to exclude expert	
witness testimony,	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.35 Hrs X 60.00	
102744 Research	141.00 9443
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.75 Hrs X 60.00	
102745 Draft opposition to plaintiffs	105.00 9443