motion in limine to exclude expert fees witness testimony.					
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.05 Hrs X 60.00					
102746 Review deposition testimony			63.00	9443	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00			112.50	9443	
102751 Revise concursus motion			112.30	9443	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 102753 Receipt and review of letter			37.50	9443	
from State regarding adopting			5,100		
verdict and jury instructions					
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00					
102755 Review of letter to judge			37.50 94	143	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00			30.00	9443	
102756 Receipt and review of email			30.00	7443	
from Livingston Sheriff Jun/11/2014 Banks	ston & Assoc	ciates, L.L	.C.		Page: 528
	Ledger	, 212			· ·
	10 To May/	1/2014			
	iq# (General		Bld	Trust Activity
	Donto	Diaha	Foos	Inv# Acc Repts	Disbs
	Repts	Disos	rees	mv# Acc Repts	Disus
Balance					
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00					
102757 Receipt and review of proposed			37.50	9443	
judgment; email to Jenna Linn					
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00		20	00 044	•	
102760 Calendar writ date		30	0.00 9443	3	
Feb 24/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.75 Hrs X 150.00 102763 Work on motions in limine			412.50	9443	
Feb 25/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 5.80 Hrs X 60.00			112.00		
102768 Draft opposition to motion of			348.00	9443	
plaintiff class to exclude					
testimony of expert witnesses.					
Feb 25/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs X 60.00			120.00	0442	
102769 Research			120.00	9443	
Feb 25/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00					
102808 Review of email from Donna			75.00	9443	
Feb 25/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.25 Hrs X 150.00					
102809 Work on trial questions for			337.50	9443	
witnesses					
Feb 25/2014 Expense Recovery	71756	0.4	10	9443	
102988 Postage - Letter to Judge Fields Feb 26/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs X 60.00	K1756	0.2	+0	9443	
102810 Research			180.00	9443	
102010 Resourch					
The state of the s					

Feb 26/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140 102825 Prepared Opposition to Plaintiffs' Motion & Objection	210.00 9443
to ARBD Pretrial Inserts. Feb 26/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140 102827 Email correspondence with Maldonado	14.00 9443
Feb 26/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150 102853 Telephone call to D.	0.00 375.00 9443
Blanchfield regarding deposition; telephone call to Dietmar preparation of questions for DOTD witnesses	
Feb 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 7.00 Hrs X 60 102867 Draft opposition to plaintiffs memorandum in support of	420.00 9443
motion in limine to exclude Jun/11/2014 B	ankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 529
C	ient Ledger
	1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Cha# General Bld Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq# General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Re	c# Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
testimony of experts on cooperative endeavor agreements, Capital Outlay process, and tax propositions.	
Feb 27/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140 102878 Phone call from Rachel Flarity regarding fairness hearing.	42.00 9443
Feb 27/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140 102881 Revised Opposition to Plaintiff's Objection to Exhibits and prepared exhibits to be filed.	56.00 9443
Feb 27/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140 102884 Letter to Court regarding Opposition to Objection to ARBD's exhibits.	.00 28.00 9443
Feb 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150 102911 Review of opposition to plaintiff's motion concerning our exhibits	75.00 9443
Feb 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150 102912 Preparation for fairness hearing Feb 27/2014 Expense Recovery	.00 150.00 9443
102995 Postage - to COC filing ARBD's Opposition plus return envelope	X1756 8.19 9443
Feb 27/2014 Expense Recovery	

102996 Postage - Copy to Judge Fields X1756	2.87 9443
Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00	210.00 0442
102930 Fairness hearing at 19th JDC.	210.00 9443
Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00	210.00 9443
102936 Review of Plaintiff's jury	210.00
instructions and verdict form and determined objections.	
Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00	
102940 Legal research regarding	84.00 9443
Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00	
102941 Legal research regarding	70.00 9443
102741 Elegai research regulation	
Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.25 Hrs X 150.00	337.50 9443
102949 Work on objections to	337.30
plaintiff's jury charges and verdict form	
Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 6.35 Hrs X 60.00	
102951 Draft opposition to plaintiffs'	381.00 9443
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates	s, L.L.C. Page: 530
Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/20	14
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# Gene	
	141
Entry # Explanation Rec# Repts Dis	sbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
	sbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis	sbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis	bbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion	bbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis	sbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery	sbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00	9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00	9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express	9443 225.00 9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express	9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner Feb 28/2014 American Express 105014 ARBD 1099.30	9443 225.00 9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner Feb 28/2014 American Express 105014 ARBD 1099.30 Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery	9443 225.00 9443 099.30 9800 9800
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner Feb 28/2014 American Express 105014 ARBD 1099.30 Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103027 Photocopies - 5211 BW @ \$0.10 X1758	9443 225.00 9443 099.30 9800
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner Feb 28/2014 American Express 105014 ARBD 1099.30 Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103027 Photocopies - 5211 BW @ \$0.10 X1758 each	9443 225.00 9443 099.30 9800 9800
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner Feb 28/2014 American Express 105014 ARBD 1099.30 Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103027 Photocopies - 5211 BW @ \$0.10 X1758 each Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery	9443 225.00 9443 099.30 9800 9800 521.10 9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner 105014 ARBD 1099.30 Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103027 Photocopies - 5211 BW @ \$0.10 X1758 each Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103028 Photocopies - 817 color copies X1758 @ \$0.15 each	9443 225.00 9443 099.30 9800 9800 521.10 9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner 105014 ARBD 1099.30 Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103027 Photocopies - 5211 BW @ \$0.10 X1758 each Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103028 Photocopies - 817 color copies X1758 @ \$0.15 each Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00	9443 225.00 9443 099.30 9800 9800 521.10 9443 122.55 9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner 105014 ARBD 1099.30 Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103027 Photocopies - 5211 BW @ \$0.10 X1758 each Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103028 Photocopies - 817 color copies X1758 @ \$0.15 each Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00 103070 Prepared objection to	9443 225.00 9443 099.30 9800 9800 521.10 9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner 105014 ARBD 1099.30 Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103027 Photocopies - 5211 BW @ \$0.10 X1758 each Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103028 Photocopies - 817 color copies X1758 @ \$0.15 each Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00 103070 Prepared objection to Plaintiff's Geberal Charge to	9443 225.00 9443 099.30 9800 9800 521.10 9443 122.55 9443
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Dis Balance memorandum in support of motion in limine to exclude expert witness testimony. Feb 28/2014 Expense Recovery 103000 Parking X1757 2.00 Feb 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103098 Attend fairness hearing Feb 28/2014 American Express 104973 Expenses - Jury Lunch/Dinner 105014 ARBD 1099.30 Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103027 Photocopies - 5211 BW @ \$0.10 X1758 each Mar 3/2014 Expense Recovery 103028 Photocopies - 817 color copies X1758 @ \$0.15 each Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00 103070 Prepared objection to	9443 225.00 9443 099.30 9800 9800 521.10 9443 122.55 9443

103071 Prepared objection to Plaintiff's Special Jury				238.00	9443		
Charges. Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.80 Hrs 103072 Prepared Objection to Plaintiff's Jury Verdict Form				112.00	9443		
Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 103073 Letter to the court regard proposed judgment.	X 140.00 ing			28.00	9443		
Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs 103076 Review of Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion in Limine regarding expert testimony.	X 140.00			70.00	9443		
Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 6.50 Hrs 103263 Attend deposition of Ed I and preparation with Ed	Preau			975.0	0 9570		
Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.75 Hrs 103447 Draft opposition to motion limine to exclude expert witnesses.	s X 60.00 on in			165.00	9570		
Mar 3/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 0.75 Hrs 103448 Draft opposition to motio summary judgment dismissi liability of insurer, AAIC.	n for			45.00	9570		
Mar 4/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.50 Hrs 103311 Revisions to Opposition	X 150.00 to			525.00	9570		
Plaintiff's Jury Instructions	Danle	ton Pr Acc	sociates, L	I C			Page: 531
Jun/11/2014		Ledger	ociaics, L.	.D.C.			
	Nov/ 1/20		/ 1/2014				
	NOV/ 1/20	10 10 Ma	- General		Bld -	Т	rust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Cr	iq#	- Ochciai	100			
Entry # Explanation Balance	Rec#					Rcpts	Disbs
and Verdict Form							
Mar 5/2014 Billing on Invoice 9443	3						
103104 FEES 29330.30 DISBS 855.37			0.00	9	443		
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs 103267 Revised Opposition to Plaintiff's Jury Charges and Verdict Form.	X 140.00			84.00	9570		
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 103270 Letter to Court regarding objections to Plaintiff's Jury Charges and Verdict Form.				28.00	9570		
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs 103271 Review				56.00	0 9570		
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs 103272 Revised Opposition to				140.00	9570		
Plaintiff's Motion in Limine							

4-0/2019 aguset/2014 06 16%201046-Client%20Ledger.txt[6/16/2014 9:49:59 AM]

regarding experts.					
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 103312 Further revisions of Opposition	,	11	2.50 0570		
		1.1	2.50 9570		
to verdict form and jury charges Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.00 Hrs X 150.00					
103317 Revise memo in support of		300	0.00 9570		
experts		300	7.00 9370		
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00)				
103318 Calendar motion to continue		1.5	.00 9570		
trial date					
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00					
103319 Calendar various outstanding		15	.00 9570		
motions and exceptions for					
March 17, 2014; copy to client					
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00					
103326 Calendar Motion to Strike		15.0	00 9570		
Exhibits					
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00					
103327 Calendar Motion on Prescription		1	5.00 9570		
and Partial Summary Judgment					
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00		1.5	00 0570		
103328 Calendar Motion to Release		15	.00 9570		
Funds in Registry of Court Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00					
103329 Receipt and review of Judgment			37.50 9570		
of Final Approval of Settlement			77.50		
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00					
103331 Final review of objections		75.0	0 9570		
concerning experts					
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00					
103332 Receipt and review of AAIC Jury			37.50 9570		
Jun/11/2014 Bank	ston & As	sociates, L.L.C.			Page: 532
	Ledger				
		y/ 1/2014			
	hq#	General	Bld	T	rust Activity
		D'I E	T	Donto	Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Repts	Disbs Fe	ees Inv# Acc	Repis	DISOS
Balance				1.40	
Charge regrence					
Charge response Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00					
103333 Telephone call to John		75.00	9570		
Maginnis; Jeremy Alford					
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs X 60.00					
103449 Review insurance policies		180.0	00 9570		
issued by AAIC and coverages					
under "wrongful acts"					
Mar 5/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs X 60.00			00 0550		
103450 Draft opposition to motion for		180	.00 9570		
summary judgment dismissing					
liability of insurer, AAIC.					
Mar 5/2014 Expense Recovery	762	1.17	9570		
104290 Postage - to COC filing X1	763	1.17	7570		

judgment (plus return envelope)						
Mar 5/2014 Expense Recovery 104291 Postage - Copy to Judge Fields	X1763		0.48	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Clerk of Court	20	5.00		9570		
103293 Filing Fee-Objections 81 Mar 6/2014 Clerk of Court	28	5.00		9370		
103347 Filing Fees 8141		10.00	957	0		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103355 Preparation of Opposition to AAIC's MSJ.			28.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103356 Email correspondence with Kellogg regarding jury instructions.			14.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.60 Hrs X 140.00 103357 Prepared request for subpoena issuance for all witnesses.			224.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103358 Letter to Court regarding filings.			28.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103359 Revised Opposition to AAIC's MSJ.			42.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103360 Letter to the Court regarding Opposition to AAIC's MSJ.			28.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103367 Email to Blanchfield regarding subpoena to Hugh Martin.			14.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103368 Revised subpoena request.			14.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103371 Discussed trial preparation with LSB.			28.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00						Dagg. 522
	ston & Asso Ledger	ociates, L.	L.C.			Page: 533
	10 To May				_	
Date Received From/Paid To Cl	nq#	General -		Bld	Tr	ust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance	•	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
103372 Receipt and review of petition in intervention.			14.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103374 Correspondence from the Corps regarding meeting w Duplantier.			14.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 103392 Work on the issuance of subpoenas for trial			150.00	9570		
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 103397 Review and revise draft			150.00	9570		

opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment by AAIC Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 103399 Revise subpoena letter Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00	112.50 9570 112.50 9570
103404 Review of motion and order of intervention Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 103405 Email to Bobby	30.00 9570
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 103406 Email to Dietmar and Toni	30.00 9570
Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 103410 Review of plaintiff's opposition to Motion for	112.50 9570
Summary Judgment Mar 6/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 103411 Receipt and review of email	30.00 9570
Mar 6/2014 Expense Recovery 104293 Postage - Letter to COC X1763 requesting subpoenas	0.48 9570
Mar 6/2014 Expense Recovery 104294 Postage - Copy to Judge Fields X176	63 0.48 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 3.00 Hrs X 60.00 103418 sort through Oppositions and Exhibits filed by plaintiff	180.00 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.30 Hrs X 60.00 103419 talk with JHL regarding	18.00 9570
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Client Ledg	Associates, L.L.C. Page: 534
Nov/ 1/2010 To	May/ 1/2014
	General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcp Balance	The Repts Disbs
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.30 Hrs X 60.00 103420 begin trial preparation of Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 103421 Trial Preparation.	18.00 9570
to the second se	56.00 9570

Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 14 103422 Receipt and Review of Donna Objections to our jury charges	
and verdict form.	
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 14	0.00
103423 Receipt and review of Donna'	56.00 9570
Opposition to AAIC's MSJ.	
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.30 Hrs X 14	
103424 Legal research regarding	182.00 9570
7/2014	
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14	
103425 Email correspondence with	28.00 9570
Eddington regarding claims by	
plaintiff.	00
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs X 14 103426 Prepared letter to each witness	
regarding trial.	154.00 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14	00
103427 Emails from Grodner.	14.00 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14	
103428 Email from St. Pierre regardin	14.00 9570
opposition to dismissal of	14.00 7370
concursus.	
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14	.00
103430 Receipt and review of letter	14.00 9570
from Grodner regarding	
personal liability of board	
members.	
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14	00
103431 Receipt and review of	14.00 9570
settlement offer from Grodner.	
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14	
103437 Returned Dietmar's phone call.	14.00 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140	
103438 Email to Dietmar regarding	14.00 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 14	
103439 Review of State's exhibits.	28.00 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140	
103440 Email to Grodner regarding	28.00 9570
exhibits attached to pleadings	
filed on 3/6/14.	nkston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 535
	nkston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 535 ent Ledger
	/2010 To May/ 1/2014
	Chq# General Bld Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Cliq# General Blu Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Re	# Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Balance	Tepts Bisss Fees III The Repts Bisss
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140	00
103441 Receipt and review of Donna's	98.00 9570

Opposition to Exception of Prescription. Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 103442 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's Opposition to Exception of Prescription and Opposition to Motion to	140.00 9570
Release Funds. Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs X 60.00 103453 Draft opposition to motion for summary judgment dismissing	120.00 9570
liability of insurer, AAIC. Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 103457 Review of exhibits filed by plaintiff in AAIC's Motion for Summary Judgment	112.50 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 103459 Receipt and review of email from East Baton Rouge Sheriff regarding concursus	30.00 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 103460 Letter from Grodner regarding liability of individual board members	37.50 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 103462 Receipt and review of settlement offer; forward to Dietmar	30.00 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 103463 Review DOTD exhibits	75.00 9570
Mar 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103468 Review of pleadings file; review of opposition and	225.00 9570
various exhibits in support filed by plaintiff	
Mar 7/2014 Expense Recovery 104296 Postage - Letters to trial witnesses (25 x \$0.48)	12.00 9570
Mar 8/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 150.00 103507 Review of plaintiff's opposition to prescription	262.50 9570
Mar 8/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 103508 Review of documents for Duplantier meeting	150.00 9570
Mar 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103445 Correspondence with Kellogg regarding trial.	14.00 9570
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Ass Client Ledger	
	- General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Balance	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

FE/16/2014 0-40-50 AMT

Mar 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14 00 9570
102446 Receipt and review of	14.00 9570
correspondence and additional	
avhibite from Grodner.	
Mor. 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00	225.00 9570
102503 Work on questions for Duplantie	223.00 9370
Mar 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00	150.00 9570
103504 Review of plaintiff's	150.00 9570
Opposition to Motion to	
Release Funds in the Registry	
of the Court	
Mar 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	75.00 9570
103505 Review of Motion for Summary	75.00
Judgment opposition filed by	
plaintiff	
Mar 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00	112.50 9570
103506 Review of plaintiff's	112.30
Opposition to Exception of	
Prescription	
Mar 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9570
104491 Correspondence from USACE	11.00
regarding Dunlantier meeting.	
Mar 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9570
103469 Email from Grodner regarding	
exhibits.	
Mar 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00	56.00 9570
103474 Review of Plaintiff's	
Opposition to Motion to	
Dismiss Concursus Proceeding.	
Mar 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103475 Phone call from Pam Mixon w LA	14.00 9570
1034/5 Phone call from Fall Whom w 12/1	
legislative auditor regarding	
pretrial meeting. Mar 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
103476 Email to Wayne and Dan	14.00 9570
1034/6 Email to wayne and Dan	
Mar 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
103478 Receipt and review of LPSO's	14.00 9570
Motion to Deposit Funds.	
Mar 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
103479 Updated table of tax deposits.	14.00 9570
Mar 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
103480 Receipt and review of LPSO's	14.00 9570
Opposition to Motion to	
Dismiss Concursus Proceeding.	
Mar 10/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
103481 Receipt and review of EBRSO's	14.00 9570
Opposition to Motion to	
Dismiss Concursus Proceeding.	
	sociates, L.L.C.
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & As Client Ledger	
Nov/ 1/2010 To Ma	y/ 1/2014
1101/ 1/2010 10	

Page: 537

Entry # Balance		Rec# Rcpt	s Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
		7 1 40 00					
103484	14 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 2 Receipt and review of subprequest for Hugh Martin.	ooena		14.00	9570		
Mar 10/20	14 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 2 Phone call to Fred Chevalid	X 140.00 er		14.00	9570		
103490	14 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 2 Email correspondence with Lauren Ellis from Chevalier's	X 140.00		14.00	9570		
Mar 10/20 103492	office regarding trial. 114 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 2 Email to Chevalier regarding trial.	X 140.00 ng		14.00	9570		
103495	114 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 2 Email correspondence with Chevalier regarding motion in	1		14.00	9570		
	limine.						
103501	14 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 2 Email correspondence fron Grodner regarding exhibits.	n		14.00	9570		
103512	114 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs 2 Arrange meeting with Dup 114 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs	lantier		37.5	0 9570		
103513	Receipt and review of state subpoena	2 130.00		30.00	9570		
Mar 10/20 103516	114 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs 1 5 Review of emails from Tor Guitrau			37.50	9570		
103518	14 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs B Email with settlement offer	r		30.00	9570		
103519	114 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs 10 Work on Bobby Duplanties deposition questions		,	375.00	9570		
Mar 10/20 103520	14 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs 2 Begin review of 1442 porti	ions		262.50	9570		
	14 Lawyer: PL-1 1.75 Hrs Exhibit index preparation	A 00.00		105.00	9570		
	14 Lawyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs Research	X 60.00		180.00 9	570		
103527	14 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs receipt and review of updates whibits, email to JHL			6.00	9570		
Mar 11/20 103528	regarding 14 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs call to DOTD, Delmar & Ko set pre-trial meeting; left			6.00	9570		

		1	m	es	SSE	ige
	-	 _				

Received From/Paid To

Jun/11/2014

Date

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger

---- General ----

Page: 538

Bld |---- Trust Activity

1.0/20D ------/2014 06 16%201046-Client%20Ledger.txt[6/16/2014 9:49:59 AM]

Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

Chq#

Fees Inv# Acc Disbs Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Rcpts Balance Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 103529 call with Tony Rouchon 6.00 9570 Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 103530 call to Mark Drennen to set 6.00 9570 pre-trial meeting, left message Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 103531 call to Terry Ryder to set 6.00 9570 pre-trial message; he will return my call Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 103532 call to Clo Fontenot to set 6.00 9570 pre-trial meeting, left message Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 103533 call to Chuck McMains to set 6.00 9570 pre-trial meeting, left message Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 103534 call to Martha Hess to set 6.00 9570 pre-trial meeting, will not be in office until Thursday, left message Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 6.00 9570 103535 call to Jeff David to set pre-trial meeting

Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 6.00 9570 103536 call from Chris Knotts, set pre-trial meeting for he and Delmar

Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 103537 call to Larry Ardoin to set 6.00 9570 pre-trial meeting Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00

6.00 9570 103538 call and e-mail to Blanchfield regarding pre-trial meeting with DOTD employees

Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 6.00 9570 103539 call to Lawrence Callendar to set pre-trial meeting

Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 103540 call from Mark Drennen to set 6.00 9570 pre-trial meeting

Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 9570 6.00 103541 call to James Purpera to set pre-trial meeting, left message

Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00 103548 begin for witness folder			6.00 9570		
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.30 Hrs X 60.00 103549 begin working on exhibit list			18.00 9570		D 520
	ston & Asso	ciates, L.	L.C.		Page: 539
	Ledger 10 To May/	1/2014			
			Bld -	Т	rust Activity
	ιηπ	Ochciai -	Did	11	rust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance	Repts	Disbs	Fees Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
with bates numbers, talk with					
JHL					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00					
103551 Reviewed and revised questions for Duplantier.			84.00 9570		
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00					
103552 Email to Grodner's office			14.00 9570		
regarding exhibits attached to					
pleadings filed.					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00					
103554 Review of objections to			56.00 9570		
Plaintiff's exhibits and necessary changes for exhibit					
meeting tomorrow.					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00					
103559 Receipt and review of			70.00 9570		
Plaintiff's revised exhibit					
list and noted objections.					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00					
103560 Email from Grodner regarding			56.00 9570		
issues with ARBC's exhibits,					
and reviewed our exhibits in					
connection with Plaintiff's					
objections.					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 103561 Preparation for exhibit meeting.			56.00 9570		
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00			50.00 5570		
103562 Correspondence with Fred			14.00 9570		
Chevalier.					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs X 140.00					
103563 Meeting with Jeff David.			154.00 9570		
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00					
103564 Phone call from Brian Eddington.			28.00 9570		
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00			28.00 9570		
103565 Discussed legal issues with LSB.			28.00 9570		
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.00 Hrs X 140.00			420.00 9570		
103566 Preparation for exhibit index			5.00		
and exhibit books. Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00					
103569 Correspondence with Wayne and			14.00 9570		
10000					

The second secon						
Dan	¥ 140 00					
103570 Receipt and review	7 140.00			14.00	9570	
	X 140.00					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 103571 Review of order regarding				14.00	9570	
deadline to file writ				1		
application re denial of MSJ						
in concursus proceeding.	Danles	ton Pr Ass	osistas I I	C		Page: 540
Jun/11/2014		Ledger	ociates, L.L	.c.		rage. 340
		10 To May	/ 1/2014			
Date Received From/Paid To			General		Bld	Trust Activity
 	D #	D	D'ala	Б	Insulf Ass Dont	Diaha
Entry # Explanation Balance	Кес#	Repts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc Repts	s Disbs
	1 7					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs	X 150.00			75.00	0570	
103691 Review of DOTD exhibits Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs	X 150.00			75.00	9570	
103692 Review of East Baton Rou				75.00	9570	
Parish Sheriff's Opposition to						
Motion to Dismiss Concursus	** * ** * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs 103693 Review of exhibits attached				60.00	9570	
opposition of prescription	u to			60.00	9370	
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs	X 150.00					
103694 Review of motion to depos				37.50	9570	
funds into registry by						
Livingston Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs	Y 150 00					
103695 Deposition preparation for				187.50	9570	
David						
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs 2						
103696 Telephone conference with				75.00	9570	
Dietmar						
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs 2	X 150.00					
103697 Review of Writ on Harris is				37.50	9570	
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs 2	X 150.00				0.550	
103698 Review of email to Donna Grodner from Jenna Linn				30.00	9570	
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs 2	X 150.00					
103700 Review of officers of comm				30.00	9570	
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs 2						
103702 Receipt and review of First				30.00	9570	
Circuit opinion on Harris	7 150 00					
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs 3 103703 Preparation for Bobby	150.00		2.2	25.00 9	570	
Duplantier's trial preparation						
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs >						
103704 Review of 1442 of DOTD r	edacted			225.	00 9570	
portion						

Mar. 11/2014 Lavarian DI 2 2 00 Hrs V 60	000						
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs X 60 103796 Index).00			180.0	00 9570		
Mar 11/2014 Expense Recovery 104298 Postage - Letter to J. Terry Ryder at new address	X176	53	0.48		9570		
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140 104492 Email to Plaintiff regarding objections to exhibits.	0.00			42.00	9570		
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140 104493 Receipt and review of notice of judgments from the First Circuit regarding P's writ application.	0.00			28.00	9570		
	anksto	n & Asso	ociates, L.I	C.			Page: 541
Cl	ient Le	edger					
		To May	/ 1/2014 General	[Rid I-	Tı	ust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Cliq		General		Did -		ustrictivity
Entry # Explanation Red Balance	c#]	Rcpts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
Mar 11/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150	0.00						
104514 Meeting with Jeff David	3.00			150.00	9570		
Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs X 60	.00				0.550		
103604 further preparation of exhibits				24.00	9570		
for trial Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60	.00						
103609 call with Terry Ryder to set				6.00	9570		
pre-trial meeting							
Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140 103621 Trial preparation-preparation	0.00			140.00	9570		
of exhibits.				140.00	7370		
Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140	.00				41		
103624 Phone call from Jerry Jones.				14.00	9570		
Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs X 140 103626 Prepared direct examination	.00			154.00	9570		
questions for Jeff David.				154.00	7370		
Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.40 Hrs X 140	.00						
103627 Reviewed Jenifer Schaye's				196.00	9570		
deposition, reviewed Micahel Cragin's deposition, and							
prepared direct examination							
questions for representatives							
of the Legislative Auditor's							
Office. Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140	.00						
103628 Trial preparation.			28.0	00 9570)		
Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140	.00			28.00	0570		
103629 Receipt and review of Donna's				28.00	9570		
writ application regarding Jay Harris.							
Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.	.00						
103630 Preparation for exhibit meeting				84.00	9570		

20020 9.0/20Wata-0/20Conservation 9/20District/Dublic 9/20Records 9/20Remuest/2014.06.16% 201046-Client% 20Ledger.txt [6/16/2014 9:49:59 AM]

with Plaintiffs. Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 103633 Began preparing direct examination questions for Tony	140.00	28.00	9570	
Rouchon. Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.00 Hrs X 103634 Meeting with Grodner regard exhibit authenticity.		420.0	00 9570	
Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.00 Hrs X 103635 Trial preparation, review of all discovery in connection	40.00	420.00	9570	
with Plaintiff's objections to exhibits. Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.25 Hrs X 103705 Travel to New Orleans and return to Baton Rouge for	50.00	337.50	9570	
witness preparation Jun/11/2014	Bankston & Associa	tes, L.L.C.		Page: 542
	Client Ledger			
	/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2	2014	Bld	Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq# Ge	nerai	Did	Trast Treet, 10
Entry # Explanation I			Inv# Acc Repts	Disbs
Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 103706 Attend witness preparation of Bobby Duplantier Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.75 Hrs X	50.00	262.50 412.5		
103708 Meeting with Grodner to reviewhibits Mar 12/2014 Expense Recovery	ew .	11.2.0		
103711 Mileage Reimbursement - Mi to New Orleans and return to Baton Rouge (135 miles x	leage X1761	76.28	9570	
\$0.565/mi) Mar 12/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.30 Hrs X 104494 complete sorting	50.00	18.00	9570	
Mar 13/2014 Amerson White, Inc. 103643 Deposition Costs - Invoice #13531VOS	8149	446.00	9570	
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 103644 add additional information to Bobby Duplaniter's witness file		6.00	9570	
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 103649 call from Chuck McMains regarding trial and testimony		6.00	9570	
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X of 103660 call from Chuck McMains regarding trial and testimony		6.00	9570	
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 1	40.00			

103682 Preparation for meeting w Dietmar and Toni.			56.00 9570		
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 7.70 Hrs X 140.00 103684 Meeting with Toni and Dietmar			1078.00 9570		
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103687 Correspondence with Brittany Ling regarding exhibits.			14.00 9570		
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103688 Receipt and review of Reply Memorandum in Support of AAIC MSJ.			28.00 9570		
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103689 Preparation for meeting with Tony Rouchon.			28.00 9570		
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: LSB 7.50 Hrs X 150.00 103712 Trial preparation for Toni and Dietmar			1125.00 9570		
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 103714 Review of Toni Rouchon's deposition.			140.00 9570	Posses	5.42
Jun/11/2014 Bank	ston & Asso	ciates, L.I	L.C.	Page:	543
Clien	Ledger				
Nov/ 1/20	10 To May	1/2014	pid I	Trust Act	tivity
Date Received From/Paid To C	hq#	General	Bid -	Tust Het	ivity
	_	D'ala	Fees Inv# Acc	Repts Disbs	S
Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance	Repts	Disbs			
Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103715 Preparation for ARBC meeting. Mar 13/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00			28.00 9570		
104495 add additional information to			6.00 9570		
Bobby Duplantier's witness file					
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00	r i				
103716 Prepared additional direct					
examination questions for			28.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye.			28.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00					
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB.			28.00 9570 28.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00					
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103718 Preparation for meeting with			28.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00			28.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103718 Preparation for meeting with Tony Rouchon Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00			28.00 9570 42.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103718 Preparation for meeting with Tony Rouchon Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 103721 Meeting with Tony Rouchon,			28.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103718 Preparation for meeting with Tony Rouchon Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00			28.00 9570 42.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103718 Preparation for meeting with Tony Rouchon Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 103721 Meeting with Tony Rouchon, Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103721 Meeting with Tony Rouchon, Dietmar, and Toni regarding			28.00 9570 42.00 9570 280.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103718 Preparation for meeting with Tony Rouchon Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 103721 Meeting with Tony Rouchon, Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103723 Receipt and review of notice of			28.00 9570 42.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103718 Preparation for meeting with Tony Rouchon Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 103721 Meeting with Tony Rouchon, Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103723 Receipt and review of notice of judgment of disposition from			28.00 9570 42.00 9570 280.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103718 Preparation for meeting with Tony Rouchon Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 103721 Meeting with Tony Rouchon, Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103723 Receipt and review of notice of judgment of disposition from First Circuit.			28.00 9570 42.00 9570 280.00 9570		
Jenifer Schaye. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103717 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103718 Preparation for meeting with Tony Rouchon Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 103721 Meeting with Tony Rouchon, Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103723 Receipt and review of notice of judgment of disposition from			28.00 9570 42.00 9570 280.00 9570		

103726 Receipt and Review of plaintiff's revised exhibits.	140.00 9570
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00	
103728 Correspondence with Grodner	56.00 9570
regarding exhibits.	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103729 Phone call from Jenifer	14.00 9570
Schaye's office regarding	71100
trial.	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9570
103730 Phone call from Dietmar	14.00 9370
[- 12 - 다음] - [- 12 - 12 - 12 - 12 - 12 - 1 기가 다양이 보고 됐는	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.40 Hrs X 140.00	
103733 Trial preparation.	336.00 9570
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00	
103747 check court connect	6.00 9570
email to JHL and LSB	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00	
103749 email to Grodner regarding	6.00 9570
subpoenas requested for trial	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00	(00 0570
103750 call to appeals court regarding	6.00 9570
response to writ Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Assoc	riates, L.L.C. Page: 544
Client Ledger	rage. 344
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1	1/2014
	General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Balance	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00	
103751 email to Martha Hess regarding	6.00 9570
meeting for pre-trial	
preparation	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00	6.00 9570
103752 email to Clo Fontenot regarding	6.00 9370
meeting for pre-trial	
perparation Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs X 60.00	
103754 check service on all witnesses	24.00 9570
that have been issued subpoenas	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00	
103755 call to court of appeals to	6.00 9570
inquiry which writ recently	
denied	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00	
103763 Receipt and review of writ	37.50 9570
application	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00	275.00 0570
103764 Meeting with legislative	375.00 9570

itors

Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 103768 Review of documents for trial Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.40 Hrs X 150.00 103768 Review of documents for trial Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 103771 Email from Chuck McMains Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.16 Hrs X 150.00 103773 Telephone call to David Hoover 37.50 9570 Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 103774 Receipt and review of opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment on insurance martters Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 103777 Review of DOTD production of documents Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.25 Hrs X 60.00 103779 Review of DOTD production of documents Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.25 Hrs X 60.00 103797 Review of DOTD production of documents Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.25 Hrs X 60.00 103797 Review of DOTD production of documents Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.25 Hrs X 60.00 103797 Review of DOTD production of documents Novi 1/2010 To May/1/2014 Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger Nov/1/2010 To May/1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld		
103765 Meeting with Tony Rouchon and 225.00 9570	Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.40 Hrs X 150.00 10376R Review of documents for trial Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 103771 Email from Chuck McMains Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 103773 Telephone call to David Hoover 37,50 9570 Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 103774 Receipt and review of opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment on insurance matters Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 103775 Review of Supreme Court Writ 150.00 9570 Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 150.00 103776 Review of DOTD production of documents Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JSB 1.75 Hrs X 150.00 103776 Review of DOTD production of documents Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger Nov/1/2010 To May/1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq#		225.00 9570
103768 Review of documents for trial 360.00 9570		
103768 Review of documents for trial 360.00 9570	M 14/2014 - L I SD 2 40 H V 150 00	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 15.00 15.00 9570		360.00 0570
103771		300.00 9370
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 103774 Receipt and review of opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment on insurance matters		15.00 9570
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 103774 Receipt and review of opoposition to Motion for Summary Judgment on insurance matters Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 103775 Review of Supreme Court Writ 150.00 9570 Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 150.00 103776 Review of DOTD production of 262.50 9570 Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 150.00 103797 Review 195.00 9570 Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, 98.00 9570 Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 104496 Receipt and review of Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq#		
103774 Receipt and review of opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment on insurance matters	103773 Telephone call to David Hoover	37.50 9570
103774 Receipt and review of opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment on insurance matters	Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs V 150 00	
opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment on insurance matters Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00		112.50 0570
Summary Judgment on insurance matters		112.50 9570
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 103775 Review of Supreme Court Writ 103776 Review of DOTD production of documents Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.25 Hrs X 60.00 103797 Review 195.00 9570 Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld Trust Activity Entry # Explanation Rec# Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs Balance Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiffs trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiffs trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiffs trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of 70.00 9570 Plaintiffs trial teleptions to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104490 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		
103775	The state of the s	
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: LSB 1.75 Hrs X 150.00 103776 Review of DOTD production of documents Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, Jun/11/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld Trust Activity Explanation Rec# Recpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs Balance Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's tojections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104490 Receipt and review of Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		
103776 Review of DOTD production of documents		150.00 9570
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.25 Hrs X 60.00 103797 Review 195.00 9570		262.50 0570
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld Trust Activity Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104490 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		202.30 9370
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld Trust Activity Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104490 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570	Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 3.25 Hrs X 60.00	
104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld Trust Activity	103797 Review	195.00 9570
104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld Trust Activity		
104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony, Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld Trust Activity	Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: IHI 0.70 Hrs V 140.00	
Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 545	104496 Meeting with D. Thompson, Tony	98.00 9570
Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld Trust Activity		
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General Bld Trust Activity Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiffs trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of 70.00 9570 Plaintiffs objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		
Entry # Explanation Rec# Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs Balance Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		# General Bld Trust Activity
Balance Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of 28.00 9570 Plaintiffs trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of 70.00 9570 Plaintiffs objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		Pents Dishs Foos Inv# Aca Pents Dishs
Dietmar, and Toni regarding Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		Repts Disos rees lilv# Acc Repts Disos
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		X
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		
104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 28.00 9570 28.00 9570 28.00 9570 14.00 9570	Dietmar, and Toni regarding	
104497 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 28.00 9570 28.00 9570 28.00 9570 14.00 9570	Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: 1HI 0 20 Hrs V 140 00	
Plaintiff's trial subpoenas. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of 70.00 9570 Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570	104497 Receipt and review of	28.00 9570
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104498 Receipt and review of 70.00 9570 Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		26.00 7570
Plaintiff's objections to ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570	Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00	
ARBC's exhibits. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		70.00 9570
Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		
104499 Prepared letter to Supreme 28.00 9570 Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		
Court regarding intention to file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		28.00 9570
file opposition. Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570		20.00 7570
104500 Email to all counsel regarding 14.00 9570	file opposition.	
	Mar 14/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	
intention to file opposition		14.00 9570
	intention to file opposition	

to LA Supreme Court writ app.	
Mar 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 103734 Discussed legal issues with LSB	70.00 9570
Mar 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 103735 Review of Plaintiff's Supreme	98.00 9570
Court Writ App re Harris. Mar 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.70 Hrs X 140.00 103736 Preparation of Supreme Court brief in opposition to	378.00 9570
Plaintiff's writ application. Mar 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 10.00 Hrs X 150.00 103777 Draft report review and prepare objections to 1442 deposition; review of	1500.00 9570
issues with associate; review of DOTD documents; begin review of draft by Associate	
Mar 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104501 Email to Wayne, Bill, and Dan	14.00 9570
Mar 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs X 140.00 104502 Review of D. Thompson's deposition.	154.00 9570
Mar 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 103739 Discussed legal issues with LSB.	56.00 9570
Mar 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00 103740 Revised LA Supreme Court brief.	210.00 9570
Mar 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00 103741 Prepared	210.00 9570
Pankston	a & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 546
Jun/11/20T4 Bankston Client Le	
	To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Chq#	General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# R Balance	Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
Mar 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00	56.00 9570
103742 Legal reasearch regarding	30.00 3370
Mar 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.20 Hrs X 140.00 103743 Preparation for hearings tomorrow.	168.00 9570
Mar 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 103744 Prepared table of authorities and table of contents for Supreme Court brief.	70.00 9570

Mar 16/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140. 103745 Trial Preparation. Mar 16/2014 Lawyer: LSB 10.25 Hrs X 15	280.00 9570
104503 Continue trial preparation;	1537.50 9570
review and prepare for argument for Monday hearings	
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs X 60.0 103757 organization of plaintiff's exhibits printed for trial	24.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X 60.0 103759 search court connect , email to Rouchon	12.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.30 Hrs X 60.0 103760 download and save first page to all HB 2 from 1999-2013	18.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 1.50 Hrs X 60.0	90.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.50 Hrs X 140. 103803 Hearings at 19th JDC.	350.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.	70.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 5.00 Hrs X 140. 103806 Preparation of Writ of Mandamus to First Circuit.	700.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.0 103807 Preparation of exhibits to be filed with writ of mandamus.	280.00 9570
	nkston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 547
Clie	ent Ledger
	/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Chq# General Bld Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.0 103808 Correspondence with Chevalier.	56.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.0 103809 Phone call from Dietmar.	42.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.0 103810 Correspondence with Tony Rouchon.	28.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.0	00

103812 Correspondence with Brian Eddington.	28.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103813 Receipt and review of proposed judgment from Plaintiff.	28.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103814 Email to Plaintiff regarding objection to proposed judgment.	28.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103815 Preparation of Notice of Intent to File Writ Application.	28.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103816 Letter to Court regarding	28.00 9570
notice of intention. Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103817 Letter to First Circuit.	28.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 103818 Prepared writ for filing. Mar 17/2014 Expense Recovery	56.00 9570
104301 Postage - Copy of Writ to First X1763 Circuit	1.82 9570
Mar 17/2014 Expense Recovery 104302 Postage - Copy of Writ to Judge X1763 Fields	1.82 9570
Mar 17/2014 Expense Recovery 104303 Postage - Return envelope from X1763 La Supreme Court	1.82 9570
Mar 17/2014 Expense Recovery 104316 Parking - 19th Judicial X1764 District Court	4.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 12.00 Hrs X 60.00 research	720.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104504 Phone call to First Circuit regarding mandamus.	28.00 9570
Mar 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 104505 Correspondence with Cathy St. Pierre.	42.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00 103823 Attend hearing on various motions	375.00 9570
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Association Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1	
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# G	
4	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Balance	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
	9
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: LSB 3.50 Hrs X 150.00 103824 Begin preparation on writ to 1st Circuit on issue of release of funds	525.00 9570

Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: LSB 2.00 Hrs X 150.00 103825 Travel to and attend meeting with Ben Babin	300.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: LSB 4.00 Hrs X 150.00 103826 Work with associate on Writ to 1st Circuit	600.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103902 Email from Toni	14.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103904 Correspondence from Grodner	14.00 9570
regarding jury selection. Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 103906 Correspondence with Grodner regarding proposed judgment.	42.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103907 Phone call to 19th JDC	28.00 9570
regarding jury venire. Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 103908 Finished preparing writ of	70.00 9570
mandamus for filing. Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 103912 Preparation for meeting with	140.00 9570
James Purpera. Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 103913 Meeting with James Purpera.	280.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 103914 Prepared direct examination questions for James Purpera.	280.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 103915 Prepared for meeting with commissioners	70.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00 103916 Prepared documents for board meeting.	56.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 103917 Phone call from Dietmar.	28.00 9570
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 103918 Phone call to Larry Ardoin. Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9570
103919 Email to Brian Eddington. Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00	14.00 9570 14.00 9570
103920 Phone call from Blanchfield's office.	
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Client Ledger	
Date Received From/Paid To Nov/ 1/2010 To Nov/ 1/20	High results and the state of t
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rept	s Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
Balance	

Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs 103923 Discussed legal issues	X 140.00 56.00 9570	
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs 103924 Trial preparation.	154.00 9570	
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 103925 Correspondence from Gro		
regarding writ. Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 103927 Receipt and review of rule certificate and order from	X 140.00 e 9.5 14.00 9570	
John Tyler. Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs 103928 Prepared trial questions fo Larry Ardoin and Chris Knot	or 140.00 9570	
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs 103929 Prepared for meetings with witnesses scheduled for		
tomorrow (Ardoin, Delmar, Knotts).	W.150.00	
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: LSB 10.00 Hr 103935 Trial preparation;	1500.00 9570	
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs 104244 Research	5 X 60.00 120.00 9570	
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs 104245 Research	X 60.00 120.00 9570	
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.50 Hrs 104251 Review	X 60.00 150.00 9570	
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 6.00 Hrs 104371 Research Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs	360.00 9570	
104506 Email correspondence with Meghan Bland.		
Mar 18/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs 2 104508 Prepared documents regard exhibits for status conference		
with Judge Fields and Jun/11/2014	Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Client Ledger	Page: 550
N	Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014	T
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq# General Bld	Trust Activity

Entry # Explanation Balance	Rec#	Repts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
Plaintiffs. Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hr 103931 add questions and exhibit McMains and Fontenot folde for trial	s to			6.00 9	2570		
Mar 19/2014 ARBD							
103941 PMT - For Services Rend Mar 19/2014 ARBD	ered 00	6082	10052.00				
103942 PMT - For Services Rend	ered 06	6082	855.37				
Mar 19/2014 ARBD 103943 PMT - For Services Rend Mar 19/2014 ARBD	ered 06	6082	13687.50				
Mar 19/2014 ARBD 103944 PMT - For Services Rend Mar 19/2014 Clerk of Court	ered 06	6082	5590.80				
103968 Filing Fee	8154 V 140.00		5.00	9570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs 103974 Prepared direct examination questions for Terry Ryder.	on			280.00	9570		
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs 103976 Meeting with Larry Ardoi	n.			210.00	9570		
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs 103977 Phone call from Dietmar.				56.00 9	570		
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 103978 Email correspondence wit	h Toni.			28.00	9570		
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs 103979 Email to Dan Collarini.				14.00 957	70		
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.80 Hrs 103980 Prepared questions for Law	X 140.00 wrence			112.00	9570		
Callender. Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs 103981 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's Opposition to	X 140.00			140.00 95	70		
Objections to 1442 ARBD deposition introduction and researched							
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs 103982 Receipt and review of Plaintiff's exhibit list with	X 140.00			42.00 957	70		
sources cited. Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs 103983 Email correspondence wit Grodner regarding exhibits an	h			42.00	9570		
ARBC sources for exhibits. Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs 103984 Updated ARBC's exhibit but at 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.80 Hrs	ook.			70.00	9570		
103985 Preparation for status conference with Judge Fields			1	12.00 957	0		
un/11/2014	Bankston	n & As	sociates, L.I	L.C.			Page: 551

Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

 	D. a.a.# D.		Diaha	Fees	Inx# A		Ponto	Disbs
Entry # Explanation Balance	Rec# Ro	epts	Disbs	rees	Inv# P	ACC	Repts	Disos
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 1.00 Hrs X 103986 trial preparation, exhibits and witness folders	d		6	0.00	570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 1.20 Hrs X 103987 work on preparing for trial	60.00			72.00	9570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.60 Hrs X 103988 add first page of HB 2 to AF exhibit book, bates stamp and produce to plaintiff counsel				36.00	9570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 103989 discuss with JHL and LSB	60.00			6.00	9570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X 103991 research regarding	3 60.00		12.0	00 957	0			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X 103992 research	<u>(</u> 60.00			12.00	9570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.80 Hrs X	oits			48.00	9570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 1.00 Hrs X 103994 trial preparation, exhibits and witness folders			6	0.00	9570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 1.20 Hrs X 103995 work on preparing	60.00			72.00	9570		y 1 - 1	
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.60 Hrs X 103996 add first page of HB 2 to AR exhibit book, bates stamp and produce to plaintiff counsel	(60.00 RBD			36.00	9570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 103997 discuss with JHL and LSB	60.00			6.00	9570			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X 103999 research regarding	60.00		12.00	0 957	0			
Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X 104000 research	60.00			12.00	9570			

Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: LSB 9.00 Hrs X 150.00 Page: 552 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Jun/11/2014 Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014 Bld |----- Trust Activity Chq# |---- General -----Received From/Paid To Date Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Rcpts Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance 1350.00 9570 104016 Meetings with Terry Ryder; Chris Knotts and William Delmar; John Brass in Lutcher and Larry Ardoin; preparation for hearing with Judge Mar 19/2014 Expense Recovery 9570 42.94 104017 Mileage Reimbursement - travel X1762 to Lutcher for meeting with witness (76 mils x \$.565/mile) Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 1.50 Hrs X 60.00 104018 Trial preparation: 90.00 9570 Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 3.00 Hrs X 60.00 9570 180.00 104372 Research Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00 9570 210.00 104507 Prepared trial questions for Chris Knotts and Larry Ardoin. Mar 19/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00 210.00 9570 104515 Meeting with Terry Ryder. Mar 20/2014 Capital One 9570 57.76 104003 UPS (2) Mar 20/2014 Associated Reporters, Inc. 9570 568.15 8158 104020 Deposition Costs Invoice No. 84830 - Ed Preau Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 2.00 Hrs X 60.00 120.00 9570 104024 further work on demonstrative exhibits Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 1.00 Hrs X 60.00 60.00 9570 104027 prepare final exhibits to be produced to all defendants Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00 210.00 9570 104029 Status conference with Judge. Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 9570 98.00 104030 Meeting with Maldonado and Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00 104031 Meeting with Lawrence Callender. 280.00 9570 Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00

104032 Preparation for meeting wtih

Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00

Jerry Jones.

70.00 9570

104033 Meeting with Jerry Jones.				280.00	9570			
Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs 104034 Prepared direct examination	X 140.00			210.00	9570			
questions for Jerry Jones. Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 104035 Meeting wtih Brian Eddington.				140.00	9570)		
Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs	X 140.00 Ranksto	on & Asso	ciates, L.L	.C.				Page: 55
Jun/11/2014	Client L		oracos, z.c					
	Nov/ 1/2010		1/2014					
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq	#	General					Trust Activi
		Repts		Fees	Inv#	Acc	Rcpts	Disbs
104036 Preparation for meeting w				140.00	9570			
Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.30 Hrs 104037 Trial preparation.			182.	.00 957	0			
Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 104038 Correspondence with Groot regarding exhibits.	dner			28.00	9570			
Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.80 Hrs 104068 further work on demonstra exhibits	X 60.00 ative			48.00	9570			
Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: LSB 12.00 Hr 104092 Meeting with Judge; meet				1800.00	9570)		
with Lawrence Callender; meeting with Jerry Jones; meeting with Martha Hess;								
meeting with Brian Eddingtor review of Thompson depositi	n; on							
and exhibits Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 5.00 Hrs 104246 Research	X 60.00			300.0	00 951	70		
Mar 20/2014 Expense Recovery								
104305 Postage - to COC filing No of Intention (plus return envelope)	otice X1	763	1.1	17	957	0		
Mar 20/2014 Expense Recovery 104306 Postage - cd to Drew Blanchfield containing writ	X1763		0.69		9570			
Mar 20/2014 Expense Recovery 104317 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court	X1764		4.00		9570			
Mar 20/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs 2 104510 Receipt and review of decis from the First Circuit.	ζ 140.00 sions			28.00	9570			

Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.0 104050 Preparation for meetings.		140	0.00 9570		
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.20 Hrs X 140.0			168.00 9570		
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.0 104053 Meeting with Toni and Dietmar	00		70.00 9570		
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.0 104054 Meeting with Wayne Maldonado	00		140.00 9570		
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.0	00 okston & Asso	ociates, L.L.C			Page: 554
Clie	nt Ledger				
Nov/ 1/	2010 To May	/ 1/2014	. 1014	Tr	net Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq#	General	1		
Entry # Explanation Rec#		Disbs	Fees Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
			14.00 9570		
104057 Correspondence from Grodner			14.00		
regarding jury venire.	00				
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.	00		14.00 9570		
104062 Review of certified property					
bills. Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.	00				
104063 Email to Grodner regarding			28.00 9570		
certified property bills.					
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.	00		0.570		
104064 Review of jury venire and			56.00 9570		
taxpayer class in connection					
with Grodner's comments.					
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140	.00		42.00 9570		
104065 Correspondence with Wayne and	P		42.00 9370		
Dan					
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140 104066 Revised direct examination	.00		140.00 9570		
questions for Lawrence					
Callender.					
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.50 Hrs X 60.	00		30.00 9570		
104069 talk with LSB			30.00 9570		
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs X 60.	00		24.00 9570		
104070 drop off exhibits to be blown			21.00		
up at QLS and to be copied for					
jury Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 11.00 Hrs X 15	0.00				
104093 Meeting with Fred Chevalier			1650.00 9570		
regarding witness preparation;					
meeting with Don Thompson,					
Dietmar and Toni					
begin					
development of opening					

statement	20					
Mar 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.00 Hrs X 140.0 104509 Meeting with D. Thompson	00		420.00	9570		
104509 Meeting with D. Thompson			.20.00			
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 6.00 Hrs X 60.0	00			. 1		
104071 trial preparation,		3	360.00	9570		
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.	00			*		
104072 Prepared direct examination			140.00	9570		
questions for Chevalier.						
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.0	00		1.40.00	0.570		
104073 Prepared direct examination			140.00	9570		
questions for Knotts.	00					
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.0 Jun/11/2014 Bar	nkston & Asso	ociates, L.L	.C.			Page: 555
	ent Ledger					
	2010 To May	/ 1/2014			_	
	Chq#	General		Bld -	J	rust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Rents	Dishs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
Balance	Repts	Discs	1 005	111711 1100	red p es	
			1.40.00	0.570		
104074 Prepared direct examination questions for Ardoin.			140.00	9570		
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.0	00					
104075 Legal research			280.00	9570		
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.0	00					
104076 Legal research			280.00	9570		
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.0	0					
104077 Prepared questions for voir			140.00	9570		
dire.						
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.0 104078 Discussed legal issues with LSB	0		140.00	0570		
104078 Discussed legal issues with LSB			140.00	9570		
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.0	0					
104079 Trial preparation.		98.0	00 9570)		
Mar 22/2014 Lawyer: LSB 10.75 Hrs X 150.	00					
104097 Trial preparation;		16	512.50	9570		
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 7.00 Hrs X 60.00)					

104080 trial preparation	420.00 9570
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 104081 Review of opening statement and prepared suggested additions.	140.00 9570
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00 104082 Preparation of jury documents.	140.00 9370
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00 104083 Review of Plaintiff's exhibits.	210.00 9570
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104084 Correspondence with Grodner regarding property bills.	28.00 9570
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00 104085 Correspondence from Grodner regarding 1442 depositions.	28.00 9570
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00 104086 Review of new 1442 deposition redactions with LSB.	70.00 9570
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 5.00 Hrs X 140.00	700.00 0570
104087 Trial Preparation.	700.00 9570 ston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 556
	ston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 556 t Ledger
	010 To May/ 1/2014
	hq# General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 104100 Receipt and review of writ of First Circuit on Legislative Auditor issue	37.50 9570
Mar 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 5.00 Hrs X 150.00 104105 Continue trial preparation	750.00 9570
Mar 24/2014 Quality Litigation Support 104126 Photocopy Expense - Trial Preparation	8164 1141.88 9570
Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 4.00 Hrs X 60.00 104131 trial preparation	240.00 9570
Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104143 Correspondence from Grodner regarding 1442 depositions.	14.00 9570
Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00 104144 Trial Preparation.	98.00 9570
Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.40 Hrs X 140.00 104146 Trial preparation. Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 5.00 Hrs X 140.00	336.00 9570
104148 Jury voir dire at 19th JDC. Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00	700.00 9570
104149 Prepared for opening statements with LSB.	70.00 9570
Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00 104150 Discussed legal issues with LSB. Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.00 Hrs X 140.00	84.00 9570

104151 Review of depositions for tr	al			280.00 9570		
purposes. Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: LSB 11.00 Hrs 2	X 150.00					
104203 Participate in jury selection;			10	650.00 9570		
trial preparation						
Mar 24/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 2.50 Hrs X	60.00			150.00 0550		
104252 Review				150.00 9570		
Mar 24/2014 Expense Recovery			10.00	9570		
104315 Parking - 19th Judicial	X176	4	10.00	9370		
District Court	60.00					
Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X	00.00			12.00 9570		
104152 email to all witnesses with update of trial				12.00		
Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X	60.00					
104156 respond to email from Cathy	St.			6.00 9570		
Pierre concerning Supreme Cou	rt					
writs						
Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs >	60.00			COO 0570		
104157 call from Mark Drennen				6.00 9570		
regarding trial						
Mar 25/2014 Erica Andrus	01.67		6.00	9570		
104107 1 4111111111111111111111111111111	3167		6.00	9370		
Mar 25/2014 Erica Andrus	Panket	on & Ass	ociates, L.L	·C·		Page: 557
Jun/11/2014	Client I		ociates, E.E			
N	ov/ 1/201		// 1/2014			
Date Received From/Paid To	Cho	#	- General	Bld -	Tı	rust Activity
			D: I	F Inv# Acc	Ponts	Disbs
Entry # Explanation	Rec#	Repts	Disbs	Fees Inv# Acc	Repts	D1303
Balance						
104168 Trial supplies	8167		43.59	9570		
Mar 25/2014 Erica Andrus						
104169 Trial supplies	8167		98.08	9570		
Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 9.50 Hrs X	140.00		1220.00	0570		
104170 Trial.			1330.00	9570		
Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X	140.00			28.00 9570		
104177 Receipt and review of First				28.00 9370		
Circuit ruling regarding mandamus.						
Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X	140.00					
	1.0.00					
104178 Review of docket report to				28.00 9570		
104178 Review of docket report to obtain minutes from hearing re				28.00 9570		
obtain minutes from hearing re release of funds.				28.00 9570		
obtain minutes from hearing re release of funds. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X						
obtain minutes from hearing rerelease of funds. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 104179 Prepared writ of mandamus				140.00 9570		
obtain minutes from hearing rerelease of funds. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 104179 Prepared writ of mandamus refiled.	to be					
obtain minutes from hearing rerelease of funds. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 104179 Prepared writ of mandamus refiled. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X	to be		126	140.00 9570		
obtain minutes from hearing rerelease of funds. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 104179 Prepared writ of mandamus refiled.	to be 140.00		126.	140.00 9570		
obtain minutes from hearing rerelease of funds. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 104179 Prepared writ of mandamus refiled. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X 104180 Trial preparation.	to be 140.00 X 150.00			140.00 9570		
obtain minutes from hearing rerelease of funds. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 104179 Prepared writ of mandamus refiled. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X 104180 Trial preparation. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: LSB 10.00 Hrs 104204 Second day of trial; prepare for next day witness	to be 140.00 X 150.00			140.00 9570 .00 9570		
obtain minutes from hearing rerelease of funds. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 104179 Prepared writ of mandamus refiled. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X 104180 Trial preparation. Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: LSB 10.00 Hrs 104204 Second day of trial; prepare	to be 140.00 X 150.00			140.00 9570 .00 9570		

	X1764	20.00	9570	
104314 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court Mar 25/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs				
104511 attempt to call Terry Lough		6.0	0 9570	
and Willie George Lee				
Mar 26/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs	X 60.00	1		
104189 email to witnesses with tri	ial	6.00	9570	
update Mar 26/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs	X 60.00			
104190 attempt to call Jeff David		6.0	0 9570	
trial update, left message	V 60 00			
Mar 26/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs 104193 gather additional exhibits		12.00	9570	
publish to the jury				
Mar 26/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 1.00 Hrs		60.	00 9570	
104194 travel to and from court he with additional exhibits	ouse	00.	00 9370	
Mar 26/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs	X 60.00	A 1 1 1 2		
104196 call to Ed Preau regarding		6.00	9570	
appearance not needed at tria Mar 26/2014 Lawyer: JHL 9.50 Hrs	X 140 00			
104200 Trial.		1330.00 957	70	
Mar 26/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.60 Hrs	X 140.00	504.00	9570	
104201 Trial preparation. Mar 26/2014 Lawyer: LSB 12.50 Hr	s X 150 00	504.00	9370	
Jun/11/2014 Lawyer. ESB 12.30 III		ssociates, L.L.C.		Page: 558
	Client Ledger	/ 1/2014		
	Nov/ 1/2010 To M			
	Cha#	General	Bld	Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	1/2	General	Bld	
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq# Rec# Rcpts	General		Trust Activity Disbs
Date Received From/Paid To	Rec# Rcpts	General Disbs Fo	ees Inv# Acc Rcpts	
Date Received From/Paid To	Rec# Rcpts	General	ees Inv# Acc Rcpts	
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance 104210 Trial and work to prepare	Rec# Rcpts	General Disbs Fo	ees Inv# Acc Rcpts	
Date Received From/Paid To	Rec# Rcpts	General Disbs Fo	ees Inv# Acc Rcpts	
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance 104210 Trial and work to prepare Mar 26/2014 Expense Recovery 104313 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court	Rec# Rcpts X1764	Disbs Fe	ees Inv# Acc Rcpts 00 9570	
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance 104210 Trial and work to prepare Mar 26/2014 Expense Recovery 104313 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs 104211 prepare writ of manadamu	Rec# Rcpts X1764 X 60.00	Disbs Fe	ees Inv# Acc Rcpts 00 9570	
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance 104210 Trial and work to prepare Mar 26/2014 Expense Recovery 104313 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs 104211 prepare writ of manadamu filed at first circuit	Rec# Rcpts X1764 X 60.00 ls to be	Disbs Fe	ees Inv# Acc Rcpts 00 9570 9570	
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance 104210 Trial and work to prepare Mar 26/2014 Expense Recovery 104313 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs 104211 prepare writ of manadamu filed at first circuit Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs	Rec# Rcpts X1764 5 X 60.00 is to be 5 X 60.00	Disbs Fe	9570 9570 4.00 9570	
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance 104210 Trial and work to prepare Mar 26/2014 Expense Recovery 104313 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs 104211 prepare writ of manadamu filed at first circuit Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs 104214 email to Chevillar regardin trial and testimony	X1764 S X 60.00 sis to be S X 60.00 ing	Disbs Fo	9570 9570 4.00 9570	
Date Received From/Paid To	X1764 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00	Disbs Fe	9570 9570 4.00 9570	
Date Received From/Paid To	X1764 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00	Disbs Fo	9570 9570 4.00 9570	
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance 104210 Trial and work to prepare Mar 26/2014 Expense Recovery 104313 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs 104211 prepare writ of manadamu filed at first circuit Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs 104214 email to Chevillar regardin trial and testimony Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 2.00 Hrs	X1764 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00	Disbs Fe	9570 9570 4.00 9570	
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance 104210 Trial and work to prepare Mar 26/2014 Expense Recovery 104313 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs 104211 prepare writ of manadamu filed at first circuit Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs 104214 email to Chevillar regardin trial and testimony Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 2.00 Hrs 104215 to and from first circuit to file writ of mandamus, to and from 19th JDC to deliver stamped writ to LSB	X1764 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00	Disbs Fe	9570 9570 4.00 9570	
Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Balance 104210 Trial and work to prepare Mar 26/2014 Expense Recovery 104313 Parking - 19th Judicial District Court Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs 104211 prepare writ of manadamu filed at first circuit Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs 104214 email to Chevillar regardin trial and testimony Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 2.00 Hrs 104215 to and from first circuit to file writ of mandamus, to and from 19th JDC to deliver	X1764 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00 X 60.00	Disbs Fe	9570 4.00 9570 9570 9570 9570	

testimony Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H		6.00 0570	
104218 email to Drennen regard	ing	6.00 9570	
testimony Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H 104219 email to James Purpera regarding testimony	rs X 60.00	6.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H 104220 email to McMains regard testimony	rs X 60.00 ling	6.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H 104221 email to Jerry Jones rega testimony	rs X 60.00 rding	6.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H 104222 email to Fontenot regard testimony	ing	6.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H 104223 email to Callendar regard testimony	ding	6.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H 104224 email to Ardoin regarding	g	6.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H 104225 email to Jeff David rega testimony	rding	6.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H 104226 email to Hess regarding testimony		6.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 H 104227 email to Duplaniter rega testimony	raing	6.00 9570	Page: 559
Jun/11/2014	Bankston & Asso Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/	1/2014	Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Cnq#	General	
Entry # Explanation Balance	Rec# Rcpts	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc	Repts Disbs
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 F 104228 email to Chevalier regar testimony	ding	6.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 1.00 F 104229 pull trial	Irs X 60.00	60.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.50 F 104230 research		30.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.50 F 104231 search		30.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.50 F	irs X 60.00		

10.1020 review hand document		30.00 9570	
104232 review bond document			
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs 2	X 60.00	0.4.00	
104233 update witness list		24.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: JHL 9.50 Hrs X	140.00	1330.00 9570	
104237 Trial.	7 140 00	1330.00 9370	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: JHL 2.40 Hrs X 104238 Trial Preparation.	140.00	336.00 9570	
Mar 27/2014 Lawyer: LSB 13.50 Hrs	X 150.00		
104273 Trial and preparation for ne	ext	2025.00 9570	
day of witnesses			
Mar 27/2014 Expense Recovery	***	10.00	
104312 Parking - 19th Judicial	X1764	10.00 9570	
District Court			
Mar 27/2014 Expense Recovery 104533 Parking - 19th Judicial	X1767	10.00 9570	
District Court	X1707	10.00	
Mar 28/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.20 Hrs X	140.00		
104267 Trial Preparation.		168.00 9570	
Mar 28/2014 Lawyer: LSB 9.50 Hrs X	X 150.00		
104274 Trial and preparation for		1425.00 9570	
witnesses			
Mar 28/2014 Lawyer: JHL 9.80 Hrs X	140.00	1272.00	
104512 Trial.		1372.00 9570	
Mar 28/2014 Expense Recovery 104534 Parking - 19th Judicial	X1767	10.00 9570	
District Court	X1707	10.00	
Mar 28/2014 Fees To Lawyer LSB			
104697 Parking -Trial		10.00 9800	
Mar 29/2014 Lawyer: JHL 5.90 Hrs X	140.00		
104268 Trial Preparation.		826.00 9570	
Mar 29/2014 Lawyer: LSB 8.00 Hrs X	150.00		
104287 Meeting with associate;		1200.00 9570	
Mar 30/2014 Lawyer: JHL 8.50 Hrs X	140.00		
Jun/11/2014 Lawyer: JHL 8.30 Hrs X		ssociates, L.L.C.	Page: 560
5415 11/2011	Client Ledger	ssociates, E.E.C.	Page: 560
No	ov/ 1/2010 To M	av/ 1/2014	
Date Received From/Paid To			Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation	Rec# Repts	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts	Disbs
Balance			
104272 Trial preparation.		1190.00 9570	
Mar 30/2014 Lawyer: LSB 7.75 Hrs X	150.00	1190.00 9570	
104289 Meeting with Toni;		1162.50 9570	
		1102.00 7070	
Mar 30/2014 Lawyer: PL-1 4.00 Hrs X	60.00		
104381 trial preparation		240.00	

240.00 9570

490.00 9570

104381 trial preparation

104320 Trial Preparation and

Mar 31/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.50 Hrs X 140.00

correspondence with witnesses.

Mar 31/2014 Lawyer: JHL 5.50 Hrs X 140.00 104322 Trial.	770.00 9570
Mar 31/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.70 Hrs X 140.00 104323 Trial preparation. Mar 31/2014 Lawyer: LSB 12.00 Hrs X 150.00	518.00 9570
104513 Trial preparation; trial	1800.00 9570
Mar 31/2014 Expense Recovery 104535 Parking - 19th Judicial X1767 District Court	10.00 9570
Mar 31/2014 American Express 106567 Credit Card Expense - Jury Meals Apr 1/2014 Expense Recovery	1193.29 9800
104334 Photocopies - 15072 BW @ \$0.10 X1766	1507.20 9800
each Apr 1/2014 Expense Recovery	
104335 Photocopies - 2782 color copies X1766 @ \$0.15 each	417.30 9800
Apr 1/2014 Lawyer: JHL 12.50 Hrs X 140.00 104408 Trial.	1750.00 9800
Apr 1/2014 Lawyer: JHL 3.00 Hrs X 140.00	1,50,00
104409 Trial preparation.	420.00 9800
Apr 1/2014 Lawyer: LSB 13.00 Hrs X 150.00	1050.00 0000
104444 Trial and preparation for final day; prepare special jury	1950.00 9800
charges	
Apr 1/2014 Fees To Lawyer LSB	
104698 Parking - Trial	10.00 9800
Apr 1/2014 Fees To Lawyer LSB	
104699 Parking - Trial	10.00 9800
Apr 2/2014 Lawyer: JHL 10.80 Hrs X 140.00	1512.00 0800
104443 Trial. Apr 2/2014 Lawyer: LSB 9.00 Hrs X 150.00	1512.00 9800
104445 Trial and closing argument	1350.00 9800
Apr 2/2014 Fees To Lawyer LSB	1350100 2000
104700 Parking -Trial	10.00 9800
Apr 2/2014 Fees To Lawyer LSB	
104701 Parking - Trial	10.00 9800
Apr 2/2014 AARBD	
107518 PMT - Attorney Fees/expenses 06202 31	
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Asso	crates, L.L.C.
Client Ledger Nov/ 1/2010 To May/	/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Chq#	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts	Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
Balance	
Apr 2/2014 AARBD	621.00
10/515 11111 1111011105 1 0000 0115	621.09
Apr 2/2014 AARBD 107520 PMT - Attorney Fees/expenses 06202 36	5322.50
Apr 2/2014 AARBD	
107521 PMT - Attorney Fees/expenses 06202 44	479.00

Apr 2/2014 AARBD					
107522 PMT - Attorney Fees/expenses	06202	2175.00			
Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00			14.00 0800		
104463 Discussed legal issues with LSB			14.00 9800		
Apr 3/2014 Billing on Invoice 9570					
104538 FEES 74504.50		0.00	9570		
DISBS 2621.09 Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00					
104542 Email from Collarini regarding			14.00 9800		
Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00			20.00 0000		
104543 Receipt and review of proposed judment from Dan and email			28.00 9800		
correspondence with Dan.					
Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00					
104545 Revised judgment.			28.00 9800		
Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 104546 Email to Collarini regarding			14.00 9800		
Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00					
104547 Email to Sheriffs regarding			28.00 9800		
judgment and concursus resolution.					
Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00					
105129 E-mail to Mary Kinsey			15.00 9800		
Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 105135 Telephone call from Kathy St.			75.00 9800		
Pierre re: concursas			75.00 9800		
Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00					
105140 E-mail from Ungarino			37.50 9800		
e-mail response Apr 3/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00					
105142 Review of Judgment; review of			112.50 9800		
revised judgment					
Apr 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00			14.00 9800		
104555 Email from Collarini regarding			14.00 9000		
Apr 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00					
104556 Left voicemails for Gould and			14.00 9800		
St. Pierre regarding judgment. Apr 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00					
	on & Ass	ociates, L.	L.C.		Page: 562
Client I					
Nov/ 1/201			D1	4 I T.,	unt Antivity
Date Received From/Paid To Chq	i#	General -	Bio	d Tr	ust Activity
	Rcpts	Disbs	Fees Inv# A	cc Repts	Disbs
Balance					
104557 Phone call from Cathy St.			28.00 9800		
Pierre regarding judgment.					

Apr 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1 104558 Discussed legal issues with L	40.00 SB	14.00	9800	
Apr 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1 104560 Revised judgment.		14.00 9800		
Apr 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1 104561 Email to Collarini regarding	40.00	14.00 98	300	
Apr 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.20 Hrs X 1 104566 Decommission trial documen	ts.	168.00	9800	
Apr 4/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1 104569 Email from Collarini regardi		14.00	9800	
Apr 4/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 1 105123 Review of Jerry Jones bill;	50.00	37.50 980	00	
forward to client Apr 7/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1 104614 Correspondence with Gould regarding judgment.	40.00	14.00 9	2800	
Apr 7/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 1 105109 E-mail from Toni; Assign tas to associate		37.50	9800	
Apr 8/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1 104633 Correspondence with Gould regarding judgment.	40.00	14.00 9	9800	
Apr 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1- 104725 Email from Grodner regardin proposed judgment.	40.00 g	14.00	9800	
Apr 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 1- 104729 Correspondence from Wayne	40.00	14.00	9800	
Apr 9/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 14 104738 Receipt and review of letter from Collarini to be submitted to judge regarding judgment and	40.00	14.00 980	00	
costs. Apr 9/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 0.80 Hrs X 6 104763 Decommissioning file.		48.00 9800)	
Apr 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 1: 105091 Receipt and review of e-mail from Donna Grodner re: costs;	50.00	37.50 98	300	
e-mail to defense team Apr 9/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 15	0.00			
105097 Review of draft judgment; letter to Judge Apr 9/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 0.10 Hrs X 60	0.00	37.50 980	0	
105286 Prepared spreadsheet of lunch Jun/11/2014	Bankston & Associate	6.00 980 es, L.L.C.	00	Page: 563
	Client Ledger ′ 1/2010 To May/ 1/20	014		
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq# Gen		Bld Tr	ust Activity
Entry # Explanation Residue Balance	ec# Repts Di	sbs Fees Inv	# Acc Repts	Disbs

				0.1
expenses for Jury	60.00			
Apr 9/2014 Lawyer: PL-2 0.10 Hrs X	30.00		6.00 9800	
105287 E-mailed lunch receipts and	10			
spreadsheet to Wayne Maldanad	140.00			
Apr 15/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X	140.00		42.00 9800	
105004 Phone call from Ashly Earl				
regarding court costs.	150.00			
Apr 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 105059 Telephone call from Huey M	lartin		37.50 9800	
re: trial and invoice				
Apr 15/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X	150.00			
105067 Receipt and review of propos	sed		75.00 9800	
judgment and letter to Judge				
Fields				
Apr 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X	140.00		14.00 0000	
105145 Receipt and review of propo	sed		14.00 9800	
judgment from Grodner.				
Apr 17/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X	140.00		70.00 9800	
105154 Prepared letters to witnesses			70.00 7000	
regarding trial outcome.	150.00			
Apr 17/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X	130.00		75.00 9800	
105296 Review of proposal judgmer	π,			
assign task to Associate Apr 21/2014 Lawyer: JHL 1.10 Hrs X	140.00			
105225 Prepared letters to Eddington	n,		154.00 9800	
Chevalier, Jones, Cragin, D.				
Purpera, Schaye, David, J.				
Purpera, Hess, McMains,				
Fontenot, Ryder, Duplantier,				
Drennen, Knotts, Delmar				
regarding trial outcome.				
Apr 21/2014 Expense Recovery	X1770	8.64	9800	
105280 Postage : Letter to all	X1770	0.04	7000	
witnesses (18)				
Apr 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X	150.00			
105339 Receipt and review of invoice	ce		37.50 9800	
from Huey Martin				
Apr 21/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X	150.00			
105342 Receipt and Review of Notice	ce of		37.50 9800	
Appeal. Assign task to Associate	e			
Apr 22/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X			14.00 9800	
105358 Receipt and review of signed	d		14.00 9800	
order from the court.	140.00			
Apr 23/2014 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X	140.00		14.00 9800	
105440 Correspondence with Gould regarding judgment and costs.			14.00 7000	
Apr 23/2014 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X	150.00			
105532 Receipt and review of e-mai	il		30.00 9800	
Jun/11/2014	Bankston & A	ssociates, L.L	.C.	Page: 564
	Client Ledger			
No	ov/ 1/2010 To M	lay/ 1/2014		

Entry # Balance	Explanation	Rec#	Rcpts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
	from attorney							
Apr 24/20 105461	from attorney 14 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 F 1 Email from Blanchfiel	Irs X 140.00 d			14.00	9800		
Apr 24/20 105462	regarding costs. 114 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 F 2 Email from Gould rega				14.00	9800		
Apr 24/20 105463	concursus costs. 114 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 F 3 Review of docket reporegarding judgment.				14.00	9800		
Apr 24/20 105515 i	114 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 I 5 Telephone call to Nacc ssue with Judgment	ole Gould;			37.50	9800		
105750	114 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 I Disciplinary Board decision	of			37.50	9800		
Apr 29/20 105633	copy to counsel 14 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 l 3 call from first Circuit regarding letter received f Grodner regarding moot W discuss with JHL	rom			12.00 980	00		
Apr 30/20 105702	14 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 H Review of corresponde Grdodner.				28.00	9800		
105703 r	14 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 H Emails from defense co regarding Fist Circuit lette by Grodner.	ounsel			14.00	9800		
105704 r	14 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 H Preapred letter to Grodi egarding mandamus brief	ner			42.00	2800		
105767 ca lo	Lawyer: LSB 1.00 H Emails to Co-Counsel; all to Clerk of Court; revisetter to Grodner	Telephone			150.0	0 9800		
105797 3	4 Expense Recovery Photocopies 14 Color @ 75 BW @ .10		X1772		39.60	9800		
pr 30/201	4 Capital One Bank (US Credit Card Expense	SA), N.A.		70.00	98	00		

1046 Amite River Basin Drainage 1046-0006 City Parish Propert Jun/11/2014	y Transfer Banks	ton & As Ledger	ssociates, L.1	L.C.	Resp La	awyer: LSB	Page: 565
Date Received From/Paid To					Bld	Tru	st Activity
Balance	Rec#	Rcpts	Disbs	Fees		Repts	Disbs
Dec 29/2010 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 H							
37614 Telephone call from Cit Parish; review of Harris fil email to ARBC Dec 29/2010 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 H	y le;			112.50 4	1048		
37630 Review of email from L	awence			15.00	4048		
Dec 30/2010 Expense Recovery	*****						
37839 Photocopies Jan 4/2011 Billing on Invoice 4048	X1105		2.56	4048	8		
38023 FEES 127.50			0.00	4048			
DISBS 2.56 Jan 19/2011 Amite River Basin							
38682 PMT -	03131	2.56					
Jan 19/2011 Amite River Basin	03131	2.50					
38683 PMT -	03131 12	27.50					
Jan 31/2011 Expense Recovery							
39034 Photocopies	X1117		0.96	4116			
Feb 7/2011 Billing on Invoice 4116			0.50	1110			
39385 DISBS 0.96		0	.00	4116			
Feb 7/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs	X 150.00						
39537 Review of FONSI and em				75.00	4222		
DPW. Email to ARBC staff							
concerning same.							
Feb 28/2011 Expense Recovery							
40735 Photocopies	X1132		0.16	4222			
Mar 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4222							
40978 FEES 75.00		0.	00	4222			
DISBS 0.16							
Mar 21/2011 Amite River Basin 42213 PMT -	03338 0	.16					
Mar 21/2011 Amite River Basin	03338 0	.10					
42214 PMT -	03338 75	.00					
Mar 21/2011 Amite River Basin	05550 75	.00					
42215 RET -	03338 0.	96		4573			
Mar 29/2011 Expense Recovery	0.	-		.0,0			
42740 Photocopies	X1152		0.32	4573			
Apr 7/2011 Billing on Invoice 4573							
43607 DISBS 0.32		0.0	00	4573			
RCPTS 0.32							

Apr 7/2011 43609 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 4573	4573	-0.96		4573		
Apr 7/2011 43610 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 4573	4573	0.32		4573		
Apr. 7/2011		0.64		4924		
43611 RET - Retainers Carried Forward	4573	0.04		,,,_,		
Apr 25/2011 expense recovery 44456 Photocopies X117	79	0.16	5 49	24		
		Associates	s, L.L.C.			Page: 566
Clie	ent Ledge					
	/2010 To J	May/ 1/20	14 eral	Bld	Ti	rust Activity
Date	Cnq#	Gene	iai	Dia		•
Entry # Explanation Reca	# Rept			Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
Jul 5/2011 Billing on Invoice 4924		0.00	4924			
48404 DISBS 0.16 RCPTS 0.16		0.00	7327			
RCPTS 0.16 Jul 5/2011						
48406 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 4924	4924	-0.64		4924		
Jul 5/2011						
48407 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 4924	4924	0.16		4924		
Jul 5/2011	4924	0.48		5074		
48408 RET - Retainers Carried Forward Jul 7/2011 Disbursements, Write Up/Down		0.40		3074		
49143 Write off	111V 49Z	0.16	4924			
Aug 3/2011 Expense Recovery		0.10	.,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,			
	X1249		0.20	5074		
Aug 4/2011 Billing on Invoice 5074						
50753 DISBS 0.20		0.00	5074			
RCPTS 0.20						
Aug 4/2011 50755 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 5074	5074	-0.48		5074		
Aug 4/2011	3074	-0.40		3074		
50756 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 5074	5074	0.20		5074		
Aug 4/2011						
50757 RET - Retainers Carried Forward	5074	0.28		5168		
Aug 23/2011 Expense Recovery	****					
51591 Photocopies 1 BW @ .10	X1268		0.10	5168		
Sep 6/2011 Billing on Invoice 5168 52671 DISBS 0.10		0.00	5168			
RCPTS 0.10		0.00	3108			
Sep 6/2011						
52673 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 5168	5168	-0.28		5168		
Sep 6/2011						
52674 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 5168	5168	0.10		5168		
Sep 6/2011	51.00	0.10		5050		
52675 RET - Retainers Carried Forward Sep 7/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00	5168	0.18		5278		
52975 Telephone Conference with			37.50	5278		
Sheriffs attorney; obtain			37.30	2210		
information and forward.						

Sep 30/2011 Expense Recovery 54152 Photocopies X132	0.10	5278	
54152 Photocopies X132 Oct 3/2011 Billing on Invoice 5278	-4		
54324 FEES 37.50	0.00	5278	
DISBS 0.10			
RCPTS 0.18			
Oct 3/2011	5278 -0.18	5278	
54326 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 5278	5278 -0.18	3270	
Oct 3/2011 54327 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 5278	5278 0.10	5278	
Oct 3/2011	3270 0.10		
54328 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 5278	5278 0.08	5278	D 567
Jun/11/2014 Ba	nkston & Associates,	L.L.C.	Page: 567
Cli	ent Ledger		
	/2010 To May/ 1/2014	4 a Bld l	Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq# Genera	al Did	
Per:	# Repts Dist	s Fees Inv# Acc	Repts Disbs
Ditty " Empire			
Balance			
Oct 18/2011 ARBC			
55289 PMT - 04125	1.12		
Oct 18/2011 ARBC	37.42		
55290 PMT - 04125	37.42		
Oct 20/2011 Expense Recovery 55493 Photocopies 2 @ .10 BW	X1347	0.20 8679	
Feb 28/2012 Expense Recovery		The Agent of All Control	
62560 Photocopies 2 @ .10 BW	X1448	0.20 8679	
May 29/2012 Expense Recovery		0.70	
68840 Photocopies X15	0.10	8679	
Jun 28/2012 Expense Recovery	V1510	0.10 8679	
70692 Photocopies - 1 @ .10 BW	X1519	0.10	
Jul 26/2012 Expense Recovery	X1543	0.10 8679	
72531 Photocopies - 1 @ 0.10 BW Nov 1/2013 Billing on Invoice 8679	7110 10		
96437 DISBS 0.70	0.00	8679	
Feb 14/2014 ARBD			
102332 PMT - For Services Rendered	06032 0.70		
Mar 5/2014 Billing on Invoice 9444	0.00	9444	
103105	0.00	7777	
The second secon	TO SHE WAS A STATE OF THE SAME		

1046 Amite River Basin Drainage & Water Conse 1046-0007 RFQ for Engineering Services Feb 15/2011 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 110.00 40172 Reviewed retainer contract. Discussed issues with LSB.

Resp Lawyer: LSB

110.00 4221

Edited contract.		
Mar 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4221 40977 FEES 110.00	0.00 4221	
Mar 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 175	5.00	
41254 Revise draft of RFQ, email to	262.50 4571	
parties for comments.	5.00	
Mar 9/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 175	175.00 4571	
41364 Review of RFQ by DOTD; telephone call to Dietmar		
concerning same.		
Mar 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 17:	75.00	
41525 Telephone call to Dietmar;	525.00 4571	
telephone call to DOTD; telephone call to expert		
telephone can to expert		
review of USACE		
Mar 11/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 17:	75.00 262.50 4571	
41541 Review of DNR RFP; email to		age: 568
	Hient Ledger	
	1/2010 To May/ 1/2014	
Date Received From/Paid To	Chq# General Bld Trust	Activity
	ec# Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts I	Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec	ee# Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts I	21505
Balance		
Dietmar; email from Larry		
Ardion.	75.00	
Mar 11/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 17: 41552 Modify RFP document.	262.50 4571	
Mar 14/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 17:	75.00	
41841 Meeting with DOTD to review F		
and ARBC RFP.		
Mar 21/2011 Amite River Basin	9 110.00	
42217 PMT - 03339 Mar 29/2011 Expense Recovery	9 110.00	
42741 Photocopies X11	152 33.28 4571	
Apr 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 175	5.00	
42967 Final revisions of RFQ on	437.50 4571	
Engineering Services. Forward		
T A 1		
to Dietmar, Larry Ardoin and		
Lloyd Scallen for his review.	5.00	
Lloyd Scallen for his review.		
Lloyd Scallen for his review. Apr 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 175. 42972 Emails from DOTD with sugges changes; incorporate changes		
Lloyd Scallen for his review. Apr 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 175 42972 Emails from DOTD with suggest changes; incorporate changes and forward to Dietmar.		
Lloyd Scallen for his review. Apr 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 175 42972 Emails from DOTD with sugges changes; incorporate changes and forward to Dietmar. Apr 7/2011 Billing on Invoice 4571	sted 70.00 4571	
Lloyd Scallen for his review. Apr 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 175 42972 Emails from DOTD with sugges changes; incorporate changes and forward to Dietmar. Apr 7/2011 Billing on Invoice 4571 43574 FEES 2257.50		
Lloyd Scallen for his review. Apr 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 175 42972 Emails from DOTD with sugges changes; incorporate changes and forward to Dietmar. Apr 7/2011 Billing on Invoice 4571 43574 FEES 2257.50 DISBS 33.28	sted 70.00 4571	
Lloyd Scallen for his review. Apr 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 175 42972 Emails from DOTD with sugges changes; incorporate changes and forward to Dietmar. Apr 7/2011 Billing on Invoice 4571 43574 FEES 2257.50	0.00 4571 0.00 4571	
Lloyd Scallen for his review. Apr 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 175 42972 Emails from DOTD with sugges changes; incorporate changes and forward to Dietmar. Apr 7/2011 Billing on Invoice 4571 43574 FEES 2257.50 DISBS 33.28 Apr 7/2011 Expense Recovery	0.00 4571 0.00 4571 52 0.44 4586	

Apr 14/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	
43915 Make final revisions to RFQ;	75.00 4586
forward to Dietmar and Harvey	
Blanchard.	
Apr 18/2011 Amite River Basin	
44022 PMT - 03387 33.28	
Apr 18/2011 Amite River Basin	
44023 PMT - 03387 2257.50	
Apr 19/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00	
Apr 19/2011 Edwyci. ESB 0.20 IIIs 11 10000	30.00 4586
44301 Additional drafting of CEA.	
Transmit to client.	
Apr 25/2011 expense recovery 44457 Photocopies X1179 3.76	4586
44437 Thotocopies	4500
Apr 28/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	75.00 4586
44955 Prepare public notice for RFQ;	75.00 4586
forwaded attachments to Staff	
to advertisment of bid.	
May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00	
44824 Telephone to DOTD expropriation	60.00 4586
attorney; email to legal	
counsel for CEA; email to	
Larry Ardoin; and Dietmar.	
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, I	L.L.C. Page: 569
Client Ledger	
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014	
- · · · - · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Bld Trust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To Chq# General	2.0
	Fees Inv# Acc Rents Dishs
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs	Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney;	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting.	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586	75.00 4586
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 0.00	
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 0.00	75.00 4586
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00	75.00 4586 4586
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00	75.00 4586
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ.	75.00 4586 4586
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ.	75.00 4586 4586
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00	75.00 4586 4586
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ.	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 45829 Further revision to addendum	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 45829 Further revision to addendum for FRQ.	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 45829 Further revision to addendum for FRQ. May 16/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681 187.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 45829 Further revision to addendum for FRQ. May 16/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 46512 Revise RFQ; Forward to Dietmar	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681 187.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 45829 Further revision to addendum for FRQ. May 16/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 46512 Revise RFQ; Forward to Dietmar and Lawerence.	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681 187.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 45829 Further revision to addendum for FRQ. May 16/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 46512 Revise RFQ; Forward to Dietmar and Lawerence. May 17/2011 Amite River Basin	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681 187.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 45829 Further revision to addendum for FRQ. May 16/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 46512 Revise RFQ; Forward to Dietmar and Lawerence. May 17/2011 Amite River Basin 45724 PMT - 03418 4.20	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681 187.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 0.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 45829 Further revision to addendum for FRQ. May 16/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 46512 Revise RFQ; Forward to Dietmar and Lawerence. May 17/2011 Amite River Basin 45724 PMT - 03418 4.20 May 17/2011 Amite River Basin	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681 187.50 4681
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcpts Disbs Balance May 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 44887 Email from DOTD attorney; forward copy of RFQ; email requesting meeting. May 2/2011 Billing on Invoice 4586 44963 FEES 360.00 DISBS 4.20 May 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45074 Telephone call to CSRS concerning RFQ. May 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 45187 Email to Toni concerning addendum to RFQ. May 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 45829 Further revision to addendum for FRQ. May 16/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00 46512 Revise RFQ; Forward to Dietmar and Lawerence. May 17/2011 Amite River Basin 45724 PMT - 03418 4.20	75.00 4586 4586 37.50 4681 37.50 4681 187.50 4681

May 20/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00	30.00 4681
45982 Telephone inquiry from Karla Weston at CDCBR concerning RFQ. May 23/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 46074 Email from Dietmar concerning inquiry by Gravois; respond to question by email.	
May 24/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 46105 Telephone call to potential vendor.	30.00 4681
May 26/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00 46516 Respond to inquiry from several vendors concerning RFQ.	15.00 4681
May 31/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 46285 Review of draft of RFQ scoring. May 31/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00	60.00 4081
46286 Respond to question from Forte and Tablada.	30.00 4681
May 31/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 150.00 46290 Respond to inquiry for possible bidder. Telephone call from Ronnie Champlan; email to Toni	45.00 4681
concerning same. May 31/2011 Expense Recovery 46361 Photocopies X1209	38.24 4681
	ston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 570 Ledger
Nov/ 1/20	10 To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Ch	q# General Bld Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Balance	Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
46517 Reviewed RFQ addendum. Prepared criteria evaluation form. Email to Dietmar.	120.00 4681
Jun 1/2011 Billing on Invoice 4681 46523 FEES 810.00 DISBS 38.24	0.00 4681
Jun 1/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 46674 Review of listing of RFQ's email to Toni concerning same.	37.50 4909
46674 Review of listing of RFQ's email to Toni concerning same. Jun 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 46751 Review of submittal and review of revised document. Email to	37.50 4909 60.00 4909
46674 Review of listing of RFQ's email to Toni concerning same. Jun 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 46751 Review of submittal and review of revised document. Email to Lawrence. Jun 7/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 46951 Email from Toni concerning RFO.	60.00 4909
46674 Review of listing of RFQ's email to Toni concerning same. Jun 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00 46751 Review of submittal and review of revised document. Email to Lawrence. Jun 7/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00	

review process and answer questions about RFQ. Jun 14/2011 Amite River Basin Drainage 47162 PMT - 03465	120.00	
Jun 14/2011 Amite River Basin Drainage 47163 PMT - 03465	38.24	
Jun 14/2011 Amite River Basin Drainage 47164 PMT - 03465	690.00	
Jun 16/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00 47329 Meeting with selection	225.00 4909	
committee, review scoring and		
caculate score. Jun 21/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 47524 Telephone call to Dietmar; telephone call to Lawrence;	150.00 4909	
draft motion for meeting. Jun 22/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 47565 Telephone call from Dietmar	30.00 4909	
Jun 23/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00 47581 Telephone call from Lawrence Callendar; telephone call from Miles Williams	37.50 4909	
Assign task to associate. Email to Dietmar. Jun 23/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 47587 Receipt of public records request; review of law;	75.00 4909	
Juli/ 11/2014	eston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 571 t Ledger	
Nov/ 1/20	010 To May/ 1/2014	,
Date Received From/Paid To C	inq" Solicial	
Entry # Explanation Rec#	Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs	
assign task to assoicate.		
Jun 23/2011 Lawyer: JHL 1.80 Hrs X 120.00 47606 Legal research	216.00 4909	
public records		
with LSB. Reviewed records request from Miles Williams. Prepared letter to Miles Williams.		
Jun 24/2011 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 120.00 47634 Email to Miles Williams.	24.00 4909	
Jun 29/2011 Expense Recovery 47748 Photocopies X1230 Jul 5/2011 Billing on Invoice 4909	0.40 4909	

48389 FEES 1185			0.00	4909			
DISRS 0.40							
Jul 5/2011 Lawyer: LSB	0.50 Hrs X 150.00			75.00 507	75		
40006 Review of PLI	Jaran						
Professional Servemail to Dietmar	/ice Contract,						
Jul 8/2011 Lawyer: LSB	0.50 Hrs X 150.00				5075		
49216 Review of dra	ft document for			75.00	5075		
contract with RF	O providers.						
Jul 9/2011 Lawyer: LSB	3 0.20 Hrs X 150.00			20.00 50	75		
49225 Review of pre	vious draft			30.00 50)75		
contract and assi	gn task to						
naralegal.							
Jul 11/2011 Lawyer: JHI	_ 0.20 Hrs X 120.00			24.00	5075		
49498 Prepared letter	to Gray Sexton			24.00	3073		
re public records							
Jul 11/2011 Lawyer: LS	B 1.50 Hrs X 150.00			225.00	5075		
49510 Review of doo	duments in public			223.00			
records request;	aran letter						
to Sexton, Iorwa	rd CD to ARBC.						
Jul 14/2011 Amite River 49680 PMT -	03759	240.00					
Jul 14/2011 Amite River		210.00					
49681 PMT -	03759	0.40					
Jul 14/2011 Amite River							
49682 PMT -	03759	945.00					
Jul 14/2011 Lawyer: LS	B 0.50 Hrs X 150.00						
49705 Review of rate				75.00	5075		
review with Diet							
Jul 14/2011 Lawyer: LS				20.00	5075		
49707 Email from C	omeaux			30.00	5075		
L-1 14/2011 Lawrence S	D 1 00 Hz V 150 00						
Jul 14/2011 Lawyer: LSI 49719 Review of dra				150.00	5075		
Jun/11/2014		ston & Ass	ociates I		3073		Page: 572
3411/11/2014		t Ledger	ociates, L.	L.C.			Fage. 372
		110 To May	/ 1/2014				
Date Received From		hq#			Bld -	Tr	ust Activity
		1		'	214	11	ust rictivity
Entry # Explanation	Rec#	Repts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc	Rcpts	Disbs
Balance						1	
•							
revise terms.	20011-3715000						
Jul 15/2011 Lawyer: LSE 49748 Review of conf	2.00 Hrs X 150.00						
necessary change				300.00	5075		
Jul 20/2011 Lawyer: LSB	5. 0.20 Urg V 150 00						
49967 Review of a fin	al copy of the			20.00 5	075		
contract; email to				30.00 50	075		
Jul 25/2011 Lawyer: LSB	0.50 Hrs X 150 00						
50111 Telephone call	from Tom Gardner			75.00	5075		
				73.00	30/3		
Jul 25/2011 Lawyer: LSB	0.50 Hrs X 150.00						

50115 Review of protest from Sigma.	75.00 5075
Forward to BKI. Jul 27/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 50341 Email from Ditemar	30.00 5075
Jul 27/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 50344 telephone conference with Lawrence Callender. Emai to Dietmar.	30.00 5075
Jul 27/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00 50347 Review of response submitted by BKI. Assign task to associate.	150.00 5075
Jul 27/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 50348 Review of email concerning DOTD RFQ.	30.00 5075
Aug 1/2011 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 65.00 50430 email to Todd Hebert	6.50 5075
Aug 1/2011 Lawyer: PL-2 0.20 Hrs X 60.00 50449 Drafted letter to Todd Hebert	12.00 5075
Aug 1/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00 50478 Telephone Conference with Tom Gardner, Telephone Conference with Todd Hebert; telephone conference Mike Chopin;	112.50 5075
telephone conference with Dietmar; draft protest letter to Hebert. Aug 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00	
50482 telephone conference to Todd Hebert	30.00 5075
Aug 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00 50639 Email from Dietmar respond by email to Dietmar.	30.00 5075
Client Ledg Nov/ 1/2010 To	May/ 1/2014
Entry # Explanation Rec# Rcp Balance	ts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs
50640 Email to all parties with contract to vendors.	30.00 5075
Aug 2/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 150.00 51737 Telephone call with Todd Hebert regarding protest	45.00 5169
Aug 3/2011 Expense Recovery 50516 Photocopies 10 color @ .15; 24 X1249	3.90 5075

bw @ .10						
Aug 4/2011 Billing on Invoice 507	5					
50758 FEES 1625.00		0.00	5075			
DISBS 3.90						
Aug 4/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hr	s X 150.00					
50836 Telephone Conference fr	om		30.00	5169		
Lawerence; email to Dietm	ar.					
Aug 8/2011 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hr	s X 150.00					
50970 Review of BKI response	s to		150.00	5169		
intent to Protest.						
Aug 9/2011 Lawyer: LSB 2.20 Hr	s X 150.00					
51037 Attend meeting with Sign	ma owner		330.0	0 5169		
and attorney. Aug 10/2011 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 H	rs X 150 00					
51086 Meeting at DOTD conce	rning its		450.00	5169		
RFQ; meeting with BKI an	d GCR					
to approve process	u dek					
to approve process. Aug 10/2011 Amite River Basin						
52602 PMT -	03975 24.0	00				
Aug 10/2011 Amite River Basin	03773 21.					
	03975 3.9	0				
52603 PMT -	03913 3.9	· O				
Aug 10/2011 Amite River Basin	03975 1582	50				
52604 PMT -	03973 1302	50				
Aug 10/2011 Amite River Basin	03975 6.5	0				
52605 PMT -	03973 0.3	U				
Aug 10/2011 Amite River Basin	03975 12.0	00				
52606 PMT -		30				
Aug 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 H			30.00	5169		
51690 Review of draft task orde	er and		30.00	3107		
respond by e-mail	w V 150 00					
Aug 15/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 H			60.00	5169		
52666 Telephone call to Tom C			00.00	5107		
telephone call to Todd Heb						
telephone call to Mike Chop)III,					
draft letter to Hebert						
Aug 23/2011 Expense Recovery	X1268	9	0.30	5169		
51592 Photocopies 3 BW @ .10	A1200	•	0.30	3109		
Sep 6/2011 Billing on Invoice 5169	,	0.00	5169			
52676 FEES 1095.00		0.00	3109			
DISBS 0.30	v 150.00					
Sep 13/2011 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hr	S A 130.00		37.5	50 5279		
53307 Receipt and review of Do		P. Associates		3219		Page: 574
Jun/11/2014		& Associates,	L.L.C.			1 age. 574
	Client Ledg		1			
D	Nov/ 1/2010 T			PIA I	T _*	ust Activity
Date Received From/Paid To	Cnq#	Gener	al	Bid	11	ust Activity
	D // D	nta Dial	Food	Inv# Acc	Repts	Disbs
Entry # Explanation	Rec# Rc	pts Dish	s Fees	IIIv# Acc	Repts	Disos
Balance						
G 21/2011 APPG						
Sep 21/2011 ARBC	04026 0.24	n -				
53700 PMT -	04036 0.30	o .				
Sep 21/2011 ARBC						