75324 Receipt and review of 75.00 7436

plaintiff's responses to 2nd
request for Admissions,
Interrogatories and Requests
for Production
Sep 20/2012  Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00

75331 Telephone call to Nicole Gould
Sep 20/20|! ”awyer: |I!! l!!!! Hrs X 150.00
75332 Receipt and review of email 60.00 7436
from East Baton Rouge Parish
sheriff's attorney regarding
depositions and discovery;
amended answer

Sep 20/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
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75337 Email to Mary Kinsey, USACE 30.00 7436
attorney
Sep 20/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
75338 Receipt of notice of hearing 30.00 7436
Sep 20/2012  Expense Recovery
75531 Postage - Letter to Cheryl L. X1573 2.30 7436
Duvielh enclosing three
original CEAs
Sep 21/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00
75358 Prepared 84.00 7436
Sep 21/20 awyer: LSB_0.50 Hrs X 150.00
75481 Review 75.00 7436
Sep 21/2012  Lawyer: L .50 Hrs .00
75487 Respond to email from DOTD 75.00 7436
attorney regarding capital
outlay
Sep 24/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
75419 Review of correspondence to 14.00 7436
Blanchfield
Sep 24/20 awyer: J 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 P

75435 Correspondence from Dietmar
Sep 24/20'! |!awycr: !!! !!!! !rs l( 150.00
75498 Email from Dietmar_ 37.50 7436

Sep 24/2 “awyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X'150.00
75507 Revise subpoena to Jay Harris 112.50 7436
Sep 24/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00

shea JSoan e o8 AR £ AT
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75935 Email to Dietmar; | | | 15.00 7436

Sep 25/201 awyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X 60.00
75461 receipt and review email from 12.00 7436
Grodner regarding Thompson
deposition, mark dates for LSB
review
Sep 25/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
75467 Email from Grodner's office 14.00 7436
regarding the deposition of D.
Thompson.
Sep 25/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
75522 Review of documents 75.00 7436
; email to associate;
assign task
Sep 26/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
75588 Review of documents- 14.00 7436
from Dietmar.
Sep 26/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00
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""""""""""" 84.00 7436

75592 Review of documents produced by
Grodner in response to ARBC
Requests for Production.
Sep 26/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
75595 Review of Summar 14.00 7436

Sep 26/20 awyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00 ss00 7436
75672 Review of summary J
Sep 27/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs
75621 Phone call from Cathy St.
Pierre regarding depositons,
discovery, and procedural
plans.
Sep 27/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 W
75624 Email to Cathy St. Pierre )
regarding noticing additional
depositions. -
012 Court Reporters 0
Sep72586/§8 Deposition gosts - 1442 7325 190.50 7436
Deposition Costs of APP Group,
LLC .
28/2012 Court Reporters 0
Sep75660 Deposition gosts - Anna Mae 7326 284.20 7436
Jones - Invoice 13439WK

Sep 28/2012  Court Reporters of LA

42.00 7436
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75662 Deposition Costs - Terry 7327 316.20 7436

Campbell - Invoice 13435WK
Sep 28/2012 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00
75683 call to Thompson 6.00 7436

Sep 28/2012  Expense Recovery
75704 Photocopies - 82 @0.15 each; X1574 172.50 7436

1602 BW @ 0.10 each
Sep 28/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
75752 Correpondence from Grodner 14.00 7436
regarding EBRSO discovery.
Sep 28/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

75754  Email from Cathy St. Pierre 14.00 7436

Sep 28/20 Lawyer: | i rs X 140.00
75762 Email from Gordner's office 14.00 7436
regarding the deposition of D.
Thompson.
Sep 28/2012 Lawyer: LSB_0.40 Hrs X 150.00

75774 Email 60.00 7436

respond to email

Jun/11/20 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 341
Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

Date Received From/Paid To Chg#  |-=--- General ----- | | 231 R —— Trust Activity

Entry # Explanation Rect Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
Balance

Oct 1/2012 Lawyer: JHL. 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
75810 Email from Grodner regarding 14.00 7436
pretrial conference.
Oct 1/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
75891 Email from St. Pierre regarding 15.00 7436
deposition of Ms. Campbell
Oct 2/2012 Billing on Invoice 7436
75971 FEES 9237.00 0.00 7436
DISBS  1296.80
Oct 2/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
76020 Correspondence from Grodner's 28.00 7478
office regarding ARBD
documents.
Oct 2/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00

76056 Letter from Wayne Maldando 30.00 7478
Oct 3/20|! |!awyer: ||!! O.l() Hrs X 140.00
76094 Correspondence with Cathy St. 14.00 7478
Pierre
Oct 3/20 awyer: LS 3 .
76122 Email from Wayne Maldando on 15.00 7478
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Oct 3/20|! |!awyer: !||-! '.00 Hrs X 60.00
76714 P 60.00 7478
Oct 3/20 ;awyer: PL-2 4.50 Hrs X 60.00

76715 _Compile 270.00 7478

Oct 4/20 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76153 Receipt and review of Grodner's 14.00 7478

discovery requests to Sheriffs

and Assessors.
Oct 4/2012 Lawyer: JIIL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00

76154 Phone call to Nicole Gould 28.00 7478
regarding legal issues
Oct 4/20|! |!awyer: JHL !! |!! Hrs X 140.00
76155 Discussed legal issues with LSB 14.00 7478

Oct 4/20 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76162 Receipt and review of notice of 14.00 7478
deposition of Thompson from
Grodner.
Oct 4/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76163 Review of correspondence from 14.00 7478
Gould to Grodner regarding
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discovery responses.
Oct 5/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76205 Correspondence from Grodner
regarding discovery
verification.
Oct 5/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
76215 Prepared letter to Grodner
regarding Thompson's
deposition.
Oct 5/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76218 Email to Gould regarding

14.00 7478

28.00 7478

14.00 7478

SB rs X 150.00

Oct 5/20 awyer: ’
d review of discovery

76237 Receipt an
to Sheriff]

F; assign task to associate
Oct 5/20

Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
file:///F|/...rainage%20& %20 Water%20C onservation%20District/Public%20Records%20R cquest/2014.06.16%201046-Client
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76239 Receipt and review of notice of 37.50 7478
deposition of Donations
Thompson; assign task to
associate
Oct 5/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
76240 Receipt and review of letter to 15.00 7478
Grodner regarding Livingston
Sheriff's discovery
Oct 52012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00

76245 Receipt and review of letter 15.00 7478
from Grodner on verification
Oct 5/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 4.00 Hrs X 60.00
76710 Research 240.00 7478
Oct 8/20 awyer: .10 Hrs X 140.00
Corrspondence from Dietmar 14.00 7478
Oct 8/201 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76267 Review of docket report 14.00 7478
Oct 8/20 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
14.00 7478

76273 Correspondence with Nicole

Oct 8/20 Jawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00

Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 343
Client Ledger
) Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Date | Received From/Paid To Chg#  |----- General ----- | Bld |----=------ Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

Balance

76308 Review capi
—cdpltal 37.50 7478

outlay

Oct 8/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 0.75 Hr
: X s X 60.
76705 Research e
45.00 7478
Oct 8/20 ¢ 3
yer: ./5 Hrs X 60.00
76706  Research 45
.00 7478
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Oct 8/20‘2 |!awyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs X 60.00

76707 _Research 120.00 7478
Oct 8/20 3 60.00
76708 Research 30.00 7478
Oct 8/20 Lawyer: 1.75 Hrs X 60.00
76709 Draft summaries 105.00 7478
Oct 9/20 awyer: g
76403 _email to Malando 6.00 7478
Oct 9/20 awyer: 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76429 Receipt and review of APSO's 14.00 7478
supplemental discovery
responses.
Oct 9/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76440 Receipt and review of EBRSO's 14.00 7478
third set of interrogatories
to Plaintiff.
Oct 9/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76441 Email to Cathy St. Pierre 14.00 7478
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Oct 9/20‘! !awyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
76442 Review of memorandum 28.00 7478

Oct 9/20 awyer: | ;
76443 Email from Cathy St. Pierre 14.00 7478

regarding payment by
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individual taxpayers and
Janell Campbell's deposition.
Oct 9/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
76497 Receipt and review of email
from Cathy St. Pierre; assign
task to associate
Oct 9/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
76501 Receipt and review of second
supplemental responses of Asc.
discovery
Oct 9/2012 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00
76504 Review of] research;
assign task to associate
Oct 9/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs X 60.00
76704 Draft research memorandum

Oct 10/20
76461 PMT - For Services Rendered
Oct 10/2012 ARBD
76462 PMT - For Services Rendered
Oct 10/2012 ARBD
76463 PMT - For Services Rendered
Oct 10/2012 ARBD
76464 PMT - For Services Rendered
Oct 10/2012 ARBD
76465 PMT - For Services Rendered
Oct 10/2012 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00
76526 email to all counsel regarding
dates for Janell Campbell
deposition
Oct 10/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

76542 Email to Brian Eddington
Oct 10/20|! !awyer: |L|!| !!”! !rs ! 140.00
76545 Correspondence from Gould
Jun/11/20 I!

Received From/Paid To

Rec#

04939
04939
04939
04939

04939
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Oct 10/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

76548 Correspondence from Cathy St.

Oct 10/20 :
76555 Correspondence with Cody Martin

file:///E|/.. rainage%208&%20Water%20C onservation

awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

%2()District/Public%20Rccords%20chuest/ 2014.06.1

30.00 7478
37.50 7478
150.00 7478
180.00 7478
4072.00
1296.80
4387.50
117.50
660.00
6.00 7478
14.00 7478
14.00 7478
Page: 345
--- General ----- | Bld |------==--- Trust Activity
Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
14.00 7478
14.00 7478

6%201046-Client%20Ledger.txt| 6/16/2014 9:49:59 AM]



—_——

Oct 10/2()|! Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00

76631 Email 60.00 7478

email to a

attorneys
Oct 10/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
76638 Emails from attorneys from 37.50 7478
Ascension and Livingston on
tax bill
Oct 11/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00
76579 Discussed legal issues with LSB 08.00 7478

Oct 11/20 awyer: Hrs X 140.00
76586 Obtained signed Order from the 98.00 7478
19th JDC.
Oct 11/2012  Lawyer: JHL_1.00 Hrs X 140.00
76588 Legal research

140.00 7478

rs X 140.00

Oct 11/20 awyer: |

76590 Revised Subpoena 56.00 7478

Oct 11/201 awyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140. 00
76591 Email to David Bordelon and 28.00 7478

Wayne Maldonado

Oct 11/20
76641 Meeting with associate; 150.00 7478

Oct 11/20 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00

76651 Email_ 37.50 7478
Oct 11/2012 Expense Recovery

77483 Parking X1584 1.03 7478
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Oct 11/2012  Expense Recovery
77606 Milecage Reimbursement - to X1589 9.90 7478
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19th JDC to obtain signed order
Oct 12/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76720 Correspondence from Gronder
regarding deposition of
Thompson.
Oct 12/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76727 Correspondence from Grodner
regarding depositions.
Oct 12/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
76735 Receipt and review of email to
D. Thompson
email from Donna regarding
deposition of Campbell
Oct 14/2012  Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
76755 Email to D. Grodner on
deposition
Oct 14/2012 Lawyer; LSB_0.20 Hrs X 150.00
76757 Review of] letter; assign
task to law cler
Oct 14/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00
76763 Preparation for hearing
Oct 15/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76782 Correspondence from Grodner
regarding the deposition of
Janell Campbell.
Oct 15/2012  Lawyer: JHL 3.70 Hrs X 140.00
76785 Status conference with Judge
Fields regarding special
master.
Oct 15/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
7678

6 Correspondence from Maldonado
Oct 15/20|! !awyer: ||H|| !!I!! !!s! |40.00

76794 Email to all counsel regarding
hearing date re special master.
Oct 15/2012 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00

76799 Attend hearing on S;ﬁ:ial

Master; email to client
Oct 15/20|! |!awyer: |,SB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
76804 Telephone call with Judge
Fields and Donna Grodner
Oct 15/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
76808 Email to Grodner regarding
Thompson deposition
Oct 15/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
76809 Receipt and review of Urbino

Jun/11/2014

Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Chg# General

Received From/Paid To

Entry # Explanation
Balance

Rect# Repts Disbs

file:///F|/...rainage%20& %20Water%20C: onservation%20District/Public%20Records%20Reque

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

14.00 7478

14.00 7478

37.50 7478

30.00 7478

30.00 7478

112.50 7478

14.00 7478

518.00 7478

14.00 7478

14.00 7478

450.00 7478

75.00 7478

15.00 7478

30.00 7478

Page: 347

Trust Activity

Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

st/2014.06.16%201046-Client%20Ledger.txt[6/16/2014 9:49:59 AM]

e Y A R T T e W W




bar information; email to
defense team
Oct 15/2012 Expense Recovery
77486 Parking X1584 8.00 7478
Oct 16/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs X 60.00

76833 Analyze 120.00 7478
Oct 16/2 .50 Hrs X 60.00

76834 Research 90.00 7478
Oct 16/20 R .00 Hrs X 60.00

76835 Draft memo 120.00 7478

Oct 16/20 awyer: 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76838 Correspondence from 14.00 7478
co-defendants regarding

special master.
Oct 16/2012 Lawyer: JHI. 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

76840 Receipt and review of Reynolds' 14.00 7478
Motion to Enroll for State
Defendants.
Oct 16/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76841 Receipt and review of 14.00 7478

Plaintiff's responses to
EBRSO's Third Discovery
Requests.
Oct 16/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76846 Review of Summa 14.00 7478

Oct 16/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
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76863 Receipt and review of state's
motion to enroll additional
counsel
Oct 16/2012  Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 150.00
76864 Review of draft memo

Oct 16/20 awyer: 0.40 Hrs X 150.00
76866 Receipt and review of
plaintiff's 3rd set of
interrogatories from EBR
Sheriff
Oct 16/2012 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00
76868 Attend board meeting; issues
related to law suit
Oct 17/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00
76900 Research

Oct 17/20 awyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
76901 Correspondence with Chuck
McMains.
Oct 17/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00
76908 Research

Oct 17/20 awyer: 0.50 Hrs X 140.00
76910 Conference call with all
defense counsel regarding
special master.
Oct 17/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76911 Email review of Nicole
regarding special master case
law.
Oct 17/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.80 Hrs X 140.00
76913 Legal research

Oct 17/20 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
76926 Conference call with other
attorneys regarding Special
Master
Oct 17/2012  Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00
76930 Research
Oct 17/2012 Lawyer: PL- rs X 60.00
77246 Conference call with counsel
for co-defendants in re

15.00 7478

45.00 7478

60.00 7478

225.00 7478

56.00 7478

28.00 7478

56.00 7478

70.00 7478

14.00 7478

112.00 7478

75.00 7478

150.00 7478

30.00 7478
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special master.
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Oct 17/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 0.50 Hrs X 60.00

77247 Retrieve cases and law journal 30.00 7478
Oct 17/20

77487 Parking X1584 4.00 7478
Oct 17/2012  Expense Recovery

77489 Parking X1584 6.00 7478
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: JHL 2.40 Hrs X 140.00

76934 Meeting with Judge Fields and 336.00 7478

all counsel in chambers and
Ruling in open court regarding
special master.
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00
76936 Prepared Order setting all 56.00 7478
remaining matters for hearing.
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Irs X 140.00
76937 Prepared Order regarding 56.00 7478
special master.
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X 140.00

76938 Revised and updated summaryl 126.00 7478
Oct 18/20|! |/awyer: ”H“ !”O Hrs X 140.00
76940 Email to Grodner regarding 14.00 7478
Notice and Method of
Dissemination.
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
76946 Email to all defense counsel 28.00 7478
regarding proposed Orders.
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76949 Correspondence with dfense 14.00 7478
counsel regarding Orders re
special master and setting
hearing.
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: JHL _1.20 Hrs X 140.00

76950 Legal research 168.00 7478

Oct 18/20 awyer: .00 Hrs X 150.00
76951 Attend hearing on Special Master
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00

300.00 7478
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76953 Meeting with associate
Oct 18/20|! !awyer: ||!! |!!! |!rs X 150.00

76954 Meeting with plaintiff
attorney, John Tyler regarding
Jun/11/2014
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status of case
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
76957 Receipt and review of draft of
orders on special master;
order on hearing items October
26th
Oct 18/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
76958 Review of revised
Oct 19/2012 Lawyer: PL-1 0.40 Hrs .00
76971 draft Notice of Deposition of
Janell Campbell
Oct 19/2012 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00
76972 call to clerk for filing fee
for deposition and subpoena of
Janell Campbell
Oct 19/2012 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X 60.00
76973 letter to clerk of court for
subpoena of Janell Campbell
Oct 19/2012 Clerk of Court
76975 Filing Fees - Subpoena to 7380
Janell Campbell -
Oct 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76990 Review of Notice of Deposition
of Janell Campbell.
Oct 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76996 Email to Plaintiffs regarding
Orders.
Oct 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
76997 Receipt and review of LPSO's
responses to Plaintiff's
discovery requests regarding
value of tax payments.
Oct 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00
77006 Review of case law

Oct 19/20 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
77033 Notice of Deposition; letter to
all regarding Campbell
Oct 19/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
77040 Review of discovery on jury
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trial limit
Oct 19/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 1.00 Hrs X 60.00

77249 Research 60.00 7478
Oct 22/2 ssociated Reporters, Inc.
77046 Deposition Costs Invoice No. 7381 745.85 7478

80647 - Dietmar and Toni
Oct 22/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
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77050 Phone call from Cody Martin 14.00 7478

regarding depositions.
Oct 22/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77051 Correspondence from Grodner 14.00 7478
regarding discovery.
Oct 22/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
77052 Review of memorandum and case 28.00 7478
law from Whittington regarding
right to jury.
Oct 22/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

77060 Receipt and review of Acension 14.00 7478
Sheriff and Assessor discovery
responses.
Oct 22/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77061 Correspondence from Cathy St. 14.00 7478

Pierre regarding EBR Cheriff's
discovery responses.
Oct 22/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77063 Correspondence from Cathy St. 14.00 7478

Oct 22/20 awyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
77129 Review of plaintiffs'
discovery; directed to taxing
bodies; review of research;
assign task to law clerk
Oct 22/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
77131 Telephone call to Clo Fontenot;
arrange meeting; email copies
Oct 22/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
77139 Receipt and review of written 30.00 7478
discovery to sheriff
Oct 22/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs X 60.00
77250 _Research

75.00 7478

75.00 7478

120.00 7478
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Oct 22/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs X 60.00
77251 Draft memo 120.00 7478

Oct 23/2 awyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00
77164 Prepared questions for Anna Mae 84.00 7478
Jones and APP Group for the
class representative hearing.
Oct 23/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77172  Phone call from Kelly with 14.00 7478

Wayne Maldonado's office
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Oct 23/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
77186 Receipt and review of motion to 15.00 7478
enroll additional counsel by
AAIC insurance
Oct 24/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

77208 Correspondence from Cathy St. 14.00 7478
Pierre regarding discovery
responses.
Oct 24/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77209 Receipt and review of discovery 14.00 7478

responses from PLaintiff.
Oct 24/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77213  Email from Maldonado

14.00 7478

Oct 24/20 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

77217 Legal research 14.00 7478

Oct 24/20 awyer: .10 Hrs X 140.00
77218 Email to Wayne Maldonado 14.00
Oct 24/201! |!awycr: JHL !!!!! !rs ! 140.00
77219 Correspondence with Donna 28.00
Grodner regarding Judgment
concerning special master.
Oct 24/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77220 Correspondence with Cathy St.
Pierre regarding judgment re

special master.
Oct 24/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00

7478

7478

14.00 7478
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77221 Revised Rule 9.5 Certificates 42.00 7478
for the proposed Judgment
regarding special master and
Order setting hearings.
Oct 24/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

77222 Correspondence with Peggy Deen 14.00 7478
regarding judgment re special
master.
Oct 24/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77223 Correspondence with Wayne 14.00 7478
Maldonado
Oct 24/20Fawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77224 Review of documents concerning 14.00 7478
APP Group produced by
Plaintiff.
Oct 24/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00
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77226 Review of bank documents from 42.00 7478
Connie.
Oct 24/2012  Expense Recovery
77578 Postage - to Clerk of Court X1587 1.30 7478
filing judgment plus return
envelope
Oct 24/2012  Expense Recovery
77579 Postage - copy of letter to X1587 0.65 7478

Clerk of Court filing judgment
to Judge Fields
Oct 25/2012  Clerk of Court
77233 Filing Fees - Order 7389 5.00 7478
Oct 25/2012  Lawyer: PL-2 4.00 Hrs X 60.00

77252  Draft memo 240.00 7478

Oct 25/2 awyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00
77253 email to all counsel with dates
for Hugh Martin deposition
Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77262 Prepare)é letter to Clerk of 14.00 7478
Court regarding Orders.
Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00 e S
77267 Review of PLaintiff's discovery :
responses in preparation for
status conference.
Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00

6.00 7478
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77268 Correspondence with all defense 28.00 7478
counsel regarding discovery
deadlines and status
conference.
Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77275 Email from Cathy St. Pierre 14.00 7478
regarding additional discovery.
Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00

77276 Review of memorandum 28.00 7478

Oct 25/20 awyer: JHL 0. Hrs X 140.00
77280 Preparation for 10/26 hearing
regarding additional class
representatives and exception
of no right of action.
Oct 25/2012  Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
77285 Receipt and review of letter 15.00 7478
from East Baton Rouge Sheriff

to plaintiff

70.00 7478

Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X [50.00 io 778
77286 Receipt and review of plaintiff . 30. e
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class responses to 3rd set of
interrogatories from East
Baton Rouge Sheriff
Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
77289 Email from Hugh Martin; assign 30.00 7478
task to associate
Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
77290 Email from Wayne Maldanado; 37.50 7478
respond to email
Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
77291 Email regarding the judgment on 37.50 7478
special master
Oct 25/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
77294 Letter from Maldonado; assigh 15.00 7478

Oct 25/20 awyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
77352  Preparation for hearing on 37.50 7478
various issues
Oct 25/2012 Expense Recover
77580 Postage -

X1587 3.60 7478
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Oct 25/20 xpense Recovery
77581 Postage - to COC filing Order
plus return envelope
Oct 25/2012 Expense Recovery
77582 Postage - copy of letter to COC X1587 0.45 7478
filing Order to Judge Fields
Oct 26/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

X1587 1.05 7478

77323 Email from Grodner regarding 14.00 7478
class action Notice.
Oct 26/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
77353 Emails from other defendants 75.00 7478
Oct 26/2012 Lawyer: LSB 3.00 Hrs X 150.00
77361 Attend hearing on 450.00 7478
dissemination; notice and
approval of class notice;
motion to amend class
representative exception of no
right of action; meeting with
all counsel to agree to
dissemination language and
status conference.
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Oct 26/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
77363 Review of court orders from 75.00 7478
plaintiff's counsel
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
77369 Review of Suggested Method of
Dissemination, Class Notice,
and Judgment regarding
Exception of No Right of
Action sent from Plaintiff.
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77370 Review of correspondence from
all counsel regarding
revisions to Class Notice.
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77378 Phone call from Kclli Thibeau
Oct 29/20 awyer: .10 Hrs X 140.00
77384 Receipt and review of proposed

Order from Whittington
regarding preliminary exhibit

28.00 7478

14.00 7478

14.00 7478

14.00 7478
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and witness lists.
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

77385_ Discussed legal issues [ 14.00 7478
with LSB.
Oct 29/20 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
77386 Reviewed signed Order regarding 28.00 7478

Dissemination and Class Notice
and emailed to all defense
counsel.
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

77387 Email to Kelly Thibeaux 14.00 7478
Oct 29/20|! |!awyer: ||!|| !!lO Hrs X 140.00

77390 Receipt and review of 14.00 7478
Plaintiff's Motion to Quash
deposition of Janell Campbell.
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: LSB 3.20 Hrs X 150.00
77406 Attend hearing with Fields on 480.00 7478
motion and orders
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00

77407 Receipt and review of motion to 30.00 7478
enroll additional counsel by
Maldonado
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
77413 Receipt and review of proposed 37.50 7478

order on preliminary witness
and exhibit lists
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
77419 Telephone call to Demco 37.50 7478
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lobbyist; telephone call to
Demco attorney
Oct 29/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00

77420 Review of motion to quash 75.00 7478
subpoena of Ms. Campbell
Oct 302012 Lawyer: PL-1 0.30 Hrs X 60.00
77431 notice deposition of Hugh Martin 18.00 7478
Oct 30/2012 Lawyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X 60.00
77432 email to Wayne's assistant 12.00 7478
¢ : PL-2 1. rs X 60.00
Oct 30/20 awyer: PL-2 1.00 H R

77443 Review
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Oct 30/2012 TLawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
77447 Reviewed Court's Proposed 28.00 7478
Consent Order Appointing a
Special Master.
Oct 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
77448 Discussed 28.00 7478

with LSB.
Oct 30/20 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77452 Email from Rachel Kellogg 14.00 7478
regarding summary of hearing
infront of Judge Fields.
Oct 30/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77462 Email to all defense counsel 14.00 7478
regarding Consent Order
Appointing a Special Master.
Oct 30/2012  Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00

77466 Interview of Clo Fontenot 150.00 7478
Oct 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00
77467 Telephone conference with 187.50 7478

Gordon King; telephone
conference with Terry Ryder;
telephone conference with Mark

Drennan
Oct 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
77469 Notice of deposition of Hugh 30.00 7478
Martin
Oct 30/2012  Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
77477 Review of proposed special 75.00 7478

master order
Oct 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00

77478 Telephone call to attorneys 60.00 7478
over possible special master
Oct 31/2012 Expense Recovery
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77621 Photocopy Expense - 527 BW @ X1590 52.70 7478

$0.10 each

Oct 31/2012 Lawyer: PL-1 0.30 Hrs X 60.00
77674 create e-mail matrix for 18.00 7478
defense counsel and assistants
Oct 31/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs X 60.00
77685 Document review 180.00 7478
Oct 31/20 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
) . 14.00 7478

77687 Phone call from Cody Martin
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regarding special master.
Oct 31/2012 Lawyer: JHL. 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77689 Correspondence with Gould
regarding court's proposed
order for special master.
Oct 31/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00
77690 Review of Terry Campbell's 84.00 7478
deposition.
Oct 31/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00
77691 Legal research 56.00 7478

14.00 7478

Oct 31/20 Lawyer: JHL_0.60 Hrs X 140.00
77692 Legal research 84.00 7478

Oct737l /20 awyer: 1.60 Hrs X 140.00
693 Prepared Opposition to
Plaintiff's Mozgn to Quash Sl e
and for Protective Order.
OCI737I6/§0]2 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
5 Email to all defense counsel
regarding special master. sl
Oct 31/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77699 Correspondence with all defense 14.00 7478
counsel regarding conference to
discuss special master.
Oct 31/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00
77711 Review of draft memo in 60.00 7478
opposition to motion to quash
deposition of Janell Campbell
Nov 1/2012 Billing on Invoice 7478

77726 FEES  11348.50 0.00 7478
DISBS 924.53
Nov 1/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
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e 77803 Corrcspondence from Grodner 14.00 7547
regarding discovery responses.
Nov 1/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77807 __Review 14.00 7547
Nov I/20|! |!awycr: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
28.00 7547

77813 Review of
documents to respond to
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Donna's discovery request.
Nov 1/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77814 Email to Donna regarding Hugh 14.00 7547
Martin letter.
Nov 1/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77815 Correspondence and Order from 14.00 7547
Whittington regarding exchange
of preliminary witness and
exhibit lists.
Nov 1/2012 Lawyer: JHL 2.10 Hrs X 140.00

77819 Review ofF 294.00 7547
documents an ocuments

produced to Plaintiff in

W
Nov 1/2 awyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00

77825 Review of notice of deposition 15.00 7547
of Hugh Martin
Nov 1/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
77837 Receipt and review of court 30.00 7547
order on preliminary witness
list
Nov 1/2012 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00

77843 Review of| documents 150.00 7547
Nov 1/2012 Lawyer: .10 Hrs X 140.00
79058 Email to all defense counsel 14.00 7547
regarding conference ca]l-
Nov 2/20|! |!awyer: JHL !!!!! I—lrs X 140.00
77866 Preparation for the deposition 112.00 7547

of Hugh Martin.
Nov 5/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

77934 Correspondence from Chris 14.00 7547
Whittington regarding filing
judgment,
Nov 5/2012 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00
79059 Review draft opposition to 375.00 7547

motion to quash

Nov 5/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00

79060 _Review of news articles [ 112.50 7547
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Nov 6/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

77972 Corrcsiondence from Bill Eckert 14.00 7547
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Nov 6/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77976 Email to Chuck McMains
regarding meeting.
Nov 6/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
77980 Correspondence with LSB

Nov 6/20 awyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
77985 Telephone call from co-counsel
regarding status of case
Nov 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00
77988 Review of DOTD request
Nov 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
77989 Review of email from
co-counsel; assign task to
associate
Nov 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
77993 Review of judgment on exception
Nov 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
77996 Review of order; assign task to

associate
Nov 7/2012 Lawyer: PI.-2 4.75 Hrs X 60.00

78031 Categorize and detail

Nov 7/20 awyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00
78037 Telephone conference with all
counsel regarding special
master.
Nov 7/2012 Lawyer: JHL 1.70 Hrs X 140.00
78042 Review of articles

Nov 7/2 awyer: .10 Hrs X 140.00
78043 Correspondence from Grodner
regarding Hugh Martin letter.
Nov 7/2012 Lawyer: JHL _0.30 Hrs X 140.00
78045 Legal research

Nov 7/201 awyer: .30 Hrs X 140.00
78046 Prepared letter to Grodner
regarding Hugh Martin letter.
Nov 7/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00
78047 Prepared supplemental discovery

14.00 7547

14.00 7547

75.00 7547

60.00 7547

37.50 7547

37.50 7547

37.50 7547

285.00 7547

56.00 7547

238.00 7547

14.00 7547

42.00 7547

42.00 7547

56.00 7547
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response to plaintiff's
discovery request following
DOTD deposition.
Nov 7/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00

78069 Telephone call to Toni-
Nov 7/20'! I!awycr: L!E 0.40 Hrs X 150.00

78074 Conference call on special 60.00
master issue

Nov 7/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00

78075 Telephone call to Nicole Gould 30.00 7547
Nov 7/20|! Lawyer: L!! 0.25 Hrs X 150.00

37.50 7547

7547

78077 Email from Grodner regarding 37.50 7547
documents
Nov 7/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
78078 Telephone call from D. 75.00 7547

Thompson; letter to Donna
Grodner regarding deposition
of D. Thompson
Nov 7/2012 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00

78081 Review of news articles 187.50 7547
Nov 7/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
78083 Letter to Jeff David and Mark 75.00 7547
Drennan
Nov 8/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78118__Email from Wayndjj 14.00 7547

Nov 8/20 awyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X 140.00
78119 Legal resarch 126.00 7547

Nov 8/20 .awyer: R rs X 140.00
78120 Began preparing Motion in 84.00 7547
Limine to exclude Harris
testimoney, Order, and
Memorandum in Support.

Nov 8/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00

78191 Letters to Drennan and Davis 30.00 7547
Nov 8/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
78201 Email from Maldando- 30.00 7547

to Dietmar

Nov 8/20 Expense Recover
78887 _Posta e-m X1597 0.45 7547
#to ayne Maldonado

Nov 8/20 -xpense Recovery
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78891 Postage - letter to Mark X1597
Drennan regarding litigation
Nov 8/2012 Expense Recovery
78892 Postage - letter to Jeff David ~ X1597
regarding litigation
Nov 8/2012 Expense Recovery
78893 Postage - letter to Mark X1598
Drennan regarding litigation
Nov 8/2012 Expense Recovery
78894 Postage - letter to Jeff David X1598
regarding litigation
Nov 8/2012 Expense Recovery
78895 Postage - Letter to Mark X1599
Drennan regarding litigation

Nov 82012 Expense Recovery
78896 Postage - letter to Jeff David X1599

regarding litigation
Nov 9/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00
78138 Legal research regarding

Nov 13/2 awyer: PL-1 0.20 Hrs X 60.00
78205 letter to Grodner regarding
deposition date of Thompson
Nov 13/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78231 Correspondence with Maldonado
Nov l3/2!|! I!awycr: ||!|! !II!! !rs X 140.00
78234 Correspondence from Grodner
regarding deposition of
Thompson.
Nov 13/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
78244 Final review of Opposition to
Plaintiff's Motion to Quash.
Nov 13/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78254 Phone call to Chuck Mcmains.
Nov 13/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
78262 Letter from plaintiff's
attorney regarding deposition
of D. Thompson; telephone call
to D. Thompson
Nov 13/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
78269 Assign task to paralegal
Nov 14/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.80 Hrs X 140.00
78276 Legal research regarding

Jun/11/20

Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

0.45 7547

0.45 7547

0.45 7547

0.45 7547

98.00 7547

12.00 7547

14.00 7547

14.00 7547

28.00 7547

14,00 7547

30.00 7547

30.00 7547

112.00 7547
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file:///F|/ ...rainage%20&%2()Walm%ZOConscrvation%ZODistricl/Public%ZORecords%ZORequcst/2() 14.06.16%201046-Client%20Lcdger.txt[6/16/2014 9:49:59 AM]




Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

Received From/Paid To Chqtt General

Entry # Explanation
Balance

Disbs

Nov 14/2 awyer: JHL 0.80 Hrs X 140.00
78277 Preparation of Memorandum in
Support of Motion in Limine to
exclude Harris testimony.
Nov 14/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
78278 Prepared exhibits for
Opposition to Motion to Quash
for filing.
Nov 14/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78287 Letter to the court regarding
Opposition to Motion to Quash.
Nov 14/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78293 Correspondence from Bill Eckert

Nov 14/2 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
78294 Reviewed and revised

rom Eckert.
Nov 14/2 .awyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
78312 Final review of response memo
for Motion to Quash
Nov 14/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
78317 Telephone call to Jim Ellis,
attorney for Demco
Nov 14/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
78319 Receipt and review of email
from co-counsel on exhibit list
Nov 14/2012 Expense Recovery
78904 Postage - to Clerk of Court
filing ARBD's Opposition to
Plaintiff's Motion to Quash
plus return envelope
Nov 14/2012 Expense Recovery
78905 Postage - Copy of ARBD's
Opposition to Plaintiff's
Motion to Quash to Judge Fields
Nov 15/2012 Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00
78331 update counsel list to include
Bill Eckert and remove David
Bordelon
Nov 15/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

X1599

X1599
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78367 Correspondence from co-counsel
Nov 15/2!”! |Jawycr: ||!| !!”! !rs X 140.00

Jun/11/2014

Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

General

Disbs

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

14.00 7547

Page: 363

Bld |~=---ms=--- Trust Activity

Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

Date Received From/Paid To Chg#  |-----
----------- |
Entry # Explanation Rec#  Repts
Balance
78371 Email from Grodner's office

regarding the deposition of
Thompson.
Nov 15/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
78374 Receipt and review of Sheriff
Gautreaux's Response to
Written Discovery Directed to
Individual Claims for
Determination of Jury/Bench
Trial.
Nov 15/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
78403  Email regarding deposition of
D. Thompson; email on Ms,
Campbell
Nov 16/2012  Lawyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00
78385 call to Thompson regarding

Nov 16/2 awyer: PL-1 0.10 Hrs X 60.00
78407 emails back and forth with
Grodner's office regarding
dpeosition of Thompson
Nov 16/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78414 Phone call to Chuck Mcmains.
Nov 16/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
78444 Email from plaintiff's attorney
regarding upcoming hearing date
Nov 16/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
78445 Email from Mark Drennan
Nov 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

78501  Correspondence from Eckert
78506 Phone call to Whittington and
Grodner regarding upcoming
hearing.
Nov 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78507 Correspondence with Cathy St.
Pierre regarding upcoming
hearing.
Nov 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78508 Correspondence with Rachel
Flarity regarding upcoming

14.00 7547

28.00 7547

30.00 7547

6.00 7547

6.00 7547

14.00 7547

30.00 7547

15.00 7547

14.00 7547

14.00 7547

14.00 7547

14.00 7547
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hearing.
Nov 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78514 Correspondence with Grodner
regarding upcoming hearing.
Nov 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78519 Correspondence from Plaintiffs
regarding mailing labels.
Jun/11/2014
Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

Received From/Paid To Chg#  |----- General

Entry # Explanation
Balance

Rec# Repts Disbs

14.00 7547

14.00 7547

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

Fees Invi#t Acc

Repts

Page: 364

Trust Activity

Disbs

Nov 19/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
78604 Email from Grodner on hearing;
email to Chris Whittington
Nov 19/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.45 Hrs X 150.00
78611 Receipt and review of email
from Donna; draft letter to
court
Nov 19/2012 Capital One
79063 Delivery - Federal Express 7446
Nov 20/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78532 Email to all counsel regarding
the November 21, 2012 hearing.
Nov 20/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78535 Phone call from Rachel Flarity
regarding witness and exhibit
lists.
Nov 20/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78545 Phone call to Judge Fields'
office regarding hearing on
special master.
Nov 20/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78546 Phone call from Cathy St.
Pierre regarding special
master hearing.
Nov 20/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78548 Email from Cathy St. Pierre
regarding hearing re Special
Master.
Nov 20/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 2.50 Hrs X 60.00
78670 Flag

repeated review.
Nov 20/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 2.50 Hrs X 60.00

78671 Review documents

Nov 21/201

86.52

15.00 7547

67.50 7547

7547

14.00 7547

14.00 7547

14.00 7547
14.00 7547
7547

14.00

150.00 7547

150.00 7547




78569 PMT - For Services Rendered 05022 4017.99
Nov 21/2012 ARBD
78570 PMT - For Services Rendered 05022  924.53

Nov 21/2012  ARBD

78571 PMT - For Services Rendered 05022 4957.49
Nov 21/2012 ARBD

78572 PMT - For Services Rendered 05022  108.00
Nov 21/2012 ARBD

78573 PMT - For Services Rendered 05022 2264.99
Nov 21/2012  Lawyer: JHL 1.50 Hrs X 140.00

78645 Preparation of Memorandum in 210.00 7547
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 365

Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Date [ Received From/Paid To Chg#  |----- General ----- | Bld [----------- Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation Rec# Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

Balance

Support of Motion in Limine.
Nov 21/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
78653 Email on hearing date 30.00 7547
Nov 21/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
78658 Receipt and review of order 15.00 7547
from Judge regarding October
hearing
Nov 21/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
78659 Receipt and review of initial 15.00 7547
exhibit list
Nov 21/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs X 60.00
78668 Review documents 180.00 7547

Nov 21/ 60.00
75.00 7547
repeated review.
Nov 26/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs X 60.00
78665 Review documents 120.00 7547
Nov 26/2 60.00
150.00 7547

repeated review.
Nov 26/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.90 Hrs X 140.00

78689 Preparation of memorandum in 126.00 7547
support of Motion in Limine.
Nov 26/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78690 Email from Rachel Flarity 14.00 7547

regarding ARBC.
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Nov 26/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78691 Review of preliminary witness 14.00 7547
and exhibit lists.
Nov 27/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
78700 Email to Bill Eckert 28.00 7547

Nov 27/2 awyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00
78707 Review of all discovery to 140.00 7547
determine if additional
document production is
necessary.
Nov 27/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

78712 Email from Bill Eckert 14.00 7547
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 366

Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
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Entry # Explanation Rec#  Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
Balance

Nov 27/2'”! “awycr: ||!! !!II ||rs X 150.00

78745 Review of [ fites with 375.00 7547
law clerk
Nov 27/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
78748 Review motion in limine on Jay 75.00 7547
Harris; suggest changes to

associate
Nov 27/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00

78750 Email regarding deposition of 15.00 7547
D. Thompson
Nov 27/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
78759 Review of witness and exhibit 37.50 7547
list
Nov 27/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
78760 Telephone call to Jerry Jones 37.50 7547
as possible witness
Nov 27/2012 Lawyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00
78764  Further review of documentsl 225.00 7547

Nov 27/2 awyer: PL-2 3.00 Hrs X 60.00
78828 Revieh 180.00 7547
correspondence to determine
Nov 28/2 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78782 Correspondence with Bill Eckert 14.00
Nov 28/2!!1! !awyer: ||!! !).10 Hrs X 140.00
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78785 Receipt and review of letter to 14.00 7547

EBR Sheriff and payment under
protest by Anna Mae Jones and
APPP from Plaintiff.

Nov 28/2012 Lawyer: JHL. 0.20 Hrs X 140.00

78788 Phone call from Rachel Flarity 28.00 7547
regarding witness and exhibit
lists.
Nov 28/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78789 Email to Rachel Flarity 14.00 7547

regarding counsel.
Nov 28/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00

78790 Conference call with Bill 98.00 7547
Eckert
Jun/11/20 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 367
Client Ledger
_ Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
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........... | .
Entry # Explanation Rec#  Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

Balance

Nov 28/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78794  Correspondence from Eckert 14.00 7547
Nov 28/2]”! |!awycr: I!EL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78796 Receipt and review of EBR 14.00 7547
Sheriff's Answer to Fourth and
Fifth Amended Petition for
Damages.
Nov 28/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78800 Phone call from Cody Martin 14.00 7547
regarding witness and exhibit
lists.
Nov 28/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78801 Email to Cody Martin and Rachel 14.00 7547
Flarity regarding draft witness
and exhibit lists.
Nov 28/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
78813 Telephone call from Mary
Erlingson regarding payment
under protest

Nov 28/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
78816 Conference call with co-counsel

37.50 7547

75.00 7547

Nov 28/2 awyer: LSB 1.50 Hrs X 150.00

78817 Complete review of
documents

225.00 7547

i :49:59 AM
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Nov 28/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.35 Hrs X 150.00
78820 Telephone call to Jerry Jones
Nov 29/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78837 Phone call from Rachel Flarity
regarding 5th amended petition.
Nov 29/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78840 Email to Rachel Flarity
regarding pleadings.
Nov 29/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
78845 Receipt and review of
Livingston Assessor's
discovery response, mailing
labels, and preliminary
witness and exhibit lists.
Nov 29/2012 Lawyer: LSB_0.75 Hrs X 150.00
78857 Telephone call as

ossible expert
Nov 29/2ii|! Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00

78858 Review of witness list and
mailing list answer to
discovery for Livingston
Assessor

Jun/11/2014

Client Ledger

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

52.50 7547

14.00 7547
14.00 7547
14.00 7547

112.50 7547

37.50 7547

Page: 368

Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

Chg#

Reccived From/Paid To
Entry # Explanation
Balance

Rec#  Rcpts

Nov 30/2012 Expense Recovery
78979 Photocopy Expense - 1180 BW @
0.10 each
Nov 302012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79020 Receipt and review
rom
Eckert.
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00
79021 Revised Preliminary Witness and
Exhibit Lists.
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79023 Receipt and review of DOTD's
preliminary exhibit and
witness lists.
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79024 Receipt and review of EBR
Sheriff's preliminary exhibit
and witness lists.
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

79025 Email to Waine and Bill Eckert
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Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00 ’
79026 Phone call from Nicole Gould 14.00 7547
regarding sequester of tax
money and expert.
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00
79028 Final revisions to preliminary 42.00 7547
witness and exhibit lists.
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.00 Hrs X 140.00
79029 Receipt and review of 0.00 7547
asncension sheriff and
assessor's witness and exhibit
lists.
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
79032 Email to all counsel regarding 28.00 7547
ARBC's Preliminary Witness and
Exhibit Lists.
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
79034 Receipt and review of AAIC's 28.00 7547
Answers to Second, Third,
Fourth and Fifth Amended
Petitions.
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00
79040 Email from co-counsel; revise 150.00 7547
witness and exhibit list;
email to all counsel
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00

79041 Final revision to document; 75.00 7547
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 369
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Balance

share with co-counsel
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
79042 Review of exhibit and witness 37.50 7547
list from the state
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
79044 Telephone call to Nicole Gould 75.00 7547
regarding possible challenge
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
79046 Receipt and review of answer to 30.00 7547
2nd, 3rd, 4th and 5th
supplemental petition
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
79047 Receipt and review of Ascension 30.00 7547
Assessor and Sheriff Witness
and Exhibit list
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
79050 Receipt and review of
Livingston Sheriff's return

30.00 7547
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Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
Receipt and review of
plaintiff's Witness List and
Exhibits; email to associate
Nov 30/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 150.00
7905

79051

2 Review of legal rcsearch.
Nov 30/2!!1! Lawyer: !'HL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
79057 Phone call to Nicole Gould
regarding escrow of taxes.

Dec 1/2012 Lawyer: LSB_0.20 Hrs X 150.00
79186 Email to Jenna

Dec 1/20 awyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00

79187 Review of legal research on
assign
task to associate

Dec 3/2012 Billing on Invoice 7547
79067 FEES  8081.00
DISBS  220.96
Dec 3/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
79173 Correspondence with Wayne

Dec 3/20 Lawyer: 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79183 Review of Livingston Sheriff's
preliminary witness and
exhibit lists.
Dec 3/2012 TLawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
79184 Review of Plaintiff's
Preliminary Witness and
Jun/11/2014

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

75.00 7547

45.00 7547

28.00 7547

30.00 7630

75.00 7630

0.00 7547

28.00 7630

14.00 7630

28.00 7630
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Rect#

Exhibit lists.
Dece 3/2012 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00
79195 Review draft motion in limine;
revise; forward to Wayne
Dec 3/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
79206 Email on Martin deposition
Dec 4/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79222 Email to all counsel regarding
cancellation of Hugh Martin
deposition.
Dec 4/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79223  Correspondence from Grodner
regarding Hugh Martin
deposition.
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Dec 4/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00
79242  Legal research

Dec 4/201 L 0.40 Hrs X 140.00

awyer:
79243 Revised Motion in Limine.

Dec 4/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
79244  Prepared letter to Grodner
regarding deposition of Hugh
Martin.

Dec 5/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79284 Email from Grodner regarding
LSPO commission charge.

Dec 5/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79305 Email to Grodner requesting opt

out form.
Dec 5/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
79350 Review and revise
letter
Dec 5/2012 Lawyer: .40 Hrs X 150.00
79351 Receipt and review of opt-out
form; email to Toni; email
from Toni; request
determination of board members
Dec 6/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79310 Review of newspaper notice
regarding class.
Dec 6/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79316 Receipt and review of opt out
form from Plaintiff.
Dec 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
79382 Receipt and review of American
Alternative Inn's witness and
Jun/11/2014

Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Chg# | General

Received From/Paid To

Disbs

Rec#  Repts

Entry # Explanation
Balance

exhibit list
Dec 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
79383 Receipt and review of Terry
Campbell revised deposition
Dec 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
79385 Email from Labare on credits
Dec 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00

79390 Review of opt out forms: email
e - RN
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Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

9%620Rccords%20Request/2014.06. 16%201046-Client

70.00 7630

56.00 7630

28.00 7630

14.00 7630

14.00 7630

37.50 7630

60.00 7630

14.00 7630

14.00 7630

37.50 7630
Page: 371

Trust Activity

Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

15.00 7630

30.00 7630

37.50 7630

%20Ledger.txt[6/16/2014 9:49:59 AM]



Dec 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
79392 Telephone call from Livingston
News regarding lawsuit
Dec 6/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
79393  Telephone call to Dietmar

79417 Receipt and review

Dec 7/20
79423 Review of status
Dec 10/2012 Amite River Basin Drainage & Water C
79479 PMT - For Services Rendered 05052
Dec 10/2012  Amite River Basin Drainage & Water C
79480 PMT - For Services Rendered 05052
Dec 10/2012  Amite River Basin Drainage & Water C
79481 PMT - For Services Rendered 05052
Dec 10/2012  Amite River Basin Drainage & Water C
79482 PMT - For Services Rendered 05052
Dec 10/2012  Amite River Basin Drainage & Water C
79483 PMT - For Services Rendered 05052
Dec 10/2012  Amite River Basin Drainage & Water C
79484 RET - For Services Rendered 05052
Dec 10/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79509 Correspondence with Maldonado
Dec | I/2(!|! |!awyer: ||!B !!!! Hrs ! 150.00
79593 Review of news article on
litigation
Dec 12/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs X 60.00
79596 Verify and organize plaintiffs'
witness and exhibit list.
Dec 12/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00

79606 Discussed
with law cler:

2996.00
220.96
3765.00
30.00
1290.00

0.03

Dec 13/2 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

Jun/11/2014
Client Ledger

Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

Received From/Paid To Chgtt General

Entry # Explanation
Balance

Disbs

Rec#  Rcepts

79642 Correspondence from Grodner
regarding the deposition of

Thompson.
Dec 14/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

79659 Lcial research rciarding

30.00

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

75.00 7630

75.00 7630

14.00 7630

7630

7630

14.00 7630

37.50 7630

120.00 7630

28.00 7630
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Dec 14/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79667 Correspondence with Cathy St.
Pierre regarding deposition of
Thompson.
Dec 14/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00
79668 Receipt and review of EBR
Sheriff's and
LPSO'sRconventional Demand and
Cross Claim to Bring Concursus
Proceeding and Motion for
Leave to File Reconventional
Demand and Cross Claim.
Dec 14/2012 Lawyer: PL-2 1.50 Hrs X 60.00
79671 Organize exhibits listed in the
plaintiffs witness and exhibit
list.
Dec 14/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79673 Email to Donna regarding
Thompson deposition.
Dec 14/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00
79683 Legal research regardin

Dec 14/2
79691

awyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
Receipt and review of letter
regarding deposition of
Thompson; email to Thompson
and Toni
Dec 14/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
79696 Telephone call from Cody Martin
regarding concurus
Dec 14/2012 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00
79698 Review of pleadings on concurus
Dec 17/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
79749 Email to Donna regarding item
number 20 on preliminary
exhibit list.
Dec 17/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00
7975

2 Legal research regardin
Dec 17/2“! Lawyer: !IHL i!“! !rs ! 140.00

79753 Receipt and review of letter
from USACE to Plaintiff
Jun/11/2014

Nov/ 1/2010
Received From/Paid To

Entry # Explanation
Balance

Rec#

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.
Client Ledger

Chg#

Repts

14.00 7630

42.00 7630

90.00 7630

14.00 7630

56.00 7630

30.00 7630

37.50 7630

150.00 7630

14.00 7630

42.00 7630

14.00 7630

Page: 373
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--------------------- Trust Activity
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regarding contracts requested.
Dec 19/2012 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
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79819 Receipt and review of Ascension
Sheriff and Assessor's Answers
to Fourth and Fifth Amended
Petition for Damages.
Dec 20/2012  Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00

79843 Research

.10 Hrs X 140.00
79903 Receipt and review of re-notice
of deposition for Thompson.
Dec 25/2012 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
79985 Receipt and review of notice of
deposition; forward to client
Dec 26/2012 DataKeepers, LLC
79944 Delivery of ARBD files to office
Dec 26/2012  Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
79962 Receipt and review of email to
Donna on USACE Ietter
Dec 26/2012  Lawyer: LSB 0.40 Hrs X 150.00
79964 Review of documents produced by
USACE; assign task to associate
Dec 28/2012 Expense Recovery
80082 Photocopies - 44 BW @ $0.10 each
Dec 28/2012  Expense Recovery
80083 Photocopies - 188 BW @ $0.10
each
Jan 2/2013 Billing on Invoice 7630
80135 FEES 1910.50 0.00
DISBS 35.60
RCPTS 0.03

Jan 2/2013
80137 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 7630

Jan 2/2013
80138 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 7630

Jan 2/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
80242 Correspondence with Eckert

7523

X1609

X1609

7630 -0.03

7630 0.03

Jan 2/20 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
80290 Review of news article

Jan 4/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 2.25 Hrs X 60.00
80430 Research

Jun/11/20
Client Ledger

Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Chg#  |-==-- General

Received From/Paid To

Rec# Repts

Entry # Explanation
Balance

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

Disbs

14.00 7630
42.00 7630
14.00 7630
30.00 7630
12.40 7630
15.00 7630
60.00 7630
4.40 7630
18.80 7630
7630
7630
7630
14.00 7701
37.50 7701
135.00 7701
Page: 374
----- | Bld |----------- Trust Activity
Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
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Jan 4/2()|_! Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
80451 Correspondence with Eckert
Jan 8/20|! “awycr: J!! !!!O !rs ! |40.00
80623 Telephone conference with
Eckert

.20 Hrs X 140.00

Jan 8/20 Lawyer:
80643 Legal rescarch

Jan 8/20 Lawyer: 5 rs X 140.00
80647 Receipt and review of EBR
Sheriff's correspondence to
Judge Fields regarding payment
of tax proceeds and receipt and
review of motion and order to
dep_osit tax proceeds into the
registry.
Jan 8/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00
80661 Telephone conference with
co-counsel

Jan 8/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
80662 Telephone call to Jerry Jones,
possible expert
Jan 8/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
80669 Review court connect on
pleadings
Jan 82013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
80670 Review of plaintiff's
opposition of motion to quash
and protective order
Jan 9/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
80672 Correspondence with Cathy St.
Pierc regarding the deposition
of Janell Campbell.
Jan 9/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
80684 Correspondence from Cathy St.
Pierre regarding affidavit
provided by John Tyler
regarding Marcus Plaissance.
Jan 9/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
80693 Correspondence from Gould
regarding commission payments
and concurcus proceeding.
Jan 9/2013 Lawyer: LSB 1.25 Hrs X 150.00
80704 Meeting with associate to

Jun/11/2014

Client Ledger

Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
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14.00 7701
98.00 7701
28.00 7701
28.00 7701
112.50 7701
37.50 7701
75.00 7701
37.50 7701
28.00 7701
14.00 7701
14.00 7701
187.50 7701
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Date Received From/Paid To Chq#t  |----- General ----- | Bld |----=====--- Trust Activity
----------- |

Entry # Explanation Rec#  Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
Balance

Jan 92013 Tawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00

80711 Email from USACE 15.00 7701
Jan 10/20 Lawyer: PL-1 0. rs X 60.00
80729 review of court documents to 6.00 7701

confirm service of Notice of
Deposition of Janell Campbell
jJan 10/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
80739 Review of Plaintiff's Reply to 14.00 7701
ARBC's Opposition to Quash and
for Protective Order.
Jan 10/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00
80753 Review of information from 112.50 7701
James Purpera; email to Purpera
Jan 10/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
80755 Review of law clerk's research 75.00 7701

Jan 10/20 awyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00
80758 Review of East Baton Rouge 112.50 7701
Parish Sheriff's office and
Livingston Sheriff's concursus
filing
jan 10/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
80761 Receipt and review of notice of 15.00 7701
hearing on concursus
Jan 10/2013  Expense Recovery
81564 Postage - check to James Purpera X1617 0.45
Jan 11/2013 ARBD
80792 PMT - For Services Rendered 05118  658.00
Jan 11/2013 ARBD
80793 PMT - For Services Rendered 05118 35.57
Jan 11/2013 ARBD
80794 PMT - For Services Rendered 05118 1042.50

Jan 11/2013 ARBD
80795 PMT - For Services Rendered 05118 210.00

Jan 11/2013  ARBD
80796 RET - For Services Rendered 05118 0.03
Jan 112013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
80835 Phone call from Cathy St. 28.00 7701
Pierre regarding Order to

deposit funds.
Jan 11/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00

80836 Discussed leial issues with LSB

7701

7701

28.00 7701
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Jun/11/20 I! Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 376

Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

Date Received From/Paid To Chqg#t  |----- General ----- | Bld |------=-==- Trust Activity
Entry # Explanation
Balance

Rec# Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

Jan 11/2013 Lawyer: JHL 1.20 Hrs X 140.00
80837 Preparation of Memorandum in 168.00 7701
support of motion for summary
judgment.
Jan 11/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00
80847 Revised Motion in Liminel 70.00 7701

Jan 11/20 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

80849 Review of leagl memorandum 14.00 7701

Jan 11/20 awycr: .50 Hrs X 140.00

80852 m 70.00 7701
Jan 11/20 awyer: ; rs X 150.00

80926 Telephone call with Judge and 60.00 7701
opposing counsel on concursus

proceeding
Jan 11/2013 Lawyer: LSB 2.50 Hrs X 150.00

80930 Work on and legal research on 375.00 7701
Jan 14/201! !'ames !urpera

80880 Expert Fees 7556 1215.00 7701
Jan 14/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

80884 Email to Wayne and Bill 14.00 7701
Jan ]4/20“! !!awyer: ||”! !H!! !rs X 140.00

80888 Correspondence with Bill and 14.00 7701

Hrs X 140.00

80899 Began preparing Answer to
Concursus.

Jan 14/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
80904 Review of correspondence from
Livingston Parish Sheriff to

ARBC regarding tax payments.
Jan 14/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
80974 Review motion in limine
Jan 14/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
80983 Review of affidavit from
Ascension Sheriff
Jan 14/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
80988 Telephone call from William

28.00 7701

14.00 7701

75.00 7701

37.50 7701

15.00 7701
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Jan 14/2013 Lawyer: ; rs X 150.00

80990 Review of draft answer to 37.50 7701
concursus
Jan 14/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 377
Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Chg#  |-==-- General ----- | Bld |-==--m-=nm- Trust Activity
----------- |
Entry # Explanation Rectt Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

Balance

80996 Email from associate regarding 37.50 7701

telephone call
rom Tont Guitrau
Jan 14/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 150.00
81002 Receipt and review of notice 45.00 7701
from Livingston Parish
Sheriff: email to Livingston
Sheriff attorney
Jan 15/2013 Expense Recovery
80933 Photocopy Expense from Court X1612 36.05 7701
Connect website for
12/18/12-1/15/13
Jan 15/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
80959 Correspondence from Gould 14.00 7701
regarding commission payments
and escrow of funds.
Jan 15/2013 Lawyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00

80967 Legal research regarding 140.00 7701

Jan 15/20 awyer: JHL 2.20 Hrs X 140.00
80968 Prepared Excetion of Improper
Cumulation of Actions,
Exception of Improper Venue,
and Memorandum in Support.
Jan 15/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
80971 Revised Memorandum in Support
of Exceptions.
Jan 15/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
80972 Discussed legal issues with LSB

308.00 7701

28.00 7701

14.00 7701

Hrs X 150.00

81027 Review of exceptions to
concursus; suggest changes
Jan 16/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

112.50 7701
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81030 Review of correspodnece

Jan 16/20 awyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
81032 Final review and edit of
Exceptions.
Jan 16/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81036 Review of Plaintiff's exhibit
list to determine

Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L
Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Chg#  |===-- General
----------- |
Entry # Explanation Rec#  Rcpts Disbs

Balance

Jan 16/201!! Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00

81051 Revised Motion in Limine and
Memornadum in Support to
include additional exhibits
listed by Plaintiffs.
Jan 16/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81053 Review of memorandum regarding

Jan 16/20 sawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

81055 Letter to Court regarding

Exceptions.
Jan 16/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
81057 Final review of exception;

assign task

Jan 16/20
81061

Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
Review of motion in limine;

email from co-counsel on

issue; assign task to associate

Jan 16/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
81072 Review of motion in limine

Jan 16/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 3.25 Hrs X 60.00
81135 Research

Jan 16/20 awyer: PL-2 2.25 Hrs X 60.00
81136 Draft objective research
memorandum

ile:///F|l...rainage
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84.00 7701

14.00 7701

14.00 7701

37.50 7701

37.50 7701

75.00 7701

195.00 7701

135.00 7701
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Jan 17/20 awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81099 Correspondence from Grodner's
office regarding depositions

of Thompson and Martin.
Jan 17/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
81104 Correspondence with Donna
regarding the deposition of

Page: 379

Trust Activity

Disbs

Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L
Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Chg#t  |-=--- General
----------- |
Entry # Explanation Rec# Repts Disbs
Balance
Thompson and Martin.
Jan 17/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.20 Hrs X 150.00
81117 Email from Donna Grodner
regarding Thompson deposition
Jan 17/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
81121 Email about D. Thompson
Jan 17/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
81131 Telephone call to Mark Wingate
Jan 17/2013  Expense Recovery
81589 Postage - to COC filing ARBD's X1619
Dilatory Exception (plus
return envelope)
Jan 17/2013  Expense Recovery
81590 Postage - copy of ARBD's X1619

Dilatory Exception to Judge
Fields
Jan 18/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.50 Hrs X 140.00
81151 Legal research regardin

Jan 18/2 awyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00
81152 Revised Motion in Limine.

Jan 18/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.30 Hrs X 150.00
81165 Telephone call to Richard

Leibowitz

Jan 18/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00
81167 Final review of motion in limine

Jan 21/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81183 Research

14.00 7701
28.00 7701
AL
----- | Bld |-----------
Fees Inv# Acc Repts
30.00 7701
15.00 7701
37.50 7701
1.75 7701
0.65 7701
70.00 7701
42.00 7701
45.00 7701
75.00 7701
14.00 7701
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Jan 21/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00
81184 Prepared Motion to Prohibit
Deposing Former Counsel of

ARBD.
Jan 21/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00

81185 Discussed legal issues
w1t! L!!

Jan 21/2013  Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00
81192 Review

84.00 7701
28.00 7701

112.50 7701

Jan 21/20 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
81196 Final review of motion in
limine; assign task to
associate
Jan 22/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81231 Letter to Court regarding 14.00
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.
Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Chg#  |-=--- General ----- | Bld |----------- Trust Activity

37.50 7701

7701
Page: 380

Entry # Explanation Rec#  Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

Balance

Motion in Limine.
Jan 22/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00
81235 Review 42.00 7701

Jan 22/20 Lawyer: LSB_0.25 Hrs X 150.00

81256 Telephone oallq
ﬁregardmg possible

expert
Jan 22/2013 Expense Recovery
81607 Postage - to COC fiing ARBD's X1619 3.20 7701
Motion in Limine (plus return
envelope)
Jan 22/2013 Expense Recovery
81608 Postage - copy of Motion in X1619 1.30 7701
Limine to Judge Fields
Jan 23/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00
81274 Correspondence with Bill Eckert 56.00 7701

37.50 7701

Jan 23/20 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
81292 Receipt and review of email and 37.50 7701
draft letters to Grodner
Jan 24/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81315 Correspondence with Bill Eckert 14.00 7701

Jan 25/20 yer: 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
81366 Review of Plaintiffs' discovery 28.00 7701

file:///F| l/...rainage%zO&%ZOWaler%2OConscrvation%ZODistricL/Public%ZOR¢cords%20chucst/2014.06. 16%201046-Client%20Ledger.txt[6/16/2014 9:49:59 AM]



requests concerning resolutions
by ARBC.
Jan 28/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00

81426 Prepared Order for Exceptions 42.00 7701
of Improper Cumulation and
Venue.
Jan 28/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
81427 Prepared letter to Court 28.00 7701

regarding Order for Exceptions.
Jan 28/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81436 Phone call from Rachel Flarity 14.00 7701
regarding depositions.
Jan 29/2013 Lawyer: PL-2 4.00 Hrs X 60.00

81477 _Review 240.00 7701

Jun/11/2 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 381
Client Ledger
Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014
Date Received From/Paid To Chg#  |----- General ----- | Bld |----=------ Trust Activity
----------- |
Entry # Explanation Rectt Repts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs

Balance
Jan 29/201! I!awyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00

81501 Correspondence with counselors 14.00 7701

for co-defendants regarding
deposition of Janell Campbell.
Jan 29/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00

81506 Put together documents |||} 42.00 7701
81622 Postage - to COC filing Order X1619 1.36 7701
(plus return envelope)
Jan 29/2013  Expensec Recovery
81623 Postage - copy of order to X1619 0.46
Judge Fields
Jan 29/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
81636 Email to Jerry Jones; assign
task to associate
Jan 29/2013 Lawyer: LSB_0.40 Hrs X 150.00
81638 Review send 60.00
to Jerry Jones
Jan 30/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.30 Hrs X 140.00
81644 Email to Jerry Jones regarding 42.00 7701
litigation.
Jan 30/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.70 Hrs X 140.00

7701

37.50 7701

7701

%20Ledger.txt[6/16/2014 9:49:59 AM]
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81648 Preparation for the deposition 98.00 7701
of Janell Campbell.
Jan 30/2013 Lawyer: LSB 1.00 Hrs X 150.00
81673 Preparation for Campbell 150.00 7701
deposition
Jan 30/2013  Lawyer: PL-2 2.00 Hrs X 60.00

81762 Review 120.00 7701
Jan 31/20 Expense Recovery
81739  Photocopies - 486 BW @ $0.10 X1622 48.60 7701
each
Jan 31/2013  Expense Recovery
81780 Court Connect expenses for X1623 36.40 7701
January to print documents
Jan 31/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81781 Research 14.00 7701
Jan 31/20 awyer: ; rs X 140.00
81782 Review 84.00 7701
Jun/11/20 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 382
Client Ledger
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Balance
Jan 31/20 awyer: 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
81785 Correspondence with Cathy St. 28.00 7701
Pierre regarding Motion to
Quash.
Jan 31/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81786 Correspondence from Grodner 14.00 7701
regarding motion to quash.
Jan 31/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.75 Hrs X 150.00
81802 Attend deposition of Ms. 112.50 7701
Campbell
Jan 31/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
81810 Receipt and review of letter 15.00 7701

concerning cost of state
attorney; forward to associate
Feb 1/2013 Billing on Invoice 7701
81852 FEES  5622.00 0.00 7701
DISBS 1345.22
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RCPTS 0.03
Feb 1/2013
81854 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 7701 7701 -0.03 7701
Feb 1/2013
81855 RET - Rtnr alloc on Inv: 7701 7701 0.03 7701
Feb 1/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81933 Correspondence from Blanchfield 14.00 7785
regarding deposition of Janell
Campbell.
Feb 1/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00
81943 Legal research regarding 84.00 7785

Feb 1/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.40 Hrs X 140.00

81944 Legal research 56.00 7785

Feb 1/20 awyer: JHL 1.00 Hrs X 140.00
81945 Prepared Motion to Compel 140.00 7785
Deposition and Motion for
Sanctions and Reimbursement of
Expenses and Order.
Feb 1/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81957 Receipt and review of 14.00 7785
correspondence and affidavit
from Gould regarding fees
associated with deposition of
Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 383
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Balance

Janell Campbell.
Feb 1/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.50 Hrs X 150.00

81966 Receipt and review [ 75.00 7785
; assign task to
associate
Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81986 Correspondence from Rachel 14.00 7785

Falrity regarding AAIC costs
for J. Campbell deposition.
Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81987 Correspondence with Cathy St. 14.00 7785
Pierre regarding time/costs
associated with Janell
Campbell deposition.
Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
81997 Email to defense counsel 14.00 7785
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regarding phone call from John
Tyler re Janell Campbell
deposition.

Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 IHrs X 140.00

81998 Correspondence with defensc 28.00 7785

counsel regarding joint motion
for sanctions.

Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.60 Hrs X 140.00

81999 [Legal research 84.00 7785

Feb 4/20 awyer: JHL 1.30 Hrs X 140.00
82000 Prepared Memorandum in Support 182.00 7785
of Motion to Compel
Depositions & Motion for
Sanctions and Reimbursement of
Expenses.
Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
82001 Revised Motion to Compel 28.00 7785
Depositions & Motion for
Sanctions and Reimbursement of
Expenses.
Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
82004 Correspondence with Monita 14.00 7785
Sterling regarding exhibits.
Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
82017 Receipt and review of letter 15.00 7785
from insurer's regarding costs
Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00

Jun/11/2014 Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. Page: 384
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82020 Telephone call from Fred 37.50 7785
Chevalier; assign task to
associate
Feb 4/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
82025 Telephone call from Tyler; 37.50 7785
emails from Kellogg,
Blanchfield and Gould
Feb 5/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
14.00 7785

82044 Phone call to John Tyler
regarding Janell Campbell
deposition.
Feb 5/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.25 Hrs X 150.00
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Review of Livingston Parish
Sheriff bill
Feb 5/2013 Lawyer: LSB 0.10 Hrs X 150.00
82093 Email of affidavit from
Ascension Parish
Feb 6/2013 Lawyer: JHL
82118 Review

82091

2.20 Hrs X 140.00

Feb 6/20 0.20 Hrs X 140.00

82123 Organized
Feb 6/20 awyer: ; rs X 140.00
82124 Email to Dietmar

Feb 6/20 0.10 Hrs X 150.00

awyer:
82206 Receipt and review of motion to
add counsel
Feb 7/2013 ARBD

82141 PMT - For Services Rendered
Feb 7/2013 ARBD

82142 PMT - For Services Rendered
Feb 7/2013 ARBD

82143 PMT - For Services Rendered
Feb 7/2013 ARBD

82144 PMT - For Services Rendered

Feb 7/2013 ARBD
82145 PMT - For Services Rendered

Feb 7/2013 ARBD
82146 RET - For Services Rendered
Jun/11/2014

05146
05146
05146
05146
05146

05146

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.
Client Ledger

37.50 7785

Nov/ 1/2010 To May/ 1/2014

Date Received From/Paid To Cha# |
----------- |
Entry # Explanation Rec# Repts
Balance
Feb 7/2013 Court Reporters of LA
82205 Deposition Costs - Invoice 7590

#14855WK
Feb 7/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.10 Hrs X 140.00
82236 Returned Chris Whittington's
phone call.
Feb 7/2013 Lawyer: JHL 0.20 Hrs X 140.00
82251 Phone call from Chris

15.00 7785
308.00 7785
28.00 7785
14.00 7785
15.00 7785
2226.00
1345.19
2565.00
6.00
825.00
0.03 7785
Page: 385
--- General ----- | Bld |----=====-- Trust Activity
Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Repts Disbs
135.00 7785
14.00 7785
28.00 7785
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