

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
10/31/2019	OCTOBER-2019	HEARING OFFICER DUTIES-MONTH OF OCT-2019 GL-10013101-510030	\$365.45

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00087338	11/21/2019	\$365.45

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government

Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number: 3616
 Check Date: 11/21/2019
 Check Number: 00087338

\$365.45

Pay Three Hundred Sixty Five Dollars and 45 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 5
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

X

DO NOT WRITE / SIGN / STAMP BELOW THIS LINE
DEPOSITORY BANK ENDORSEMENT



... ..
... ..
... ..
... ..

Durio Law Office, LLC
Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

✓ 3616
10013101
510030

P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties October 2019


DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
10-23-19	Received and reviewed email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 1126 Kirk Street.	.2
10-24-19	Prepared Rule to Show Cause for 1126 Kirk Street and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.75
10-24-19	Prepared Rule to Show Cause for 4499 Catahoula Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.75
10-25-19	Sent email regarding curator and new property	.2

Hours 1.9 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$726.25
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$14.80
Expenses (paper copies) \$18.15

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 5
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$365.45

**PLEASE NOTE NEW ADDRESS
ABOVE!**

Approved: 
Date: 11-19-19

J

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount		
10/07/2019	AUG-2019	HEARING OFFICER DUTIES -AUG-2019 GL-10013101-510030	\$786.27		
Vendor No.		Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616		DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00086828	10/18/2019	\$786.27

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government

Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	10/18/2019	00086828

\$786.27

Pay Seven Hundred Eighty Six Dollars and 27 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

Durio Law Office, LLC

Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

V 3616
10013101
510030

P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties August 2019

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
9-19-19	Received and reviewed email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 3519 Grand Point Highway.	.2
9-23-19	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located 7698 Main Highway and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail.	1.25
9-23-19	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located on 1140 Nina Highway and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail to all Four (4) property owners, attorney, curator, and PG.	2.50
9-23-19	Email with Holli Guilbeau to follow up on properties and to move forward with liens.	.2

Hours 4.15 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$726.25
Expenses (U.S. Postage) =\$43.85
Expenses (paper copies) \$16.17

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$786.27

Approved *Lee C. Durio*
Date 10-14-19



Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
09/06/2019	08-30-2019	HEARING OFFICER DUTIES- AUGUST-2019 GL-10013101-510030	\$1,389.35

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00086094	09/10/2019	\$1,389.35

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government

Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	09/10/2019	00086094

\$1,389.35

Pay One Thousand Three Hundred Eighty Nine Dollars and 35 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

Durio Law Office, LLC

Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

RECEIVED

INVOICE


To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties August 2019

ST. MARTIN PARISH GOVERNMENT
ACCOUNTING DEPARTMENT

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
8-1-19	Email with Holli Guilbeau regarding the hearing on August 2 nd and which properties to prepare for.	.2
8-2-19	Attended hearing on (3) properties at parish Government building and meet with Clerk of Court for liens on properties.	2
8-14-19	Prepared cover letter to David Blansett and Gertie Breux with a copy of the judicial mortgage filed into the records notifying him of the same. Mailed via certified mail and regular mail.	.75
8-16-19	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located on Adel Street and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail to all three (3) property owners, attorney, curator, and PG.	2.25
8-16-19	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located on Papit Guidry Road and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail.	1.25
8-30-19	Attended hearing on (3) properties at Parish Government	1

Hours 7.45 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$1,303.75 Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$65.80 Durio Law Office, LLC
Expenses (paper copies) \$19.80 P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$1,389.35

Approved: 

Date: 9-9-19

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
07/01/2019	JULY-2019	HEARING OFFICER DUTIES-JULY-2019 GL-10013101-510030	\$802.95

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00085780	08/14/2019	\$802.95

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government

Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	08/14/2019	00085780

\$802.95

Pay Eight Hundred Two Dollars and 95 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

Durio Law Office, LLC

Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

V3616
10013101
510030

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties July 2019

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
07/02/19	Email Holli Guilbeau regarding the judgment for 3519 Grand Point Highway and resending it to her and the property owner. Resent the judgment via certified mail to the property owner	.25
7-16-19	Met with Holli Guilbeau to discuss upcoming hearings for August 2, 2019 and filing of liens with Clerk of Court.	.2
7-17-19	Email from Holli Guilbeaux regarding the status of the property located at 1010 Sam Champagne Road and the filing of the lien, review inspection report, and discuss moving forward.	.2
7-19-19	Phone call with Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer Road and new issues	.2
7-19-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Luke Bui for property located at 1140 Nina Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
7-19-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Leslie Barnum for property located at 1140 Nina Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
7-19-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Nhe Nguyen for property located at 1140 Nina Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
7-19-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Patricia Charlot for property located at 1140 Nina Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
7-19-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Slyvio Borel for property located at 4499 Catahoula Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
7-19-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Tammy Wiltz for property located at 1140 Nina Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
7-19-19	Prepared Notice of service for personal service through the sheriff	.50

Hours 4.35 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$761.25
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$29.20

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC

Expenses (paper copies) \$12.50

P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$802.95

Approved: *Chick*
Date: 8-12-19

✓

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount		
06/30/2019	06-30-2019	HEARING OFFICER DUTIES JUNE-2019 GL-10013101-510030	\$611.25		
Vendor No.		Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616		DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00085235	07/15/2019	\$611.25

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government
 Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number: 3616
 Check Date: 07/15/2019
 Check Number: 00085235

\$611.25

Pay Six Hundred Eleven Dollars and 25 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

V3616
10013101
510030

Durio Law Office, LLC

Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties June 2019

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
06/12/19	Received and Reviewed email from Holli Guilbeau regarding liens on the property at 1010 Sam Champagne Raod	.25
06/13/19	Received and Reviewed file from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 7698 Main Highway to begin hearing officer proceedings.	.30
06/13/19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Tammy Wiltz for property located at 7698 Main Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.75
06/19/19	Received & reviewed email from Holli Guilbeau regarding putting a hold on the process for the property located at 1126 Kirk Street. Phone call RE: the same.	.25
06/19/19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for the property located at 1023 Adele Street and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.75
06/19/19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for the property located at 1219 Papit Guidry Road and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.75
06/19/19	Email with Holli Guilbeaux and Rebecca Borel (appointed attorney) to prepare for 1023 Adele and 1219 Papit Guidry.	.25


Hours 3.3 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$577.50
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$22.20
Expenses (paper copies) \$11.55

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

RECEIVED

TOTAL DUE: \$611.25

APPROVED



7-15-19

ST. MARTIN PARISH GOVERNMENT
ACCOUNTING DEPARTMENT



Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
06/05/2019	C5-31-2019	MONTH OF MAY SERVICES 2019- HEARING OFFICER GL-10013101-510030	\$306.25

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00084680	06/18/2019	\$306.25

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin
PARISH
GOVERNMENT

St. Martin Parish Government

Master Account
P.O. Box 9
301 W. Port Street
St. Martinville, LA 70582
(337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	06/18/2019	00084680

\$306.25

Pay Three Hundred Six Dollars and 25 cents *****

To The
Order Of

DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
P.O. BOX 1280
BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
NON-NEGOTIABLE**

Durio Law Office, LLC
Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

V 3616
10013101
510030

P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties May 2019

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
05/19/19	Phone call with Holli G. regarding moving forward with lien on property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer.	.2
05/20/19	Checked service on all property owners and reviewed file for hearing for Nina Highway property.	.25
05/20/19	Received and Reviewed file from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 4499 Catahoula Highway to begin hearing officer proceedings.	.30
05/26/19	Attended hearing at Parish Government Office regarding Nina Highway Property.	1

Hours 1.75 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$306.20
Expenses (U.S. Postage) =\$0.00
Expenses (paper copies) \$0.00

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$306.25

APPROVED

ST. MARTIN PARISH GOVERNMENT
ACCOUNT # 1111111111

APPROVED
Lee C. Durio
6-13-19

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
04/30/2019	APRIL-2019	HEARING OFFICER EXPENSES APRIL-2019 GL-10013101-510030	\$905.15

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00084002	05/06/2019	\$905.15

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government

Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	05/06/2019	00084002

\$905.15

Pay Nine Hundred Five Dollars and 15 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

Durio Law Office, LLC

Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

MAY 14 2019

ST. MARTIN PARISH GOVERNMENT

P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

✓ 3616
10013101 - 510030
April 1-2019

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties April 2019

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
04-2-19	Received and Reviewed email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 1126 Kirk Street.	.2
4-4-19	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located at 1021 Jack Dwyer Road and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail to the property owner.	1.25
4-4-19	Received and Reviewed file from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 1140 Nina Highway to begin hearing officer proceedings.	.30
4-9-19	Received and Responded to email from Holli Guilbeau regarding properties needed curators.	.2
4-10-19	Search of SMP Tax accessor to check current status of ownership of property located at 1140 Nina Highway to send out Rule to Show Causes.	.2
4-10-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Luke Bui for property located at 1140 Nina Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
4-10-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Leslie Barnum for property located at 1140 Nina Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
4-10-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Nhe Nguyen for property located at 1140 Nina Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
4-10-19	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Patricia Charlot for property located at 1140 Nina Highway and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
4-11-19	Phone conference with Holli Guilbeau regarding curators for abandoned properties and process.	.2
04-18-19	Received and reviewed email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the status of the cleanup at 3519 Grand Point Highway and to hold off on the fines and liens another 90 days.	.2
4-29-19	Received and reviewed email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the status of clean up at 1010 Sam Champagne Road and enforcement of outstanding fines.	.2

Hours 4.75 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$831.25
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$59.20
Expenses (paper copies) = \$14.70

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$905.15

APPROVED
CHP
5-5-15

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
04/08/2019	MARCH-2019	HEARING OFFICER DUTIES-MARCH 2019 GL-10013101-510030	\$718.35

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00083524	04/08/2019	\$718.35

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government
 Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	04/08/2019	00083524

\$718.35

Pay Seven Hundred Eighteen Dollars and 35 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

Durio Law Office, LLC

Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

V3616
10013101
510030

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties March 2019

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
03-04-19	Received and Reviewed email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer Road, continuing violations, and next steps.	.25
3-12-19	Received and Responded to Email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 1010 Sam Champagne Road, also spoke with Holli Guilbeau over the phone regarding the same.	.25
3-13-19	Drafted and sent out demand letter to owner of 1010 Sam Champagne Road regarding status of remediation, fines, and continuing fines at the parishes request. Sent copy of the same to the Parish	.75
03-13-19	Phone call with Holli Guilbeau to discuss property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer Road and how to proceed.	.25
3-15-19	Drafted and sent out demand letter to owners of 1100 Jack Dwyer Road regarding status of remediation, fines, and continuing fines at the parishes request. Sent copy of the same to the Parish	1.0
3-27-19	Phone call with Holli Guilbeau about recent issue with property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer Road.	.2
03-28-19	Email regarding status of the property at 1010 Sam Champagne Road along with updated pictures.	.2
03-29-19	Attended hearing at St. Martin Parish Government for the property located at 1021 Jack Dwyer Road.	1.0

Hours 3.9 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$682.50
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$22.65
Expenses (paper copies) = \$13.20

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$718.35



✓

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
03/01/2019	03-01-2019	HEARING OFFICERDUTIES-FEBRUARY-2019 GL-10013101-510030	\$410.37

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00083090	03/11/2019	\$410.37

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government
 Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	03/11/2019	00083090

\$410.37

Pay Four Hundred Ten Dollars and 37 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

STATE OF TEXAS
X

DO NOT WRITE / SIGN / STAMP BELOW THIS LINE
DEPOSITORY BANK ENDORSEMENT

3

Durio Law Office, LLC

Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

MAR 11 2019

P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

V3616
10013101
510030

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties February 2019

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
02-18-19	Received and Reviewed file from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 1021 Jack Dwyer Road to begin hearing officer proceedings.	.25
02-18-19	Sent Holli Guilbeau emails with copies of Judgments for 1100 Jack Dwyer, 1022 Huval Road, and 1010 Sam Champagne Road, along with a correspondence from owner of 1022 Huval Road concerning payment of fees and progress of cleanup.	.25
02-18-19	Received and reviewed letter from Bert King regarding payment of fines and status.	.25
2-22-19	Received and responded to email from Holli Guilbeau regarding questions about property located at 1010 Sam Champagne Road and questions about judgment from homeowner.	.25
2-22-19	Prepared Rule to show cause for property located at 1021 Jack Dwyer Road and mailed the same via certified mail and regular U.S. Mail	1.25

Hours 2.25 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$393.75
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$8.62
Expenses (paper copies) = \$8.00

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$410.37

APPROVED

Lee C. Durio
3-10-19

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
02/01/2019	01-31-2019	JANUARY FEES-2019--HEARING OFFICER GL-10013101-510030	\$1,280.78

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00082595	02/11/2019	\$1,280.78

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government
 Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	02/11/2019	00082595

\$1,280.78

Pay One Thousand Two Hundred Eighty Dollars and 78 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

X

DO NOT WRITE / SIGN / STAMP BELOW THIS LINE
DEPOSITORY BANK ENDORSEMENT



Faint, illegible text at the bottom of the page, possibly a footer or additional instructions.

V3616
10013101
510030

RECEIVED

FEB 04 2018

Durio Law Office, LLC

Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

INVOICE


To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties January 2019

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
01-09-19	Received and responded to email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 3519 Grand Point Highway and the extension granted by Parish President and not to move forward with continuing fines, only initial fines. Also spoke with Heath Babineaux and Holli Guilbeaux regarding the same over the phone.	.2
1-15-19	Received and Reviewed emails from Holli Guilbeau regarding the collection and payments of fines rendered by judgment from 3519 Grand Point Highway	.2
01-16-19	Email from Holli Guilbeau regarding hearing on 1/18/19 and properties located at 1010 Sam Champagne and 1100 Jack Dryer Road.	.2
01-18-19	Attended Hearing, conducted hearings, rendered judgments	2.50
01-23-19	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located at 1010 Sam Champagne Road and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail to the property owner.	1.25
01-23-19	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer Road and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail both property owners.	1.50
01-23-19	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located at 1022 Huval Road and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail to the property owner.	1.25

Hours 7.1 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$1,242.50
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$28.68
Expenses (paper copies) = \$9.60

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$1,280.78

APPROVED

2-11-19

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
01/14/2019	EXPENSES-DEC	REIMBURSEMENT FOR EXPENSES DEC-2018 GL-10013101-510030	\$46.00

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00082145	01/25/2019	\$46.00

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government

Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	01/25/2019	00082145

\$46.00

Pay Forty Six Dollars and 00 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

X

DO NOT WRITE / SIGN / STAMP BELOW THIS LINE
DEPOSITORY BANK ENDORSEMENT

W3011
10/26/18
510020

Durio Law Office, LLC

Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

ST. MARTIN PARISH GOVERNMENT

P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties December 2018

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
12-10-18	Received and Responded to email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 1010 Sam Champagne Road current status and new pictures taken by Parish Government	.2
12-10-18	Received and Responded to email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 11100 Jack Dwyer Road regarding service information, past history of property, and recent litigation involving property.	.2
12-12-18	Reviewed file sent by Parish Government regarding property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer, checked for time requirements, and determined property it ready for a hearing.	.50
12-13-18	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located at 3519 Grand Point Highway and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail to property owner.	1.25
12-13-18	Prepared Rule to show Cause for David Blansett for property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer Road and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
12-13-18	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Gertie Breaux for property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer Road and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
12-13-18	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Randall Berard for property located at 1010 Sam Champagne Road and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
12-13-18	Prepared Rule to show Cause for King Investments, LLC for property located at 1022 Huval Road and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
12-18-18	Multiple emails with Holli Guilbeau Re: Jack Dwyer Road	.2

Hours 4.35 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$761.25
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$35.50
Expenses (paper copies) = \$10.50

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 1280
Breaux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

4600

TOTAL DUE: \$807.25

APPROVED
[Signature]
1-24-19

Invoice Date	Invoice Number	Description	Invoice Amount
01/04/2019	12-31-2018	HEARING OFFICER DUTIES DEC-2018 GL-10013101-510030	\$761.25

Vendor No.	Vendor Name	Check No.	Check Date	Check Amount
3616	DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC	00082110	01/15/2019	\$761.25

FOR SECURITY PURPOSES, THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT CONTAINS A COLORED BACKGROUND AND MICROPRINTING IN THE BORDER



St. Martin Parish Government
 Master Account
 P.O. Box 9
 301 W. Port Street
 St. Martinville, LA 70582
 (337) 394-2200

Vendor Number	Check Date	Check Number
3616	01/15/2019	00082110

\$761.25

Pay Seven Hundred Sixty One Dollars and 25 cents *****

To The Order Of
 DURIO LAW OFFICE LLC
 LEE C DURIO, ATTORNEY AT LAW
 P.O. BOX 1280
 BREAUX BRIDGE, LA 70517

**FILE COPY
 NON-NEGOTIABLE**

X

DO NOT WRITE / SIGN / STAMP BELOW THIS LINE
DEPOSITOR BANK ENDORSEMENT

V3616
10013101
510030

Durio Law Office, LLC
Lee C. Durio, Attorney at Law

RECEIVED
JAN 07 2018
ST. MARTIN PARISH GOVERNMENT

P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

Phone (337) 944-9395
Email: duriolawoffice@gmail.com

INVOICE

To: St. Martin Parish Government
RE: Hearing Officer Duties December 2018

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
12-10-18	Received and Responded to email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 1010 Sam Champagne Road current status and new pictures taken by Parish Government	.2
12-10-18	Received and Responded to email from Holli Guilbeau regarding the property located at 11100 Jack Dwyer Road regarding service information, past history of property, and recent litigation involving property.	.2
12-12-18	Reviewed file sent by Parish Government regarding property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer, checked for time requirements, and determined property it ready for a hearing.	.50
12-13-18	Prepared Judgment and cover letter for the property located at 3519 Grand Point Highway and mailed the same via certified mail and regular mail to property owner.	1.25
12-13-18	Prepared Rule to show Cause for David Blansett for property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer Road and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
12-13-18	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Gertie Breux for property located at 1100 Jack Dwyer Road and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
12-13-18	Prepared Rule to show Cause for Randall Berard for property located at 1010 Sam Champagne Road and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
12-13-18	Prepared Rule to show Cause for King Investments, LLC for property located at 1022 Huval Road and sent out for service via certified mail and regular mail.	.50
12-18-18	Multiple emails with Holli Guilbeau Re: Jack Dwyer Road	.2

Hours 4.35 @ \$175.00 an hour = \$761.25
Expenses (U.S. Postage) = \$35.50
Expenses (paper copies) = \$10.50

Checks can be made out and mailed to:
Durio Law Office, LLC
P.O. Box 1280
Breux Bridge, Louisiana 70517

TOTAL DUE: \$807.25

APPROVED
[Signature]
1-14-19

